Due: 08/04/22 Pace RFQ# 421969

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
I
Sku Winning bid | Neopart |Rome Truck| Interstate | Coffman Kirks Prevost Gillig Mohawk Vehicle | Aftermarket | Eldorado
-NOBID | Power Maintenance | Parts
NO # of Bids
5 200901 45.00 68.23 47.89 45.00 74.72 74.83
Mohawk 233568 - 4w 2w stock 5w 6w
4 40932 0.62 1.85 2.30 0.62 1.94
Mohawk 233568 - stock stock stock stock
3 200522 19.33 58.95 19.33 38.87
Mohawk 233568 - 4w stock 5w
4 10170 0.88 1.91 2.10 0.88 1.96
Mohawk 233568 stock 75d 3w stock
2 40184 0.70 0.70 1.50
Mohawk 233568 - stock stock
1 200813 2.60 2.60
Aftermarket Parts 233570 - stock
4 41216 294.39 294.39 350.73 316.54 617.20
Gillig 233567 - stock 3w stock stock
2 200850 15.34 15.34 45.70
Aftermarket Parts 233570 - stock stock




Due: 08/04/22 Pace RFQ# 421969

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid | Neopart |Rome Truck| Interstate | Coffman Kirks Prevost Gillig Mohawk Vehicle | Aftermarket | Eldorado
-NO BID Power Maintenance Parts

NO # of Bids

4 200897 29.46 62.51 34.44 54.49 29.46

unapproved unapproved

Aftermarket Parts 233570 - Ay part part stock

4 41213 172.37 172.37 191.36 175.68 197.13

unapproved

Gillig 233567 4w part 17w l6w

3 41035 0.99 6.88 0.99 4.56
Mohawk 233568 stock stock stock

5 40052 25.25 41.97 40.99 32.51 25.25 32.63
Vehicle Maintenance 233569 stock stock 1w 7d 5w

5 10199 9.82 38.24 45.85 9.82 20.76 31.47
Mohawk 233568 stock 75d stock stock stock

5 40079 8.10 17.90 18.63 11.99 8.10 18.24
Mohawk 233568 - stock 75d stock 2w stock

4 40596 0.46 1.96 2.09 0.46 1.88

no lead

Mohawk 233568 time given stock 1w 5w

2 30421 127.98 127.98 236.76
Gillig 233567 stock 8w




Due: 08/04/22 Pace RFQ# 421969

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
I
Sku Winning bid | Neopart |Rome Truck| Interstate | Coffman Kirks Prevost Gillig Mohawk Vehicle | Aftermarket | Eldorado
-NOBID | Power Maintenance | Parts

NO # of Bids

1 30023 23.26 23.26
Eldorado 233571 - stock

2 10416 472.00 472.00 639.81
Aftermarket Parts 233570 - stock stock

- 30445 -

3 200949 1,169.87 1,169.87 1,208.00 1,257.37
Coffman 233566 - stock stock 8w

5 41288 63.60 121.36 82.16 63.60 116.17 373.70

unapproved

Gillig 233567 - 6w stock part stock 14w

5 41332 425.00 476.21 429.66 425.00 458.31 455.42
Gillig 233567 - 24w 75d stock 21d stock

4 410001 946.10 946.10 1,485.52 982.62| 2,487.46
Neopart 233565 - stock 3w stock stock

4 410002 954.86 954.86 1,485.52 982.62| 2,487.46
Neopart 233565 - stock 3w 5w stock




Due: 08/04/22 Pace RFQ# 421969
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid | Neopart |Rome Truck| Interstate | Coffman Kirks Prevost Gillig Mohawk Vehicle | Aftermarket | Eldorado
-NO BID Power Maintenance Parts
NO # of Bids
410003 191.62 191.62 235.00 220.00 210.44 239.12 219.97 619.94
Neopart 233565 - Ay 75d 6w 3w 14d 6w 4w
410005 105.00 105.00 106.48 334.40
Neopart 233565 - 4w 3w 2w
410006 114.53 231.48 200.00 114.53 236.05
unapproved
Gillig 233567 - 6w 4w part stock
410007 57.48 129.66 185.46 117.05 57.48 144.62 254.93
unapproved
Gillig 233567 - stock 75d stock part stock 14w
410010 140.54 196.30 197.41 140.54 155.17 419.60
unapproved
Aftermarket Parts 233570 - stock 4w part stock 18w
2010020 16.08 40.00 51.31 16.08 63.72
unapproved
Neopart 233565 - stock 75d part 5w
2010021 28.29 115.65 184.85 185.00 28.29 216.46
unapproved
Neopart 233565 - 4w stock 4w part 5w
110014 121.55 121.55 128.85 199.85
Gillig 233567 - stock 13w 8w




Due: 08/04/22 Pace RFQ# 421969
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0
I
Sku Winning bid | Neopart |Rome Truck| Interstate | Coffman Kirks Prevost Gillig Mohawk Vehicle | Aftermarket | Eldorado
-NOBID | Power Maintenance | Parts
NO # of Bids
110019 50.24 50.24
Eldorado 233571 - stock
110022 36.88 36.88
Eldorado 233571 - stock
110027 1.19 1.19
Eldorado 233571 - stock
410080 335.36 544.81 350.00 335.36 596.59
unapproved
Gillig 233567 - 6w stock part 10w
410081 5.58) 5.59 6.25 6.30
Neopart 233565 - stock stock stock
410083 106.63 106.63 430.80 120.89
Neopart 233565 - 6w 75d 7w
410091 1,155.54 1,155.54 1,249.90 1,195.18 1,265.36
Neopart 233565 - 4w 75d 5w 6w
2010064 145.24 145.24
Eldorado 233571 - stock




Due: 08/04/22 Pace RFQ# 421969
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0
B N
Sku Winning bid | Neopart |Rome Truck| Interstate | Coffman Kirks Prevost Gillig Mohawk Vehicle | Aftermarket | Eldorado
-NOBID | Power Maintenance | Parts
NO # of Bids
410104 51.72 51.72
Eldorado 233571 - 4w
2010066 3,084.57 3,084.57 3,741.56
Coffman 233566 - 90d 11w
310057 254.16 254.16 378.09
unapproved
Aftermarket Parts 233570 - part stock
2010083 198.42 198.42
Eldorado 233571 - 6w
210041 987.33 987.33
Aftermarket Parts 233570 - 15w




	421969

