
Due:  07/29/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I/O 
Controls

Genfare - 
NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Coffman Battery 
Service

Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

P&G Suburban 
Truck

Translite Kirks Prevost Muncie Gillig Eldorado Neopart Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

                                  2 160605 10.59                      10.59           13.35 

Muncie 233546 -                 stock  stock 

                                  3 71733 78.98                   109.34           90.85           78.98 

Aftermarket Parts 233552 -                 stock  stock  9w 

                                  1 72125 20.84                      20.84 

Eldorado 233548 -                 4w 

                                  7 200901 35.01                      71.58           66.05           77.19           74.33           68.23 35.01                   74.72 

Muncie 233546  stock  30d  2w  8w  4w 
 unapproved 

part  5w 

                                  1 160795 7.90                          7.90 

Eldorado 233548 -                 stock 

                                  2 71500 34.60                      34.60           51.87 

Gillig 233547 -                 stock  stock 

                                  4 71105 0.08                          1.50             0.20 0.08                       0.11 

Mohawk 233551 -                 7d  stock stock  stock 

                                  4 170616 85.99                   104.99           85.99        125.00           92.87 

Muncie 233546 -                 75d  42d  6w  7w 

                                  4 180669 180.00                 227.69        180.00        488.82        192.99 

Gillig 233547 -                 120d  8w  90d  stock 

                                  4 200522 19.95                      19.95           64.31 20.64                   28.45 

Muncie 233546  stock  4w stock  5w 

                                  5 72143 10.50                      13.40           10.50        180.42           12.38           11.04 

Gillig 233547  70d  4w  stock  8w  13w 

                                  4 200547 481.99                 497.05        481.99        521.24        570.77 

Muncie 233546  75d  30d  4w  8w 

                                  3 250204 15.61                      15.61           21.53           17.29 

Pace RFQ# 421950 



Due:  07/29/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I/O 
Controls

Genfare - 
NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Coffman Battery 
Service

Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

P&G Suburban 
Truck

Translite Kirks Prevost Muncie Gillig Eldorado Neopart Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 421950 

Gillig 233547  stock  10d  stock 

                                  5 151457 164.63                 245.73        176.66        164.63        388.00        195.13 

Gillig 233547 -                 75d  stock  stock  stock  5w 

                                  3 170622 305.51                 345.60        423.05        305.51 

Eldorado 233548  stock  30d  6w 

                                  2 250585 24.90                      29.19           24.90 

Neopart 233549  2w  10d 

                                  3 170593 9.39                          9.39           14.82             9.85 

Muncie 233546 -                 30d  4w  stock 

                                  6 170625 219.78                 286.25        219.78        275.00        310.48 234.68              232.24 

Muncie 233546 -                 75d  30d  6w  stock 4w  7w 

                                  6 290537 175.00                 229.51        212.13        187.05        191.18 175.00              212.63 

Hydraulic Electric 233550 -                 stock  30d  stock  3w stock  stock 

                                  4 220346 46.99                      58.00           51.50           46.99           54.82 

Gillig 233547 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  5 200299 15.56                      77.17           55.56           74.55 15.56                   31.87 

Mohawk 233551 -                 stock  stock  4w stock  11w 

                                  3 160596 164.76                 174.11        164.76        174.64 

Gillig 233547 -                 71d  stock  stock 

                                  1 220341 119.24                 119.24 

Eldorado 233548 -                 stock 

                                  1 290609 44.58                      44.58 

Aftermarket Parts 233552 -                 11w 

                                  3 170013 13.80                      13.80           54.56           20.45 

Muncie 233546 -                 42d  stock  15w 



Due:  07/29/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I/O 
Controls

Genfare - 
NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Coffman Battery 
Service

Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

P&G Suburban 
Truck

Translite Kirks Prevost Muncie Gillig Eldorado Neopart Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 421950 

                                  3 200850 14.77                      44.90           43.13           14.77 

Aftermarket Parts 233552 -                 21d  stock  stock 

                                  5 200863 8.61                        10.52             9.17           10.52           17.65             8.61 

Aftermarket Parts 233552 -                 2w  7d  3w  30d  3w 

                                  2 210976 22.31                      79.17 22.31         

Mohawk 233551 -                 stock stock

                                  4 290420 658.41                 733.30        705.00        658.41        727.62 

Neopart 233549 -                 21d  8w  3w  11w 

                                  4 71179 0.50                          3.42             0.50 0.53                       0.60 

Muncie 233546 -                 10d  stock stock  stock 

                                  5 71442 6.50                          6.50             7.08           17.95 6.90                     10.64 

Muncie 233546 -                 stock  stock  stock stock  stock 

                                   - 71001 -                

-                

                                  2 220016 23.84                      23.84           28.54 

Gillig 233547 -                 stock  19w 

                                  4 72156 22.38                      22.38           25.00           23.75           23.74 

Muncie 233546 -                 45d  12w  8w  stock 

                                  4 200913 13.31                      19.58           13.77           23.98           13.31 

Aftermarket Parts 233552 -                 stock  stock  6w  stock 

                                  4 72181 425.87                 677.20        615.54        425.87        829.86 

Gillig 233547 -                 12w  8w 
 no lead 

time  14w 

                                  1 151985 30.17                      30.17 

Aftermarket Parts 233552 -                 stock 

                                  3 72184 6.15                          6.20           16.44             6.15 



Due:  07/29/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I/O 
Controls

Genfare - 
NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Coffman Battery 
Service

Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

P&G Suburban 
Truck

Translite Kirks Prevost Muncie Gillig Eldorado Neopart Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 421950 

Aftermarket Parts 233552 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                  2 200932 40.20                   188.44           40.20 

Aftermarket Parts 233552 -                 stock  stock 

                                  2 72206 5.33                          5.33           22.10 

Muncie 233546 -                 21d  stock 

                                  1 152006 24.29                      24.29 

Eldorado 233548 -                 4w 

                                  2 170680 43.10                      63.10           43.10 

Aftermarket Parts 233552 -                 stock  stock 

                                  3 200935 20.18                      20.18           23.66           23.31 

Coffman 233542 -                 stock  21d  stock 

                                  1 290675 91.35                      91.35 

Eldorado 233548 -                 stock 

                                  1 152026 6.02                          6.02 

Eldorado 233548 -                 stock 

                                  3 200949 874.00              1,044.87        874.00     1,257.37 

Kirks 233545 -                 stock  stock  8w 

                                  1 72252 32.02                      32.02 

Eldorado 233548 -                 stock 

                                  4 152033 135.15                 176.34        135.15        298.16        146.10 

Muncie 233546 -                 75d  stock  stock  5w 

                                  2 180833 113.00                 113.00        134.96 

Gillig 233547 -                 12w  13w 

                                  7 290690 545.00                 726.31        623.11        545.00     1,267.26        549.24 610.00              621.84 

Gillig 233547 -                 75d  stock  stock  stock  3w stock  stock 



Due:  07/29/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I/O 
Controls

Genfare - 
NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Coffman Battery 
Service

Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

P&G Suburban 
Truck

Translite Kirks Prevost Muncie Gillig Eldorado Neopart Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 421950 

                                  4 72301 235.00                 315.97        235.00        485.00        401.70 

Battery Service 233543 -                 3d 
 unapproved 

part  stock  13w 

                                   - 670017 -                

-                

                                  2 170706 395.08                 395.08        745.39 

Translite 233544 -                 stock  stock 

                                  2 170707 395.08                 395.08        745.39 

Translite 233544 -                 stock  stock 

                                  3 290695 65.11                      65.11        110.18           86.22 

Muncie 233546 -                 stock  stock  25w 

                                  3 170716 1,116.49           1,116.49     1,129.32     1,725.00 

Muncie 233546 -                 30d  6w  stock 

                                  4 170718 66.09                      66.52           76.55        104.41           66.09 

Aftermarket Parts 233552 -                 stock  6w  stock  5w 

                                  2 170722 88.41                   150.68           88.41 

Eldorado 233548 -                 stock  stock 

                                  4 1710014 22.75                      22.75           27.68           56.17           22.81 

Muncie 233546 -                 21d  stock  stock  5w 

                                  4 1710015 35.85                      35.85           40.55           61.17           35.95 

Muncie 233546 -                 30d  6w  stock  5w 

                                  4 1710016 27.79                      27.79           32.75           56.17           27.87 

Muncie 233546 -                 30d  6w  stock  stock 

                                  1 710008 210.59                 210.59 

Eldorado 233548 -                 6w 

                                  3 2510006 121.95                 135.15        125.00        121.95 



Due:  07/29/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I/O 
Controls

Genfare - 
NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Coffman Battery 
Service

Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

P&G Suburban 
Truck

Translite Kirks Prevost Muncie Gillig Eldorado Neopart Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 421950 

Aftermarket Parts 233552 -                 35d  6w  stock 

                                  3 1610016 295.78                 307.05        295.78        303.08 

Eldorado 233548 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                  3 1510008 14.50                      25.31 14.50                   14.65 

Hydraulic Electric 233550 -                 stock 14d  10w 

                                  3 2510007 727.70                 727.70        758.53        853.91 

Gillig 233547 -                 2w  10d  stock 

                                  5 2010018 55.55                      55.55           60.00           60.59 106.80                 59.94 

Muncie 233546 -                 stock  6w  4w 4w  stock 

                                  6 2010020 16.32                      51.31           55.30           60.00           32.40 16.32                   63.72 

Neopart 233549 -                 stock  30d  8w  stock 
 unapproved 

part  5w 

                                  6 2010021 28.72                   184.85        187.90        168.00        190.94 28.72                216.46 

Gillig 233547 -                 stock  30d  stock  4w 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  1 710053 108.45                 108.45 

Aftermarket Parts 233552 -                 stock 

                                  4 2110021 485.73                 513.10        485.73 524.00              562.77 

Gillig 233547 -                 stock  stock 4w  stock 

                                  3 710057 53.99                      53.99 65.28                   63.36 

Coffman 233542 -                 90d 5w  13w 

                                  1 2110032 765.90                 765.90 

Aftermarket Parts 233552 -                 10w 

                                  2 2110039 740.00          740.00              788.07 

Mohawk 233551 -                4w  6w 

                                  1 710088 58.44                      58.44 

Eldorado 233548 -                 stock 



Due:  07/29/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I/O 
Controls

Genfare - 
NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Coffman Battery 
Service

Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

P&G Suburban 
Truck

Translite Kirks Prevost Muncie Gillig Eldorado Neopart Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 421950 

                                  4 2210018 7.30                          8.86             7.30 13.11                     7.73 

Muncie 233546 -                 75d  64d 4w  stock 

                                  2 2910015 18.05                      26.54           18.05 

Aftermarket Parts 233552 -                 stock  stock 

                                  3 2210021 1,149.00           1,149.00     1,250.50     1,201.52 

Kirks 233545 -                 stock  70d  stock 

                                  1 1710052 47.18                      47.18 

Eldorado 233548 -                 stock 

                                  1 1710054 46.36                      46.36 

Eldorado 233548 -                 stock 

                                  2 2210022 87.32                      89.40           87.32 

Aftermarket Parts 233552 -                 stock  stock 

                                  1 1810030 625.00                 625.00 

Gillig 233547 -                 12w 

                                  1 710130 93.07                      93.07 

Eldorado 233548 -                 stock 

                                  3 2010041 1,650.00           2,816.70     1,650.00     3,201.50 

Kirks 233545 -                 90d  120d  stock 

                                  4 1810036 103.00                 144.00        110.00 103.00              151.43 

Hydraulic Electric 233550 -                 stock  stock stock  13w 

                                  4 710151 386.98                 545.00        485.00        386.98        415.37 

Muncie 233546 -                 120d  120d  stock  27w 

                                  1 710157 43.45                      43.45 

Eldorado 233548 -                 4w 

                                  2 1810038 54.80                      67.26           54.80 



Due:  07/29/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I/O 
Controls

Genfare - 
NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Coffman Battery 
Service

Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

P&G Suburban 
Truck

Translite Kirks Prevost Muncie Gillig Eldorado Neopart Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 421950 

Gillig 233547 -                 135d  8w 

                                  3 2510070 4.69                          4.98             4.69             5.11 

Neopart 233549 -                 2w  10d  5w 

                                  4 2210030 197.45                 247.82        197.45        397.67        206.05 

Muncie 233546 -                 stock  60d  stock  10w 

                                  3 2510074 220.08                    220.08        265.06        299.22 

Gillig 233547 -                 2w  10d  6w 

                                  2 1510175 18.80                      24.69           18.80 

Aftermarket Parts 233552 -                 stock  16w 

                                  2 1610110 175.11                 237.32        175.11 

Aftermarket Parts 233552 -                 12w  11w 

                                  1 1510178 12.10                      12.10 

Eldorado 233548 -                 2w 

                                  4 710218 458.25                 598.55        525.00     1,054.65        458.25 

Aftermarket Parts 233552 -                 35d  4w  12w  stock 

                                  1 1510202 28.32                      28.32 

Aftermarket Parts 233552 -                 stock 

                                  1 710248 151.04                 151.04 

Eldorado 233548 -                 8w 

                                  1 710278 1,565.86           1,565.86 

Eldorado 233548 -                 8w 

                                  1 710294 4.42                          4.42 

Eldorado 233548 -                 stock 

                                  1 710295 4.42                          4.42 

Eldorado 233548 -                 stock 



Due:  07/29/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I/O 
Controls

Genfare - 
NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Coffman Battery 
Service

Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

P&G Suburban 
Truck

Translite Kirks Prevost Muncie Gillig Eldorado Neopart Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 421950 

                                  1 710296 4.42                          4.42 

Eldorado 233548 -                 stock 

                                  2 2210048 7.19                          7.19             7.52 

Muncie 233546 -                 21d  11w 

                                  2 1610160 105.24                 132.37        105.24 

Aftermarket Parts 233552 -                 8w  22w 

                                  2 2510164 5.28                          5.28             5.44 

Gillig 233547 -                 2w  10d 

                                  1 710323 17.34                      17.34 

Aftermarket Parts 233552 -                 stock 

                                  1 1510279 92.35                      92.35 

Muncie 233546 -                 21d 

                                  3 2010081 23.05                      23.05           26.31           25.57 

Muncie 233546 -                 30d  4w  stock 

                                  2 2110190 71.65                      71.65           88.36 

Muncie 233546 -                 60d  14w 

                                  1 1810090 890.00                 890.00 

Gillig 233547 -                 12w 

                                  1 1810091 970.00                 970.00 

Gillig 233547 -                 12w 

                                  1 2110228 332.27                 332.27 

Aftermarket Parts 233552 -                 22w 

                                   - 2110230 -                

-                

                                   - 2110231 -                



Due:  07/29/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I/O 
Controls

Genfare - 
NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Coffman Battery 
Service

Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

P&G Suburban 
Truck

Translite Kirks Prevost Muncie Gillig Eldorado Neopart Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 421950 

-                

                                  1 2110250 537.25                 537.25 

Muncie 233546 -                 42d 


	421950

