Due: 07/29/22 Pace RFQ# 421947

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- | . . | . | | | | | | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid | Interstate | Triangle Coffman Vehicle CBM Suburban Kirks Prevost | A&A Auto | Eldorado Gillig Hydraulic | Crossline Muncie | Aftermarket | Neopart Mohawk
NO # of Bids Power Radiator Maintenance Truck Electric Supply Parts
5 130581 49.64 60.17 49.64 54.38 63.95 50.66
Coffman 233542 - stock stock stock stock stock
8 81262 575 7.41 6.77 7.41 8.50 6.69 575 11.90 9.25
Muncie 233546 - 10d stock stock stock stock stock 3w stock
6 130611 166.00 310.48 265.27 166.00 270.96 313.55 205.03
unapproved
Crossline 233556 - stock stock stock stock stock part
1 81055 161.46 161.46
Eldorado 233548 stock
10 120488 16.50 21.14 19.63 19.68 16.50 21.14 27.25 21.19 19.50 26.98 21.49
CBM 233555 - 10d 90d stock stock stock stock 3w 21d stock stock
8 60739 13.05 43.15 25.89 37.55 28.73 47.93 48.48 53.04 13.05
Mohawk 233551 - stock stock stock 2w stock stock 5w 1w
3 110100 2225 2.25 2.32 3.60
Gillig 233547 - stock stock stock
5 60374 17.27 35.65 19.50 40.42 17.27 32.56
No lead
Muncie 233546 - stock stock time 60d 4w
7 81313 42.00 97.63 59.23 42.20 93.00 55.52 90.71 42.00
unapproved
CBM 233555 - stock stock stock 1w stock stock part
4 81352 63.84 124.16 127.77 153.31 63.84
Mohawk 233551 stock stock 7w stock
1 81355 98.13 98.13
Eldorado 233548 8w
- 110143 =




Due: 07/29/22 Pace RFQ# 421947

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- | . . | . | | | | | | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid | Interstate | Triangle Coffman Vehicle CBM Suburban Kirks Prevost | A&A Auto | Eldorado Gillig Hydraulic | Crossline Muncie | Aftermarket | Neopart Mohawk

NO # of Bids Power Radiator Maintenance Truck Electric Supply Parts

4 81378 19.47 42.25 51.82 51.35 19.47
Mohawk 233551 stock stock 6w stock

6 100226 1,120.00 2,228.25 1,209.00 1,454.00 2,729.43 1,120.00| 1,395.00

no lead

Neopart 233549 - 90d stock 21d 9w 10d time

5 100227 892.00 1,406.73 948.00 1,628.14 892.00| 1,150.00

no lead

Neopart 233549 90d stock 12w 10d time

1 120526 450.00 450.00
Triangle 233557 3d

3 60790 561.48 1,137.99 561.48 673.65
Muncie 233546 - 8w stock 8w

1 60792 212.29 212.29
Eldorado 233548 - 6w

6 81444 59.40 109.23 75.56 77.10 83.81 74.80 59.40
Mohawk 233551 - stock 2w 60d stock 6w stock

3 81472 5.05 5.26 5.05 5.90
Muncie 233546 - stock 30d 5w

4 81489 31.69 31.69 37.11 41.84 47.13
Coffman 233542 - stock 30d 5w stock

2 110150 23.58 23.58 28.60
Coffman 233542 - stock 21d

9 81521 f1v7290) 2231 21.39 18.15 27.75 21.69 17.99 27.99 18.90 21.29
Muncie 233546 - 20d stock stock 30d 2w 30d stock stock stock

1 81536 408.93 408.93
Eldorado 233548 - 8w




Due: 07/29/22 Pace RFQ# 421947

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- | . . | . | | | | | | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid | Interstate | Triangle Coffman Vehicle CBM Suburban Kirks Prevost | A&A Auto | Eldorado Gillig Hydraulic | Crossline Muncie | Aftermarket | Neopart Mohawk

NO # of Bids Power Radiator Maintenance Truck Electric Supply Parts

7 1210003 20.22 24.67 20.22 39.18 29.20 30.88 23.69 26.99
Vehicle Maintenance 233554 - stock stock stock stock w stock stock

1 810013 2,761.49 2,761.49
Coffman 233542 - 90d

3 1210009 39.79 39.79 47.15 47.77
Coffman 233542 - stock 30d 9w

6 610014 1S90 16.24 11.39 13.50 20.00 14.80 19.24
Vehicle Maintenance 233554 - stock stock stock stock stock stock

3 810023 54.15 54.15 64.12 65.21
Coffman 233542 - stock 30d 5w

5 610018 f1v/810) 49.68 53.42 54.75 54.79 f1v/819)

unapproved

Coffman 233542 - stock stock 30d Sw part

1 610017 93.81 93.81
Eldorado 233548 - 8w

8 610019 83.00 157.76 93.38 83.00 125.00 92.30 102.47 104.86 99.18
Kirks 233545 - stock stock stock stock 30d 7w 3w stock

3 1210016 1,075.84 1,493.62 1,075.84 1,993.77
Gillig 233547 - 12w 10w 18w

4 810026 1,010.19 1,010.19 1,100.00 1,133.99 1,207.57
Coffman 233542 - stock stock stock 9w

5 810027 581.51 581.51 650.00 670.55 712.10 589.80

bid 3, need

Coffman 233542 - 90d stock 4 w stock

6 1010014 2299 10.21 9.56 2.99 3.40 12.19 8.13

unapproved

Kirks 233545 - stock stock stock stock stock part




Due: 07/29/22 Pace RFQ# 421947

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid | Interstate | Triangle Coffman Vehicle CBM Suburban Kirks Prevost | A&A Auto | Eldorado Gillig Hydraulic | Crossline Muncie | Aftermarket | Neopart | Mohawk
NO # of Bids Power Radiator Maintenance Truck Electric Supply Parts
4 810031 1.95 8.69 10.55 10.50 1.95
unapproved
Coffman 233542 - stock 30d 4w part
9 610026 90.00 344.48 136.66 129.95 132.00 90.00 160.00 416.91 162.88 167.45
unapproved
Hydraulic Electric 233550 - stock stock stock stock stock stock 4w 4w part
9 610026 90.00 344.48 136.66 129.95 132.00 90.00 160.00 416.91 162.88 167.45
unapproved
Hydraulic Electric 233550 - stock stock stock stock stock stock 4w 4w part
6| 1010015 989.00 1,586.86 989.00 1,425.99| 1,915.79| 1,145.00| 1,324.25
Kirks 233545 - stock stock 45d stock 10d stock
3| 1010016 2,634.43 2,634.43 3,115.95| 3,186.18
Coffman 233542 - stock 21d ow
8 610028 15.10 46.64 15.10 30.00 80.15 57.34 90.58 59.95 26.94
unapproved unapproved unapproved
Coffman 233542 - stock part part stock stock stock stock part
4 610033 650.00 791.36 650.00 1,450.75| 1,177.21
Kirks 233545 - stock stock 30d ow
2 810064 4,427.93 4,804.40 4,427.93
Aftermarket Parts 233552 - 90d 9w
8| 1210033 26.94 33.73 29.50 37.37 28.79 46.83 49.68 36.48 26.94
No lead
Mohawk 233551 - time 90d stock stock stock 30d 8w stock
5 610058 44.53 115.49 98.30 127.05 310.77 44.53
unapproved
Gillig 233547 - stock stock 30d stock part
3 810078 433.30 433.30 507.95 550.22
Coffman 233542 - stock 21d ow
4 810079 320.00 433.30 320.00 550.22 448.25
Hydraulic Electric 233550 - stock stock 9w stock




Due: 07/29/22 Pace RFQ# 421947

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid | Interstate | Triangle Coffman Vehicle CBM Suburban Kirks Prevost | A&A Auto | Eldorado Gillig Hydraulic | Crossline Muncie | Aftermarket | Neopart Mohawk
NO # of Bids Power Radiator Maintenance Truck Electric Supply Parts
2 610061 5.35 11.36 5.35
Aftermarket Parts 233552 - 3w stock
6 1010028 5.69 13.24 5.69 15.72 15.70 16.18 6.36
unapproved
Kirks 233545 - stock stock stock 30d stock part
6 1010029 16.50 41.89 17.19 20.00 49.88 50.83 16.50
unapproved
Kirks 233545 - stock stock stock 30d Sw part
1 810090 54.61 54.61
Aftermarket Parts 233552 - 8w
7 810093 19.49 35.80 19.49 23.59 21.00 29.95 38.90 41.65
Kirks 233545 - stock stock 3w stock stock 21d 7w
5 810110 1,539.00 1,778.27 1,539.00 1,600.00 1,894.79 1,666.35
Kirks 233545 - stock stock stock 21d stock
3 810125 41.37 115.14 126.22 41.37
unapproved
Coffman 233542 - stock stock part
1 1110002 93.81 93.81
Eldorado 233548 - 8w
4 1010044 236.49 236.49 280.81 260.00 277.70
Coffman 233542 - 90d 4w stock stock
1 610082 9.90 9.90
Eldorado 233548 - 6w
4 610097 235.66 346.16 246.00 235.66 310.77
Muncie 233546 - 75d stock stock stock
5 810208 0.16 1.60 1.25 1.88 2.13 0.16
unapproved
Hydraulic Electric 233550 - stock stock 21d 9w part




Due: 07/29/22 Pace RFQ# 421947

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- | . . | . | | | | | | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid | Interstate | Triangle Coffman Vehicle CBM Suburban Kirks Prevost | A&A Auto | Eldorado Gillig Hydraulic | Crossline Muncie | Aftermarket | Neopart Mohawk

NO # of Bids Power Radiator Maintenance Truck Electric Supply Parts

2 810211 2,920.78 2,920.78 3,834.08
Coffman 233542 - 90d w

4 810216 2807/ 4.66 3.97 5.45 5.70
Vehicle Maintenance 233554 - stock stock 21d 9w

7 810225 550.00 809.25 620.00 593.00 885.40 929.68 550.00 884.35
Neopart 233549 - stock stock stock 30d 7w stock 4w

5 1010054 3.05 10.20 3.05 11.99 12.54 4.62

unapproved

Kirks 233545 - stock stock stock stock part

4 810236 8.50 9.78 8.50 12.35 13.44
Hydraulic Electric 233550 - stock stock 30d 9w

3 1310021 5.41 6.34 5.41 5.99
Coffman 233542 - stock stock 21d

4 1010068 785.00 1,263.48 785.00 837.56 1,254.50
Kirks 233545 - 90d 2w stock stock

4 810365 30.61 53.86 64.95 66.50 30.61

unapproved

Coffman 233542 - stock 30d stock part

- 1010101 =

- 810401 =
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