Due: 07/29/22 Pace
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
N A I
Sku Winning bid Kirks Aftermarket | Vehicle CBM Suburban Prevost Gillig Eldorado | Mohawk | Neopart Muncie
NO # of Bids Parts | Maintenance Truck
40932 0.62 1.94 2.30 0.62 1.85 2.39
Mohawk 233551 - stock stock stock stock 30d
40504 1.05 1.70 2.10 1.05 1.51 1.59
Mohawk 233551 - stock stock stock stock 30d
40036 46.62 60.13 132.80 46.62 104.41 48.83 138.12 99.95
unapproved
Gillig 233547 - stock stock stock stock part 4w stock
41213 172.37 175.68 172.37 197.13 195.30 220.22
unapproved
Gillig 233547 17w 6w 18w part 120d
41227 15.10 42.63 50.66 22.62 29.59 59.30 25.99 15.10 47.04 56.55
Mohawk 233551 - stock stock stock stock 75d stock stock stock 30d
10405 125.70 145.85 151.05 253.82 125.70 175.57
Mohawk 233551 - stock 4w stock stock stock
40907 55.50 90.80 261.86 105.66 87.80 55.50 87.05 65.39
Mohawk 233551 - stock stock 75d 4w stock stock stock
40842 5.66 7.80 8.36 9.29 5.66 7.59 7.73
Mohawk 233551 - stock stock 75d stock stock stock
10365 73.65 73.65 143.89 90.53 83.60 112.21 73.78




Due: 07/29/22 Pace

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
N A I
Sku Winning bid Kirks Aftermarket | Vehicle CBM Suburban Prevost Gillig Eldorado | Mohawk | Neopart Muncie

NO # of Bids Parts Maintenance Truck
Aftermarket Parts 233552 - 6w 75d stock stock stock stock

6 40162 0.34 1.30 1.31 1.55 0.34 1.40 1.35
Mohawk 233551 stock stock stock stock MoQ MoQ

6 10366 66.40 72.95 143.89 90.53 83.51 148.56 66.40
Muncie 233546 - 6w 75d stock stock stock 30d

7 40090 0.59 0.62 0.98 1.11 0.75 0.99 0.59 0.83
Muncie 233546 stock stock stock stock stock stock 30d

4 20535 46.10 67.25 55.56 46.10 78.78
Mohawk 233551 stock 6w stock 95d

8 40134 27.25 116.13 57.43 27.25 122.09 135.65 63.98 77.91 79.52
CBM 233555 - stock stock stock stock 155d 2w 10w 60d

6 40596 0.46 1.88 2.09 2.29 0.46 2.08 0.73
Mohawk 233551 - 5w stock stock 6w stock stock

1 30411 47.01 47.01
Eldorado 233548 - 8w

6 20707 104.92 112.34 120.86 141.60 249.94 104.92 127.17
Neopart 233549 - 6w stock 75d 3w stock 30d




Due: 07/29/22 Pace
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
N A I
Sku Winning bid Kirks Aftermarket | Vehicle CBM Suburban Prevost Gillig Eldorado | Mohawk | Neopart Muncie
NO # of Bids Parts Maintenance Truck
10411 120.57 126.16 126.02 223.35 120.57
Muncie 233546 - stock 6w stock 60d
30421 127.98 127.98 236.76 130.62
Gillig 233547 - stock 8w 60d
41272 39.98 42.07 41.07 100.21 46.07 39.98 45.16
Neopart 233549 - 5w stock 8w 4w stock 30d
41273 38.30 40.91 40.87 100.21 45.84 38.30 42.76
Neopart 233549 - 8w stock 8w 4w stock 30d
30445 663.59 663.59
Eldorado 233548 - 14w
41293 94.60 106.07 150.00 94.60 118.88 102.33
Mohawk 233551 - 6w 8w 4w 4w 30d
110003 302.72 302.72
Eldorado 233548 - 12w
410006 116.27 236.05 306.34 200.00 116.27 287.84 221.98
unapproved
Gillig 233547 - stock stock stock part stock stock
410010 125.68 155.17 362.16 197.41 419.60 125.68 196.30 146.46




Due: 07/29/22 Pace

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
I
Sku Winning bid Kirks Aftermarket | Vehicle CBM Suburban Prevost Gillig Eldorado | Mohawk | Neopart Muncie
NO # of Bids Parts Maintenance Truck
unapproved

Muncie 233546 - stock stock stock 10w part stock stock

6 410017 1,150.29 1,310.02 1,258.85| 1,450.00| 2,679.14 1,150.29 | 1,193.44
Neopart 233549 - 6w 75d 6w stock 6w 21d

1 210002 419.35 419.35
Eldorado 233548 - stock

4 110014 116.40 128.85 121.55 199.85 116.40
Muncie 233546 - stock 4w 6w 21d

- 410048 -

1 410070 183.36 183.36
Eldorado 233548 - stock

1 110026 98.75 98.75
Eldorado 233548 - stock

1 110027 1.19 1.19
Eldorado 233548 - 8w

6 410080 325.24 596.59 440.19 375.00 325.24 366.87| 1,042.22

unapproved

Neopart 233549 - 10w 75d aw part 8w 45d




Due: 07/29/22 Pace
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
I
Sku Winning bid Kirks Aftermarket | Vehicle CBM Suburban Prevost Gillig Eldorado | Mohawk | Neopart Muncie
NO # of Bids Parts Maintenance Truck
110049 3.97 3.97
Eldorado 233548 - 1w
410102 76.88 90.18 76.88
Muncie 233546 - stock 65d
210028 30.17 30.17
Aftermarket Parts 233552 - stock
410112 117.84 117.84 143.03 170.81 121.23 138.45
unapproved unapproved
Aftermarket Parts 233552 - 11w part 12w part s
410128 693.66 920.02 725.00| 2,036.76 693.66 702.10
Neopart 233549 - 5w 8w stock 6w 21d
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