
Due:  07/15/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Prevost - 
NO BID

Filter 
Services

Gillig Kirks - NO 
BID

Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie Illinois Auto Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

                                    5 210940 60.00                      60.00           73.20           62.52           69.60           81.31 

Hydraulic Electric 233516 -                  stock  21d  stock  4w  stock 

                                    1 220228 18.31                      18.31 
                                                                                                                  
Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  stock 

                                    1 210976 22.31                      22.31 

Mohawk 233519 -                  stock 

                                    5 211006 72.67                      85.99           85.19           72.67           78.70           94.51 

Illinois Auto 233518  stock  21d  stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 220016 23.84                      23.84           35.97           28.54 

Gillig 233515 -                  stock  120d  19w 

                                    5 211126 32.18                      37.30           37.72           32.18           39.46           41.86 

Illinois Auto 233518 -                  stock  21d  stock  4w  stock 

                                    4 2210000 48.03                      48.03           52.52           92.31           57.79 

Gillig 233515 -                  stock  stock  60d stock

Pace RFQ# 421936



Due:  07/15/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Prevost - 
NO BID

Filter 
Services

Gillig Kirks - NO 
BID

Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie Illinois Auto Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 421936

                                    5 2110019 292.32                  322.62         341.11         292.32         396.00         377.97 

Illinois Auto 233518 -                  stock  21d  8w  160d  160d 

                                    5 2110020 43.85                      50.81           51.51           43.85           45.60           57.03 

Illinois Auto 233518 -                  stock  21d  8w  stock  stock 

                                    5 2110021 437.78                  490.96         489.00         437.78         524.00         569.39 

Illinois Auto 233518  12w  21d  stock  4w  160d 

                                    5 2110034 63.76                      73.89           75.13           63.76           65.41           81.49 

Illinois Auto 233518  6w  21d  8w  stock  stock 

                                    1 2110036 11.87                      11.87 

Illinois Auto 233518  8w 

                                    4 2110039 596.93                  672.00         596.93         710.00         788.07 

Illinois Auto 233518  45d  8w  4w  6w 

                                    4 2110058 7.32                           7.32           11.88           70.14           96.22 

Filter Services 233514 -                  60d  30d  8w  7w 



Due:  07/15/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Prevost - 
NO BID

Filter 
Services

Gillig Kirks - NO 
BID

Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie Illinois Auto Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 421936

                                    3 2110060 6.18                           6.18             7.37             9.80 

Filter Services 233514  60d  30d  7w 

                                    2 2110070 28.30                      28.30           48.24 

Mohawk 233519  21d  6w 

                                    4 2110096 348.69                  408.67         348.69         412.70         453.52 

Illinois Auto 233518 -                  21d  stock  4w  9w 

                                    4 2110099 229.11                  268.95         229.11         298.99         297.98 

Illinois Auto 233518 -                  21d  stock  4w  9w 

                                    4 2110155 2,926.91           3,391.96     2,926.91     3,587.13     3,806.85 

Illinois Auto 233518 -                  21d  stock  45d  9w 

                                    2 2110195 128.34                  128.34         139.47 

Illinois Auto 233518 -                  60d  20w 

                                    2 2110196 103.26                  103.26         111.94 

Illinois Auto 233518 -                  60d  7w 



Due:  07/15/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Prevost - 
NO BID

Filter 
Services

Gillig Kirks - NO 
BID

Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie Illinois Auto Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 421936

                                    2 2110197 0.41                           3.68             0.41 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  60d  stock 

                                    2 2110198 143.79                  143.79         155.71 

Muncie 233517 -                  60d  7w 

                                    2 2110199 0.26                           0.26             0.53 

Muncie 233517 -                  stock  stock 

                                     - 2110230 -                 

-                 

                                     - 2110231 -                 

-                 

                                    2 2110237 91.50                      91.50         111.53 

Muncie 233517 -                  60d  21w 

                                    2 2110238 1,445.99           1,445.99     1,710.61 

Muncie 233517 -                  126d  25w 



Due:  07/15/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Prevost - 
NO BID

Filter 
Services

Gillig Kirks - NO 
BID

Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie Illinois Auto Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 421936

                                    2 2110239 394.05                  394.05         489.54 

Muncie 233517 -                  60d  25w 

                                    2 2110240 120.45                  120.45         160.30 

Muncie 233517 -                  60d  16w 

                                    2 2110241 6.65                           6.65             8.16 

Muncie 233517 -                  60d  25w 

                                    2 2110242 18.90                      18.90           26.02 

Muncie 233517 -                  60d  18w 

                                    2 2110243 3.55                           3.55             4.21 

Muncie 233517 -                  35d  stock 

                                    2 2110244 66.82                      66.82           82.12 

Muncie 233517 -                  30d  25w 

                                    2 2110245 3.27                           3.27             4.38 

Muncie 233517 -                  60d  25w 



Due:  07/15/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Prevost - 
NO BID

Filter 
Services

Gillig Kirks - NO 
BID

Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie Illinois Auto Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 421936

                                    2 2110246 51.83                      51.83           61.21 

Muncie 233517 -                  60d  25w 

                                    2 2110247 533.89                  533.89         633.90 

Muncie 233517 -                  60d  25w 

                                    2 2110248 1,946.75           1,946.75     2,600.28 

Muncie 233517 -                  126d  21w 

                                    2 2110249 7,832.99           7,832.99   10,329.32 

Muncie 233517 -                  70d  21w 


	421936

