
Due:  07/15/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Battery 

Service
P&G Coffman Kirks Hydraulic 

Electric
Gillig Crossline 

Supply
Muncie Vehicle 

Maintenance
Illinois Auto Prevost Mohawk Neopart Aftermarket 

Parts
Eldorado

                                    4 71089 0.05                           0.10             3.51             0.06             0.05 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  stock  8w  stock  stock 

                                    2 71294 0.16                           0.16             0.16 

Mohawk 233519 -                  stock  stock 

                                    1 620025 2.18                           2.18 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  8w 

                                    5 290616 125.00                  145.00         125.00         139.36         125.72         140.21 

Gillig 233515 stock  stock  stock  3w  stock 

                                    5 71441 6.32                           7.08             6.32             6.79           10.64           17.95 

Muncie 233517 -                  stock  stock  stock  19w  stock 

                                    4 200522 19.95                      19.95           20.64           64.31           59.19 

Muncie 233517 -                  stock  stock  4w  5w 

                                    5 70220 7.65                         15.25           13.71             7.65           17.94           46.71 

Mohawk 233519 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 72057 3.87                           3.87           14.49             5.10 

Vehicle Maintenance 233526 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                    5 72143 10.50                      10.50           12.21           12.39           11.04           16.86 

Gillig 233515 -                  4w  30d  8w  3w  stock 

                                    1 160590 12.79                      12.79 

Eldorado 233529  4w 

                                    5 290062 1.28                           3.30             2.88             1.28             2.68             2.38 

Mohawk 233519  stock  stock  stock  10w  stock 

Pace RFQ# 421935



Due:  07/15/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Battery 

Service
P&G Coffman Kirks Hydraulic 

Electric
Gillig Crossline 

Supply
Muncie Vehicle 

Maintenance
Illinois Auto Prevost Mohawk Neopart Aftermarket 

Parts
Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421935

                                    3 160600 9.03                           9.03             9.47             9.54 
                                                                                              
Gillig 233515  stock  30d  stock 

                                    4 170620 3.80                         10.99           10.18             3.80           11.29 

Muncie 233517  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                    4 151457 164.63                  164.63         176.66         195.13         388.00 

Gillig 233515 -                  stock  21d  5w  stock 

                                    6 200611 43.45                    112.50         117.45         116.91           43.45         121.51         137.75 

Mohawk 233519  stock  stock  stock  stock  4w  stock 

                                    6 290537 178.00                  185.00         190.00         178.00         212.13         191.18         212.63 

Crossline 233525 stock  2w  stock  30d  10d  stock 

                                    3 290595 3.82                           3.94             3.89             3.82 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  2w  10d  6w 

                                    2 620154 1.10                           1.10             1.67 

Hydraulic Electric 233516 -                  stock  30d 

                                    4 290289 11.00                      11.00           31.13           11.54           11.37 

Hydraulic Electric 233516 -                  stock  21d  3w  stock 

                                    3 71357 12.37                      12.40           12.37           21.23 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  10d  stock  stock 

                                    4 72142 9.60                         10.56           10.78             9.60           16.86 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  stock  8w  16w  stock 

                                    5 180648 132.00                  132.00         194.94         154.84         222.54         577.48 

Hydraulic Electric 233516 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 



Due:  07/15/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Battery 

Service
P&G Coffman Kirks Hydraulic 

Electric
Gillig Crossline 

Supply
Muncie Vehicle 

Maintenance
Illinois Auto Prevost Mohawk Neopart Aftermarket 

Parts
Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421935

                                    3 160596 164.76                  164.76         174.11         176.08 

Gillig 233515 -                  stock  90d  stock 

                                    5 72135 51.87                      57.63           65.98           69.25           57.57           51.87 

Eldorado 233529 -                  8w  stock  8w  13w  4w 

                                    2 170013 20.45                      20.45           54.56 

Eldorado 233529 -                  stock  stock 

                                    3 170615 222.85                  240.00         222.85         244.30 

Muncie 233517 -                  4w  37d  8w 

                                    3 200863 8.61                           9.17           11.75             8.61 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  90d  21d  stock 

                                    3 290644 53.53                      56.65           53.53           75.03 

Vehicle Maintenance 233526 -                  30d  stock  stock 

                                    5 200622 55.72                    149.86           56.56           55.72         133.03           56.98 

Mohawk 233519 -                  stock  stock  stock  4w  stock 

                                    2 250619 2,575.50           2,575.50     2,600.95 

Muncie 233517 -                  21d  12w 

                                    3 160690 208.88                  208.89         213.64         208.88 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                    5 72094 20.64                      23.50           21.00           26.50           20.64           29.16 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  30d  75d  stock  stock  6w 

                                    4 71442 6.90                           7.08             6.90           10.64           17.95 

Mohawk 233519 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock 



Due:  07/15/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Battery 

Service
P&G Coffman Kirks Hydraulic 

Electric
Gillig Crossline 

Supply
Muncie Vehicle 

Maintenance
Illinois Auto Prevost Mohawk Neopart Aftermarket 

Parts
Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421935

                                    1 70582 5.49                           5.49 

Illinois Auto 233518 -                  stock 

                                    3 72109 777.92              1,200.00     1,562.77         777.92 

Eldorado 233529 -                  14w  10w  8w 

                                    3 72156 21.99                      22.38           21.99           22.42 

Neopart 233528 -                  42d  8w  stock 

                                    1 72163 530.17                  530.17 

Eldorado 233529 -                  stock 

                                    3 151975 1,028.38           1,048.40     1,028.38     2,144.37 
                                                                                                                          
Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  35d  stock  stock 

                                    2 200919 26.11                      26.11           42.56 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  8w  6w 

                                    3 290666 27.48                      27.48           28.60           32.59 

Muncie 233517 -                  30d  7w  stock 

                                    3 72184 6.15                           6.20             6.15           16.44 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                    1 151990 59.57                      59.57 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  stock 

                                    3 180819 13.75                      68.56           67.28           13.75 

Eldorado 233529 -                  21d  stock  4w 

                                    2 290671 17.50                      17.50           23.23 

Muncie 233517 -                  30d  stock 



Due:  07/15/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Battery 

Service
P&G Coffman Kirks Hydraulic 

Electric
Gillig Crossline 

Supply
Muncie Vehicle 

Maintenance
Illinois Auto Prevost Mohawk Neopart Aftermarket 

Parts
Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421935

                                    1 72235 2.84                           2.84 

Eldorado 233529 -                  3w 

                                    3 290679 50.00                      50.00           58.68           67.28 

Hydraulic Electric 233516 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                    1 200956 176.77                  176.77 

Eldorado 233529 -                  stock 

                                    1 72252 32.09                      32.09 

Eldorado 233529 -                  stock 

                                    6 290690 549.25                  625.00         550.00         610.90         549.25         621.84     1,267.26 

Neopart 233528 -                  stock  stock  21d  3w  3w  6w 

                                    5 200964 8.40                         29.99           17.40             8.40           41.63           47.10 

Mohawk 233519 -                  stock  30d  4w  5w  stock 

                                    3 72301 319.91                  319.91         455.00         401.70 

Battery Service 233521 -                  3w  stock  13w 

                                    3 72303 1.42                           1.42             1.43             5.16 

Muncie 233517 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                    1 72311 170.59                  170.59 

Eldorado 233529 -                  stock 

                                     - 670017 -                 

-                 

                                    5 290694 94.00                      94.00           97.50         109.10           98.24         110.82 

Hydraulic Electric 233516 -                  stock  stock  stock  3w  3w 



Due:  07/15/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Battery 

Service
P&G Coffman Kirks Hydraulic 

Electric
Gillig Crossline 

Supply
Muncie Vehicle 

Maintenance
Illinois Auto Prevost Mohawk Neopart Aftermarket 

Parts
Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421935

                                    4 152074 11.18                      19.35           11.18           13.92           23.11 

Mohawk 233519 -                  stock  21d  stock  2w 

                                    6 72388 38.25                      38.75           80.96           38.25           73.63           56.07           95.10 

Mohawk 233519 -                  stock  42d  stock  8w  9w  8w 

                                    1 170722 88.41                      88.41 

Eldorado 233529 -                  stock 

                                    4 1710014 22.81                      29.19           23.36           22.81           56.17 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  4w  21d  stock  8w 

                                    4 1710016 27.87                      32.75           27.90           27.87           56.17 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  4w  30d  stock  stock 

                                    1 710004 30.79                      30.79 

Eldorado 233529 -                  6w 

                                    4 2510000 341.40                  640.00         782.10         341.40         605.42 

Neopart 233528 -                  stock  42d  4w  stock 

                                    6 2010016 131.76                  180.55         170.56         202.46         173.41         210.40         131.76 

Eldorado                                                                                                            233529 -                  30d  stock  4w  stock  5w  stock 

                                    1 1510015 4.69                           4.69 

Eldorado 233529 -                  4w 

1510016 185.16                  185.16 

Eldorado 233529 -                  2w 

                                    5 710043 276.83                  276.83         332.00         313.10         375.88         332.61 

P&G 233522 -                  stock  16w  30d  4w  14w 



Due:  07/15/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Battery 

Service
P&G Coffman Kirks Hydraulic 

Electric
Gillig Crossline 

Supply
Muncie Vehicle 

Maintenance
Illinois Auto Prevost Mohawk Neopart Aftermarket 

Parts
Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421935

                                    4 710057 43.00                      54.16           43.00           65.28           63.36 

Hydraulic Electric 233516 -                  90d  stock  3w  13w 

                                    2 2910007 47.74                      47.74           80.61 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  8w  stock 

                                    1 2910008 3.85                           3.85 

Eldorado 233529 -                  stock 

                                    1 710088 58.44                      58.44 

Eldorado 233529 -                  6w 

                                    2 2910015 18.05                      18.05           26.54 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  stock  stock 

                                    6 2010037 548.31                  560.00         548.31         586.43         556.07         594.04         710.13 

Prevost 233527 -                  30d  stock  4w  4w  5w  stock 

                                    6 710120 404.04                  404.04         475.00         467.19         448.99         577.37         492.35 

P&G 233522 -                  6w  16w  12w  30d  stock  23w 

                                    1 1810033 93.07                      93.07 

Eldorado 233529 -                  4w 

                                    1 710130 93.07                      93.07 

Eldorado 233529 -                  4w 

                                    3 2010041 1,630.00           2,816.70     1,630.00     3,201.50 

Kirks 233524 -                  90d  stock  stock 

                                    5 710134 367.89                  410.96         560.86         441.00         603.22         367.89 
                                              
Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  stock  90d  3w  30d  stock 



Due:  07/15/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Battery 

Service
P&G Coffman Kirks Hydraulic 

Electric
Gillig Crossline 

Supply
Muncie Vehicle 

Maintenance
Illinois Auto Prevost Mohawk Neopart Aftermarket 

Parts
Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421935

                                    5 710149 372.89                  372.89         455.00         385.22         435.26         431.37 

Coffman 233523 -                  stock  stock  stock  4w  2w 

                                     - 710156 -                 

-                 

                                    3 710180 1.11                           3.78             5.58             1.11 

Eldorado 233529 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                    2 710200 310.16                  310.16         415.99 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  19w  stock 

                                    1 1610107 6.81                           6.81 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  3w 

                                    1 2910030 407.95                  407.95 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  stock 

                                    3 710241 35.47                      49.85           39.52           35.47 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  6w  30d  13w 

                                    1 710278 1,565.86           1,565.86 

Eldorado 233529 -                  4w 

                                    3 1710088 132.99                  150.00         144.60         132.99 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  8w  30d  stock 

                                    2 2510159 15.88                      16.94           15.88 

Neopart 233528 -                  1w  10d 

                                     - 1510279 -                    

-                 



Due:  07/15/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Battery 

Service
P&G Coffman Kirks Hydraulic 

Electric
Gillig Crossline 

Supply
Muncie Vehicle 

Maintenance
Illinois Auto Prevost Mohawk Neopart Aftermarket 

Parts
Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421935

                                    1 710396 32.04                      32.04 
                                              
Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  5w 

                                     - 1810090 -                 

-                 

                                     - 1810091 -                 

-                 

                                    2 2510180 119.22                  119.22         124.59 
                                                      
Gillig 233515 -                  3w  10d 

                                    2 2010088 0.44                           0.44             1.09 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  stock  4w 

                                    1 2010089 208.00                  208.00 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  stock 


	421935

