
Due:  07/15/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Triangle 
Service

Rome Truck 
- NO BID

CBM Kirks Prevost - 
NO BID

A&A Gillig Neopart Hydraulic 
Electric

Coffman Vehicle 
Maintenance

Crossline Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Eldorado

                                    2 60735 1,278.32            3,235.67 1,278.32      

Eldorado 233529 -                  9w 9w

                                    5 130611 204.00                     204.00         265.27         295.03         270.96         313.55 

Hydraulic Electric 233516 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    1 81055 161.46          161.46         

Eldorado 233529 -                 stock

                                    8 120488 18.39                      25.50           21.39           18.39           19.63           18.69           18.49           19.50           20.31 

Neopart 233528 30d  4w  4w  90d  stock  stock  30d  5w 

                                    6 60745 39.97                    111.00           90.59         109.81           39.97           70.00           88.30 

Vehicle Maintenance 233526 -                  stock  3w  stock  stock  stock  4w 

                                    6 60494 11.62                      11.79           11.97           22.20           11.62           20.08           12.00 

Mohawk 233519 -                  4w  stock  stock  4w  30d  3w 

                                    3 81090 89.69                      89.69         100.44         108.91 

Coffman 233523 -                  90d  stock  stock 

                                    6 100223 56.66                      56.66         111.72           71.00           65.00         106.98         139.69 

Neopart 233528 -                  stock  90d  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  9w 

                                    1 110143 2.20                           2.20 

-                 
 unapproved 

part 

                                    4 81378 19.47                      42.00           19.47           51.51 51.82           

Mohawk 233519  3w  stock  6w 6w

                                    2 120526 394.00                  575.00         394.00 

Aftermarket Parts 233520  3d  7w 

                                    4 100231 95.00                      95.00         160.34         188.92         192.98 

Hydraulic Electric 233516  stock  stock  5w  9w 

Pace RFQ# 421934



Due:  07/15/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Triangle 
Service

Rome Truck 
- NO BID

CBM Kirks Prevost - 
NO BID

A&A Gillig Neopart Hydraulic 
Electric

Coffman Vehicle 
Maintenance

Crossline Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421934

                                    1 140076 864.08          864.08         

Eldorado 233529  6w 

                                    5 81444 59.40                      75.56           74.80           59.40           77.10           84.30 

Mohawk 233519 -                  stock  6w  stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 81518 6.64                           6.64             7.17             7.43 

Coffman 233523 -                  stock  21d  7w 

                                    7 81519 65.00                      65.00           68.00           78.25           90.33           91.34           87.48         115.14 

Kirks 233524 -                  stock  2w  stock  90d  stock  stock  stock 

                                    9 81521 18.15                      29.00           22.19           31.36           18.90           21.39           18.15           19.29           23.48           22.99 

Vehicle Maintenance 233526 -                  30d  4w  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  3w 

                                    3 81534 25.00                      25.00           37.44 94.43           

A&A Auto 233531 -                  4w  stock 6w

                                    8 1210003 20.22                      31.45           34.50           22.37           24.67           20.22           21.99           26.22           30.88 

Vehicle Maintenance 233526 -                  stock  stock  4w  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    4 610014 12.00                      12.00           16.25           14.80           19.35 

Hydraulic Electric 233516 -                  stock  stock  stock  7w 

                                    1 610020 363.80          363.80         

Eldorado 233529 -                 6w

                                    2 1210011 85.16                      85.16 195.80         

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  stock 4w

                                    1 1210013 183.68          183.68         

Eldorado 233529 -                 stock

                                    3 810025 625.00                  625.00         869.81      1,078.59 

Neopart 233528 -                  stock  stock  9w 



Due:  07/15/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Triangle 
Service

Rome Truck 
- NO BID

CBM Kirks Prevost - 
NO BID

A&A Gillig Neopart Hydraulic 
Electric

Coffman Vehicle 
Maintenance

Crossline Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421934

                                    4 610025 36.06                      36.06           39.00           42.60           43.28 

Coffman 233523 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 1310007 13.28                      13.28           14.00           17.52 

Coffman 233523 -                  stock  21d  6w 

                                    3 610033 625.00                  625.00         791.36         970.72 

Kirks 233524 -                  stock  stock  5w 

                                    1 610036 3,858.09       3,858.09      

Eldorado 233529 -                 10w

                                    3 810049 120.37                  120.37         142.99         150.06 

Coffman 233523 -                  stock  stock  5w 

                                    3 810056 196.08                  196.08         232.49         244.47 

Coffman 233523 -                  90d  30d  stock 

                                    6 810060 29.99                      52.65           41.44           34.00           30.25           29.99           50.48 

Muncie 233517 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    2 810064 4,427.93            4,854.40      4,427.93 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  90d  9w 

                                    5 610055 12.48                      49.85           44.02           12.48           49.15           53.76 

Mohawk 233519 -                  4w  stock  stock 
 bid 11, 
need 20  stock 

                                    3 1210034 26.30                      27.45           29.30           26.30 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  stock  30d  7w 

                                    4 810076 140.82                  140.82         165.61         153.79         157.16 

Coffman 233523 -                  stock  4w  30d  stock 

                                    2 810077 142.91                  142.91         164.54 

Coffman 233523 -                  stock  stock 



Due:  07/15/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Triangle 
Service

Rome Truck 
- NO BID

CBM Kirks Prevost - 
NO BID

A&A Gillig Neopart Hydraulic 
Electric

Coffman Vehicle 
Maintenance

Crossline Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421934

                                    5 610058 44.53                      89.10         100.22           44.53         127.05         310.77 

CBM 233530 -                  stock  4w 
 unapproved 

part  30d  stock 

                                    4 810078 436.02                  497.09         436.02         507.95         550.22 

Coffman 233523 -                  stock  stock  30d  9w 

                                    4 810084 645.00                  645.00         871.54         860.06      1,055.89 

Neopart 233528 -                  stock  stock  stock  6w 

                                    7 1010032 55.00                    138.36           79.65         127.38           55.00           67.44         123.50         147.87 

Crossline 233525 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock 

                                    2 1310012 845.39                  845.39      1,111.92 

Coffman 233523 -                  stock  3w 

                                    4 610064 90.44                      90.44         115.72         105.90         109.81 

Coffman 233523 -                  90d  5w  30d  stock 

                                    4 810102 3.41                           3.41             4.26             4.02             4.07 

Coffman 233523 -                  stock  4w  30d  5w 

                                    4 810110 1,350.00            1,350.00      1,588.27      1,737.40      1,416.35 

Kirks 233524 -                  stock  stock  21d  stock 

                                    4 810125 41.37                    115.14           41.37         123.99         126.95 

Coffman 233523 -                  stock 
 unapproved 

part  30d  7w 

                                    4 810128 661.30                  661.30         900.00         785.49         804.27 

Coffman 233523 -                  90d  stock  30d  7w 

                                    1 1110002 93.81            93.81           

Eldorado 233529 -                 stock

                                    4 1010042 386.00                  575.00         404.50         386.00         496.64 

Crossline 233525 -                  7d  90d  stock  9w 



Due:  07/15/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Triangle 
Service

Rome Truck 
- NO BID

CBM Kirks Prevost - 
NO BID

A&A Gillig Neopart Hydraulic 
Electric

Coffman Vehicle 
Maintenance

Crossline Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421934

                                    5 1210070 57.37                      70.55           68.00           57.37           60.02           64.89 

Coffman 233523 -                  stock  stock  stock  2w  6w 

                                    4 810141 23.54                      71.10           23.54           55.98           81.16 

Muncie 233517 -                  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  3w 

                                    4 810072 26.40                      40.62           26.40           47.80           49.18 

Coffman 233523 -                  90d 
 unapproved 

part  30d  5w 

                                    7 610073 6.39                           8.25             6.39             9.58             6.52             7.10             8.59             8.20 

A&A Auto 233231 -                  stock  4w  stock  stock  stock  42d  stock 

                                    3 810158 69.59                      69.59           79.80           86.48 

Coffman 233523 -                  90d  stock  3w 

                                    1 610087 11,139.57     11,139.57   

Eldorado 233529 -                 stock

                                    7 610088 29.25                      29.25           67.48         117.86           44.44           38.00           42.57           58.50 

CBM 233530 -                  stock  3w  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock 

                                    4 610092 351.70                  351.70         397.50         386.01 851.74         

Crossline 233525 -                  stock  75d  15w 8w

                                    2 810194 52.80                      52.80           57.80 

Coffman 233523 -                  stock  30d 

                                    2 810197 170.96                  170.96         183.95 

Coffman 233523 -                  90d  30d 

                                    3 610098 2.45                           2.56             2.45 5.26             

Muncie 233517 -                  5w  stock 3w

                                    1 610102 1,479.92       1,479.92      

Eldorado 233529 -                 stock



Due:  07/15/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Triangle 
Service

Rome Truck 
- NO BID

CBM Kirks Prevost - 
NO BID

A&A Gillig Neopart Hydraulic 
Electric

Coffman Vehicle 
Maintenance

Crossline Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421934

                                    2 1310020 3.09                           3.09             3.42 

Coffman 233523 -                  1w  21d 

                                    2 1310021 5.41                           5.41             5.99 

Coffman 233523 -                  1w  21d 

                                    2 610121 82.99                      82.99           89.76 

Coffman 233523 -                  stock  30d 

                                    4 810286 25.94                      28.43           26.00           25.94           33.72 

Crossline 233525 -                  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  21d 

                                    3 810309 5.75                         17.27             5.75           20.35 

Coffman 233523 -                  stock 
 unapproved 

part  21d 

                                    2 1310034 283.42                  283.42         312.50 

Coffman 233523 -                  1w  21d 

                                    2 810337 59.67                      59.67           69.95 

Coffman 233523 -                  stock  30d 

                                    3 810350 12.74                      12.74           20.36           15.30 

Coffman 233523 -                  stock 
 unapproved 

part  30d 

                                    3 810351 1,492.81            1,492.81      1,811.83      1,649.22 

Coffman 233523 -                  stock  4w  30d 

                                    2 810352 36.62                      36.62           43.90 

Coffman 233523 -                  stock  30d 

                                    2 810369 14.06                      14.06           15.95 

Coffman 233523 -                  stock  30d 

                                    1 1010100 6,711.08            6,711.08 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  stock 



Due:  07/15/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Triangle 
Service

Rome Truck 
- NO BID

CBM Kirks Prevost - 
NO BID

A&A Gillig Neopart Hydraulic 
Electric

Coffman Vehicle 
Maintenance

Crossline Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421934

                                     - 1010101 -                 

-                 

                                     - 810401 -                 

-                 

                                    1 1210155 116.07                  116.07 

Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  stock 

                                    2 810404 5.34                           5.34             6.40 

Coffman 233523 -                  stock  30d 

                                    2 810405 23.41                      23.41           28.70 

Coffman 233523 -                  stock  21d 

                                    1 810406 499.35                  499.35 

 Aftermarket Parts 233520 -                  8w 


	421934

