
Due:  06/23/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
Vehicle 

Maintenance
A&A Auto Suburban 

Truck
Neopart Gillig Illinois Auto Aftermarket 

Parts
Prevost - 
NO BID

Kirks Coffman Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie Mohawk Eldorado

                                   2 220309 41.42                      41.42           42.89 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                 stock  45d 

                                   6 200901 44.85                      64.99           72.90           69.58           66.18           44.85           74.83 

Mohawk 233486 -                 4w  4w  5w  30d  stock  8w 

                                   5 290616 125.50                 125.71        125.50        140.21        135.00        139.97 

Gillig 233482 -                 3w  stock  5w  stock  stock 

                                   4 180359 57.00                   118.25        125.74           57.00           62.53 

Hydraulic Electric 233492  8w  11w  stock  stock 

                                   5 151458 160.71                 179.96        160.71        188.94        174.76        388.00 

Gillig 233482 -                 stock  stock  5w  stock  stock 

                                   4 200522 19.95                      58.95           58.87           19.95           20.95 

Muncie 233487 -                 4w  5w  stock  stock 

                                   5 200548 19.05                      20.13           20.67           19.05           21.87           24.42 

Muncie 233487 -                 4w  stock  30d  6w  stock 

                                   4 210975 21.98                      26.50           24.87           21.98           79.87 

Mohawk 233486 -                 stock  60d  stock  stock 

                                   4 151457 164.63                 164.63        195.13        176.76        388.00 

Gillig 233482 -                 stock  5w  21d  stock 

                                   5 200611 43.45                   115.72        115.25        128.17        117.77           43.45 

Mohawk 233486 3w  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                   4 210993 604.24                 673.62        860.94        604.24        765.00 

Pace RFQ# 421888



Due:  06/23/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
Vehicle 

Maintenance
A&A Auto Suburban 

Truck
Neopart Gillig Illinois Auto Aftermarket 

Parts
Prevost - 
NO BID

Kirks Coffman Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie Mohawk Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421888

Muncie 233487  4w  stock  stock  30d 

                                   4 220130 7.80                        10.10        196.84           13.00             7.80 

Muncie 233487  10d  6w  stock  45d 

                                   4 290645 53.53                      53.53           91.54           56.65           70.02 

Vehicle Maintenance 233490  stock  7w  30d  6w 

                                   3 160596 164.76                 164.76        176.08        174.32 

Gillig 233482 -                 stock  stock  30d 

                                   1 220341 119.24                 119.24 

Eldorado 233481  8w 

                                   8 200863 8.47                        10.52           17.97             9.09           10.52           15.84             8.66             8.47           16.61 
Availability - 
Suburban Truck 233494  14d  stock  4w  stock 4w  3w  90d  30d 

                                   3 210976 21.21                      26.00           21.21           79.17 

Mohawk 233486 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                   3 290644 53.53                      53.53           56.65           75.03 

Vehicle Maintenance 233490 -                 stock  30d  8w 

                                   2 210834 14.52                      14.52           20.19 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                 6w  14d 

                                   5 200582 46.41                      95.23        107.96           96.36        104.63           46.41 

Eldorado 233481 -                 4w  stock  30d 
 no lead 

time given  stock 

                                   4 200724 20.15                   322.15        346.46        323.05           20.15 

Mohawk 233486 -                 3w  5w  90d  stock 



Due:  06/23/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
Vehicle 

Maintenance
A&A Auto Suburban 

Truck
Neopart Gillig Illinois Auto Aftermarket 

Parts
Prevost - 
NO BID

Kirks Coffman Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie Mohawk Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421888

                                   6 200913 11.90                      19.06           14.99           13.17           11.90           12.68           19.08 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                 stock  6w  stock  stock  stock  5w 

                                   4 210803 3,239.88          3,468.33     4,076.83     3,239.88     8,529.70 

Muncie 233487 -                 stock  11w  21d  12w 

                                   5 170659 47.36                      90.34           47.36           65.82           89.76           90.70 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                 6w  stock  45d  45d  6w 

                                   3 211064 1,668.67          1,668.67     2,049.76     1,680.00 

Illinois Auto 233495 -                 8w 
 no lead 

time given  4w 

                                   5 200959 25.00                      70.29           84.88           25.00           71.17           81.23 

Kirks 233484 -                 stock  5w  stock  30d  5w 

                                   3 152033 135.15                 146.10        135.15        298.16 

Muncie 233487 -                 5w  stock  stock 

                                   2 200965 5.24                          5.24           22.05 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                 stock  stock 

                                   3 211103 27.50                      27.50           32.52        106.48 

Vehicle Maintenance 233490 -                 stock  3w  stock 

                                   3 290695 62.59                      89.25           62.59        110.18 

Muncie 233487 -                 25w  stock  stock 

                                   4 290696 9.60                        10.23           29.11             9.60           51.84 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                 stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  8w 

                                   1 211124 29.83                      29.83 



Due:  06/23/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
Vehicle 

Maintenance
A&A Auto Suburban 

Truck
Neopart Gillig Illinois Auto Aftermarket 

Parts
Prevost - 
NO BID

Kirks Coffman Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie Mohawk Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421888

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                 5w 

                                   3 290700 169.04                 171.72        169.04        300.63 

Muncie 233487 -                 26w  45d  stock 

                                   3 290701 175.65                 175.65        176.76        300.63 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                 26w  120d  stock 

                                   4 170718 66.52                      76.55           67.56           66.52        104.41 

Muncie 233487 -                 6w  5w  stock  stock 

                                   2 1610001 259.15                 259.15        270.12 

Gillig 233482 -                 stock  stock 

                                   3 1710015 35.95                      37.54           35.95           36.26 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                 6w  5w  30d 

                                   3 2510000 325.14                 325.14        642.73        605.42 

Neopart 233485 -                 4w  stock  stock 

                                   4 2210000 48.03                      48.03           58.09           52.86        108.23 

Gillig 233482 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                   5 1610013 105.35                 178.76        190.18        192.92        105.35        418.56 

Gillig 233482 -                 stock  11w  stock 
 unapproved 

part  8w 

                                   3 1510008 14.65                      14.65           14.75           25.31 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                 10w  14d  4w 

                                   1 1510015 4.69                          4.69 

Eldorado 233481 -                 stock 



Due:  06/23/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
Vehicle 

Maintenance
A&A Auto Suburban 

Truck
Neopart Gillig Illinois Auto Aftermarket 

Parts
Prevost - 
NO BID

Kirks Coffman Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie Mohawk Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421888

                                   4 2210004 3,805.00          3,850.00     3,916.10     3,805.00     3,814.29 

Muncie 233487 -                 8w  7w  24w  10w 

                                   3 2010041 2,130.00          3,201.50     2,130.00     2,725.14 

Kirks 233484 -                 9w  stock  90d 

                                   1 1510106 1,088.25          1,088.25 

Eldorado 233481 -                 4w 

                                   3 1810036 103.00                 111.11        154.61        103.00 

Hydraulic Electric 233492 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                   1 1610073 2.72                          2.72 

Eldorado 233481 -                 2w 

                                   1 1610074 0.47                          0.47 

Eldorado 233481 -                 2w 

                                   3 2110074 1,659.84          1,659.84     2,008.77     1,989.77 

Illinois Auto 233495 -                 8w  7w  42d 

                                   1 1610086 9.26                          9.26 

Eldorado 233481 -                 1w 

                                   5 2910027 106.49                 106.49        109.56        113.60        118.00        120.49 

Neopart 233485 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                   3 2910067 936.71                 975.57        936.71     1,137.01 

Gillig 233482 -                 10d  6w  7w 

                                   3 2210030 189.77                 206.05        189.77        397.67 



Due:  06/23/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
Vehicle 

Maintenance
A&A Auto Suburban 

Truck
Neopart Gillig Illinois Auto Aftermarket 

Parts
Prevost - 
NO BID

Kirks Coffman Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie Mohawk Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421888

Muncie 233487 -                 10w  60d  stock 

                                   3 2510073 125.30                 160.70        140.19        125.30 

Muncie 233187 -                 6w  11w  stock 

                                   1 1610099 538.20                 538.20 

Eldorado 233481 -                 3w 

                                   4 211036 138.08                 180.01        138.08        169.61        164.95 

Illinois Auto 233495 -                 stock  8w  stock  42d 

                                   1 2110142 21.89                      21.89 

Aftermarket Parts 233484 -                 stock 

                                   3 2310000 22.22                      33.05           25.87           22.22 

Muncie 233487 -                 8w  stock  stock 

                                   4 2110152 87.44                   115.81           87.44        107.41        103.65 

Illinois Auto 233195 -                 stock  stock  9w  21d 

                                   3 1710132 44.94                      81.00           46.99           44.94 

Muncie 233487 -                 6w  stock  stock 

                                   - 1510279 -                

-                

                                   4 2110202 370.99                 370.99        488.52        448.75        562.65 

Illinois Auto 233495 -                 8w  11w  42d  12w 

                                   4 2110203 551.06                 551.06        710.45        654.99        695.00 

Illinois Auto 233495 -                 8w  21w  42d  30d 



Due:  06/23/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
Vehicle 

Maintenance
A&A Auto Suburban 

Truck
Neopart Gillig Illinois Auto Aftermarket 

Parts
Prevost - 
NO BID

Kirks Coffman Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie Mohawk Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421888

                                   3 2110212 56.38                      70.75           56.38           59.35 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                   1 2010083 198.42                 198.42 

Eldorado 233481 -                 8w 

                                   1 1510309 68.90                      68.90 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                 stock 

                                   1 1510310 71.68                      71.68 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                 stock 

                                   1 1510311 50.11                      50.11 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                 stock 

                                   1 2110237 111.53                 111.53 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                 21w 


	421888

