
Due:  06/23/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto  
- NO BID

P&G Interstate 
Power

Prevost Vehicle 
Maintenance

A&A Auto Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Neopart Kirks Coffman Eldorado Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie Mohawk

                                   4 71733 78.98                   109.34           78.98           95.88           90.85 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                 stock  stock  6w 
 bid 23, 
need 25 

                                   7 72079 209.10                 209.10        301.00        249.81        243.99        264.00        238.99        325.00 

Availability - Muncie 233487 -                 20w  90d  3w  8w  stock  stock  30d 

                                   1 72125 19.87                      19.87 

Eldorado 233481 -                 stock 

                                   3 72102 76.32                      76.32        154.99           76.40 

Aftermarket Parts 233483  7w  stock  30d 

                                   4 72057 3.87                          3.87             5.11             9.41           14.71 

Vehicle Maintenance 233490 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                   5 71100 0.09                          1.16             0.09             0.47             0.12             0.09 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                 10d  stock  stock  60d  stock 

                                   5 72135 57.57                      57.57           57.63           63.54        128.06           67.90 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                 13w  12w 10w  8w  80d 

                                   2 620177 63.00                      86.40           63.00 

Hydraulic Electric 233492 -                 4w  14d 

                                   4 72058 5.50                          5.50           14.76           85.12           23.24 

Vehicle Maintenance 233490 -                 stock  stock  8w  30d 

                                   1 72077 68.39                      68.39 

Eldorado 233481  6w 

                                   7 70706 10.25                      36.26           23.40           15.75           24.01           51.35           16.05           10.25 

Pace RFQ# 421886



Due:  06/23/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto  
- NO BID

P&G Interstate 
Power

Prevost Vehicle 
Maintenance

A&A Auto Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Neopart Kirks Coffman Eldorado Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 421886

Gillig 233482  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                   4 72056 10.97                      29.29           55.31           10.97           46.96 

Neopart 233485  stock  6w  stock  stock 

                                   7 72094 16.91                      21.00           16.91           22.78           20.76           29.16           23.56           26.50 

Vehicle Maintenance 233490 stock  stock  2w  stock  6w  30d  4w 

                                   3 620176 61.00                   131.78           83.68           61.00 

Hydraulic Electric 233492 -                 8w  6w  14d 

                                   1 72145 10.00                      10.00 

Eldorado 233481  stock 

                                   4 72156 22.38                      22.45           24.05           23.75           22.38 

Muncie 233487  stock  12w  10w  42d 

                                   4 72167 38.25                      39.11           38.25           40.67           44.12 

Gillig 233482 -                 stock  12w  10w  42d 

                                   2 72171 37.30                      46.26           37.30 

Eldorado 233481 -                 stock  stock 

                                   3 72238 1,800.00          2,489.64     1,800.00     1,990.10 

Gillig 233482 -                 14w  8w  10w 

                                   - 670017 -                

-                

                                   7 72388 38.25                      84.86           56.07           39.00           67.56           95.10           71.50           38.25 



Due:  06/23/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto  
- NO BID

P&G Interstate 
Power

Prevost Vehicle 
Maintenance

A&A Auto Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Neopart Kirks Coffman Eldorado Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 421886

Mohawk 233486 -                 stock  5w  stock  10w  stock  stock  stock 

                                   4 710007 17.17                      21.12           21.74           25.83           17.17 

Muncie 233487 -                 stock  3w  4w  stock 

                                   1 710008 210.59                 210.59 

Eldorado 233481 -                 6w 

                                   6 710043 276.83                 276.83        394.55        334.52        305.00        313.55        381.60 

Availability - Kirks 233484 -                 12w  75d  14w  stock  30d  30d 

                                   2 710064 7.19                        11.13             7.19 

Muncie 233487 -                 stock  21d 

                                   1 6510007 1,737.88          1,737.88 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                 14w 

                                   - 710130 -                

-                

                                   2 6510017 1,385.99          1,486.03     1,385.99 

Gillig 233482 -                 17w  6w 

                                   5 710149 372.89                 431.37        460.59        372.89        398.88        393.25 

Coffman 233491 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  30d 

                                   1 710150 53.57                      53.57 

Eldorado 233481 -                 stock 

                                   1 710157 43.45                      43.45 

Eldorado 233481 -                 stock 



Due:  06/23/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto  
- NO BID

P&G Interstate 
Power

Prevost Vehicle 
Maintenance

A&A Auto Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Neopart Kirks Coffman Eldorado Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 421886

                                   5 710168 430.77                 430.77        625.53        528.94        489.00        653.00 

P&G 233488 -                 12w  75d  7m  14w  35d 

                                   6 710170 2,893.44          2,893.44     4,227.86     3,605.38     3,200.00     7,067.33     3,789.44 

P&G 233488 -                 stock  75d  10m  stock  8w  30d 

                                   3 6710005 38.57                      44.03           38.57           66.66 

Gillig 233482 -                 stock  6w  stock 

                                   2 6510019 169.10                 172.70        169.10 

Gillig 233482 -                 9w  6w 

                                   3 710180 3.78                          5.75           25.92             3.78 

Muncie 233487 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                   1 710190 185.16                 185.16 

Eldorado 233481 -                 stock 

                                   2 6510021 2,293.31          2,529.76     2,293.31 

Gillig 233482 -                 5w  4w 

                                   1 710206 143.31                 143.31 

Eldorado 233481 -                 stock 

                                   3 710213 1,978.86          3,702.06     1,978.86     2,369.33 

Coffman 233491 -                 5w  stock  21d 

                                   1 710247 175.68                 175.68 

Eldorado 233481 -                 6w 



Due:  06/23/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto  
- NO BID

P&G Interstate 
Power

Prevost Vehicle 
Maintenance

A&A Auto Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Neopart Kirks Coffman Eldorado Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 421886

                                   1 710284 7.80                          7.80 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                 stock 

                                   1 710293 6.15                          6.15 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                 20w 

                                   1 710341 537.33                 537.33 

Eldorado 233481 -                 stock 

                                   2 6710020 539.71                 539.71        574.12 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                 8w  8w 

                                   2 6710022 5,094.92          5,094.92     5,650.00 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                 13w  12w 

                                   3 710425 193.71                 222.61        193.71        207.00 

Coffman 233491 -                 stock  stock  30d 

                                   1 710431 35.88                      35.88 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                 stock 


	421886

