
Due:  06/23/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

P&G Interstate 
Power

Crossline A&A Vehicle 
Maintenance

Suburban 
Truck

Gillig Neopart Prevost - 
NO BID

Eldorado Aftermarket 
Parts

Coffman Kirks Muncie Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk

                                    1 610036 3,858.09             3,858.09 

Eldorado 233481 -                  8w 

                                    1 610087 11,362.35        11,362.35 

Eldorado 233481 -                  stock 

                                    5 130684 6.13                           6.95           11.80             6.63             6.13 6.91            

Muncie 233487 -                  stock  stock  stock  21d 6w

                                    1 100167 3.38                            3.38 

Eldorado 233481  2w 

                                    7 130581 48.64                      60.17           52.42           50.89           63.95           48.64           54.60 49.66         

Coffman 233491 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock stock

                                    1 110138 7.28                            7.28 

Eldorado 233481 -                  stock 

                                    8 60745 42.35                      93.00           42.35           92.23         135.40         104.19         123.00           72.01 142.44       

Vehicle Maintenance 233490 -                  2w  stock  stock 
 no lead 

time given  stock  stock  stock 4w

                                    8 60494 10.98                      13.43           11.69           23.91           13.43           22.04           10.98           11.57 12.35         

Coffman 233491 -                  14d  5w  stock  stock  4w  stock  35d 4w

                                    4 110085 16.54                      16.54         101.50         114.75 16.55         

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                  stock  stock  21d 
 unapproved 

part 

                                    3 110100 2.25                           2.25             2.32 3.60            

Gillig 233482  stock  stock stock

                                    3 110058 2.86                           5.54             5.73 2.86            

Mohawk 233486  stock  21d stock

                                    3 60748 47.71                       78.90           47.71           48.00 

Aftermarket Parts 233483  6w  stock  60d 

Pace RFQ# 421884



Due:  06/23/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

P&G Interstate 
Power

Crossline A&A Vehicle 
Maintenance

Suburban 
Truck

Gillig Neopart Prevost - 
NO BID

Eldorado Aftermarket 
Parts

Coffman Kirks Muncie Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 421884

                                    6 100223 58.00                      60.90         144.00         103.74         106.98           58.00 65.00         

Hydraulic Electric 233492  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                    2 120509 21.05                      29.47           21.05 

Coffman 233491 -                  4w  stock 

                                    4 81378 18.97                      42.25           27.00            51.82 18.97         

Mohawk 233486 2w  stock  6w stock

                                    1 60772 19.68                       19.68 

Eldorado 233481  stock 

                                    5 81441 42.00                      61.46           47.31           49.20           42.00 52.60         

Hydraulic Electric 233492 -                  stock  90d  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                    3 120541 50.51                      65.75           50.51           59.25 

Coffman 233491 -                  5w  stock  21d 

                                 10 81521 18.15                      22.31           22.19           18.15           30.25           19.25           28.16           19.75           28.00           23.48 19.29         

Vehicle Maintenance 233490 -                 
 no lead 

time given  4w  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  30d  21d stock

                                    4 81528 2.25                           2.70             2.25             2.75 6.62            

Coffman 233491 -                  stock  stock  21d 6w

                                    5 81533 12.69                      27.00           30.68           49.58           14.07 12.69         

Mohawk 233486 -                  3w  13w  90d  stock stock

                                    4 81534 24.34                      24.34           25.50            94.43           37.66 

A&A 233489 -                  2w  stock  stock  stock 

                                    4 1110000 39.00                      46.02           39.00           55.00           51.00 

A&A 233489 -                  14d  stock  5w 
 no lead 

time given 

                                    7 1210003 20.22                      22.69           20.22           34.00           22.06           22.75           24.00 21.99         

Vehicle Maintenance 233490 -                 
 no lead 

time given  stock  stock  stock  stock  35d 5w



Due:  06/23/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

P&G Interstate 
Power

Crossline A&A Vehicle 
Maintenance

Suburban 
Truck

Gillig Neopart Prevost - 
NO BID

Eldorado Aftermarket 
Parts

Coffman Kirks Muncie Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 421884

                                    4 810007 418.00                  418.00          617.25         419.85         535.00 

P&G 233488 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 610009 2.49                            7.36             2.49             5.35 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                  6w  stock  21d 

                                    5 810010 399.00                  523.00         622.93         789.00         632.61         399.00 

Kirks 233484 -                  3w  stock  5w  stock  stock 

                                    5 610014 13.00                      21.44           19.40           15.25           14.80           13.00 

Hydraulic Electric 233492 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 810019 332.86                  390.15         332.86         353.51 

Coffman 233491 -                  4w  stock  21d 

                                    7 1010003 11.99                      48.58           38.04           30.22           22.00           35.58           15.00 11.99         

Hydraulic Electric 233492 -                  6w  stock  stock  stock  21d  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                    5 610018 17.19                      67.08           54.79           48.00           51.64 17.19         

Coffman 233491 -                  stock  stock  stock  21d 
 unapproved 

part 

                                    6 610019 82.50                    151.97         103.50         152.20           82.50           92.51 89.24         

Kirks 233484 -                  stock  7w  stock  stock  35d  21d 

                                    2 1210016 1,500.00             1,500.00      2,009.10 

Eldorado 233481 -                  90d  12w 

                                    3 810026 978.82               1,214.35         978.82      1,132.95 

Coffman 233491 -                  9w  stock  stock 

                                    4 810027 561.37                  682.00         842.44         561.37         675.66 

Coffman 233491 -                  stock  stock  stock  28d 

                                    3 610025 34.49                      43.28           34.49           40.27 

Coffman 233491 -                  7w  stock  stock 



Due:  06/23/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

P&G Interstate 
Power

Crossline A&A Vehicle 
Maintenance

Suburban 
Truck

Gillig Neopart Prevost - 
NO BID

Eldorado Aftermarket 
Parts

Coffman Kirks Muncie Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 421884

                                    7 610026 90.00                    175.26         419.31         326.95         132.00         168.39           90.00 167.45       

Kirks 233484 -                  4w  6w  stock  2w  stock 
 no part # 
identified 

 unapproved 
part 

                                    1 610035 14.98                      14.98 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                  stock 

                                    2 810064 4,427.93            4,427.93      4,579.65 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                  9w  90d 

                                    3 810071 734.05               1,229.53         734.05         883.50 

Coffman 233491 -                  9w  90d  28d 

                                    4 810073 118.05                  141.49         146.60         118.18         118.05 

Muncie 233487 -                  4w  7w  stock  stock 

                                    4 810078 432.85                  497.09         553.38         432.85         518.81 

Coffman 233491 -                  stock  9w  stock  21d 

                                    5 1010034 32.24                      57.97           45.99           53.68           38.00 32.24         

Mohawk 233486 -                  stock  stock  21d  stock stock

                                    2 810101 232.01                  291.10         232.01 

Coffman 233491 -                  6w  stock 

                                    4 810102 3.25                           4.07             3.25             3.78 4.26            

Coffman 233491 -                  5w  stock  21d 5w

                                    3 810111 945.31                  995.00         945.31      1,075.30 

Coffman 233491 -                  stock  stock  28d 

                                    4 810123 59.50                      75.75           59.50           66.47 78.12         

Coffman 233491 -                  stock  stock  stock 6w

                                    3 810125 41.37                    126.95         108.38 41.37         

Coffman 233491 -                  5w  stock 
 unapproved 

part 



Due:  06/23/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

P&G Interstate 
Power

Crossline A&A Vehicle 
Maintenance

Suburban 
Truck

Gillig Neopart Prevost - 
NO BID

Eldorado Aftermarket 
Parts

Coffman Kirks Muncie Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 421884

                                    7 610073 6.00                           6.59             8.81             9.58             8.20             6.00             8.03 7.31            

Coffman 233491 -                  4w  stock  stock  5w  stock  stock 10w

                                    4 810154 8.75                         11.40             9.00           10.57 8.75            

Coffman 233491 -                  stock  stock  21d 
 unapproved 

part 

                                    4 610080 99.00                    189.20         150.80           99.00 193.92       

Coffman 233491 -                  5w  stock 
 unapproved 

part 30d

                                    2 810165 1,250.87             1,771.61      1,250.87 

Aftermarket Parts 233483 -                  10w  11w 

                                    5 810173 8.10                         30.20           26.56           28.50           19.95 8.10            

Hydraulic Electric 233492 -                  6w  stock  28d  stock 
 unapprovd  

part 

                                    1 1210082 0.62                            0.62 

Eldorado 233481 -                  stock 

                                    2 810179 50.16                      63.65           50.16 

Coffman 233491 -                  stock  stock 

                                    4 810184 50.00                      84.58           72.41           79.79           50.00 

Hydraulic Electric 233492 -                  4w  stock  21d  stock 

                                    5 810192 1,050.00            1,295.00      1,050.00      1,820.82      1,594.45      1,400.62 

Neopart 233485 -                  stock  stock  6w  stock  stock 

                                    1 810198 737.43                   737.43 

Eldorado 233481 -                  6w 

                                    4 610098 2.45                            5.26             2.55             2.45 2.56            

Muncie 233487 -                  6w  9w  21d stock

                                    2 810204 1,859.74            1,859.74      2,084.71 

Coffman 233491 -                  stock  28d 



Due:  06/23/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

P&G Interstate 
Power

Crossline A&A Vehicle 
Maintenance

Suburban 
Truck

Gillig Neopart Prevost - 
NO BID

Eldorado Aftermarket 
Parts

Coffman Kirks Muncie Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 421884

                                    3 810209 22.34                      25.58           22.34           23.99 

Coffman 233491 -                  5w  stock  21d 

                                    1 810215 21.50                       21.50 

Eldorado 233481 -                  stock 

                                    2 810224 241.68                  282.65         241.68 

Coffman 233491 -                  7w  stock 

                                    2 810231 261.08                  296.40         261.08 

Coffman 233491 -                  stock  stock 

                                    2 1010060 2,449.77            3,515.45      2,449.77 

Coffman 233491 -                  9w  stock 

                                    4 810241 3.44                           4.35             3.44             4.05 5.09            

Coffman 233491 -                  stock  stock  21d 30d

                                    3 610123 42.61                      48.90           42.61           45.60 

Coffman 233491 -                  9w  stock  21d 

                                    4 1010068 837.56               1,254.50      1,210.72         850.00         837.56 

Kirks 233484 -                  stock  90d  2w 
 bid 7, need 

8 

                                    2 810270 222.58                  279.25         222.58 

Coffman 233491 -                  5w  stock 

                                    2 810301 609.06                  773.00         609.06 

Coffman 233491 -                  9w  90d 

                                    4 810304 32.50                      43.85           34.95           41.85 32.50         

Coffman 233491 -                  7w  stock  21d 
 unapproved 

part 

                                    3 810362 35.03                      55.25           35.03           40.77 

Coffman 233491 -                  4w  stock  21d 



Due:  06/23/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

P&G Interstate 
Power

Crossline A&A Vehicle 
Maintenance

Suburban 
Truck

Gillig Neopart Prevost - 
NO BID

Eldorado Aftermarket 
Parts

Coffman Kirks Muncie Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 421884

                                    1 1210154 6.91                           6.91 

Coffman 233491 -                  stock 


	421884

