Due: 06/23/22 Pace RFQ# 421883
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
I A I O
Sku Winning bid |lllinois Auto| Eldorado Gillig Suburban | Aftermarket | Prevost Vehicle Kirks Neopart | Mohawk Muncie
-NO BID Truck Parts Maintenance
NO # of Bids
41237 97.76 110.00 115.58 139.26 97.76 114.75 101.92
Neopart 233485 - 2w 6w 75d 3w 4w 30d
30357 57.93 57.93 59.52
Aftermarket Parts 233483 - stock 60d
20701 250.95 250.95 402.31 448.70
Eldorado 233481 - stock 17w 60d
30014 3.10 4.57 6.88 4.24 4.26 3.10 4.77
Mohawk 233486 stock stock 5w stock stock 30d
41238 101.52 125.00 101.52 139.26 105.98 113.75 101.52
Aftermarket Parts 233483 - 4w 6w 75d 3w 4w 30d
20598 25.17 79.50 40.36 52.09 44.28 44.43 25.17 40.15
unapproved
Muncie 233487 - stock stock stock stock stock part stock
41216 283.06 617.20 283.06 318.38 359.12 324.14
Gillig 233482 - stock stock stock 5w 120d
41215 159.27 357.46 170.34 175.92 175.97 159.27 188.90 171.65




Due: 06/23/22 Pace RFQ# 421883
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid |lllinois Auto| Eldorado Gillig Suburban | Aftermarket | Prevost Vehicle Kirks Neopart | Mohawk Muncie
-NO BID Truck Parts Maintenance
NO # of Bids
Neopart 233485 - stock stock stock 5w stock 4w stock
41213 170.11 197.13 170.11 175.68 172.37 257.20
unapproved
Gillig 233482 - 20w 4w 17w part 120d
41217 91.71 199.16 146.89 91.71 210.20 116.37 106.07 115.00
Aftermarket Parts 233483 stock stock stock 75d 6w stock 30d
41227 23.10 27.32 32.89 47.87 36.73 47.90 47.04 47.82 23.10
Muncie 233487 stock stock stock stock stock stock stock stock
41169 40.84 40.84 47.82 43.49 44.81 44.60 45.42
unapproved
Gillig 233482 Y stock stock stock part stock
10199 9.82 21.76 30.11 45.85 21.12 17.73 9.82 42.32
Mohawk 233486 stock 5w 75d stock 3w stock 30d
40079 8.10 11.99 36.49 18.48 18.63 8.10 18.63
Mohawk 233486 - 6w stock 7w 75d 6w 30d
20559 45.45 102.49 45.45 48.75
Kirks 233484 5w stock 30d




Due: 06/23/22 Pace RFQ# 421883
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
N
Sku Winning bid |lllinois Auto| Eldorado Gillig Suburban | Aftermarket | Prevost Vehicle Kirks Neopart | Mohawk Muncie
-NO BID Truck Parts Maintenance
NO # of Bids
5 40922 17.55 31.48 64.77 44.00 17.55 29.50
Mohawk 233486 stock stock stock Sw 60d
4 20708 104.92 117.72 111.10 104.92 122.43
Neopart 233485 - stock 6w stock 30d
2 30421 127.98 127.98 132.00
Gillig 233482 - stock 60d
30023 -
3 20727 311.45 342.53 322.73 311.45
Muncie 233487 - 12w 10w 60d
6 41332 429.66 475.00 455.42 429.66 571.46 520.39 545.45
Availability -
Aftermarket Parts 233483 - 20w stock 75d 10w 21d 30d
- 30483 -

110003




Due: 06/23/22 Pace RFQ# 421883
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
I A I O
Sku Winning bid |lllinois Auto| Eldorado Gillig Suburban | Aftermarket | Prevost Vehicle Kirks Neopart | Mohawk Muncie
-NO BID Truck Parts Maintenance
NO # of Bids
410001 1,246.10 1,282.62 1,246.10 1,538.03 1,255.00
Neopart 233485 - stock stock 4w stock
410002 1,255.00 1,282.62 1,263.62| 1,538.03| 1,255.00
Muncie 233487 - 5w stock 4w stock
410010 140.96 140.96 352.41 146.52 196.30 142.68 148.98
unapproved
Gillig 233482 - stock stock stock stock part stock
110014 117.41 117.41 130.08 122.22
Gillig 233482 - 8w stock 60d
310008 96.42 109.12 109.24 96.42 103.12
Neopart 233485 - 8w 13w 4w 90d
210013 348.48 348.48
Muncie 233487 - 60d

110026




Due: 06/23/22 Pace RFQ# 421883
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid |lllinois Auto| Eldorado Gillig Suburban | Aftermarket | Prevost Vehicle Kirks Neopart | Mohawk Muncie
-NO BID Truck Parts Maintenance

NO # of Bids

3 310028 3,942.48 3,942.48 5,013.05 4,402.40
Gillig 233482 - 20w 14w 60d

6 410080 350.00 350.00 376.78 440.19 370.24 350.50 363.50

unapproved

Gillig 233482 - stock 8w 75d 3w part 21d

1 410103 33.33 33.33
Aftermarket Parts 233483 - stock




	421883

