
due 04/08/2022 1:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid MW Bus CBM Kirks Interstate 

Power
Coffman Neopart Gillig Vehicle 

Maintenance
Suburban 

Truck
Crossline 

Supply
Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Mohawk Eldorado

                                    6 130684 5.49                         10.15             6.95             5.49           12.69             6.60             6.56 

Coffman 233336 -                  7d  stock  stock  stock  30d  4w 

                                    1 110135 39.14                      39.14 

Eldorado 233330 -                  8w 

                                    8 120488 15.25                      15.25           19.48           18.13           19.48           16.75           20.49           18.99           18.35 

CBM 233343 -                  stock  3w  90d  stock  30d  5w  30d  stock 

                                    1 120553 251.60                  251.60 

Eldorado 233330  12w 

                                    5 1210002 27.16                      29.78           27.45           27.16           33.69           27.33 

Availability - Muncie 233332 -                  30d  90d  90d  stock  6w 

                                    9 1210003 20.22                      35.78           20.92           22.75           22.17           37.50           20.22           30.88           26.60           22.32 

Vehicle Maintenance 233337 -                  stock  3w  stock  6w  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    4 1010001 8.75                         11.87             8.75             9.18           11.11 

Gillig 233328 -                  10d  stock  stock  30d 

                                     - 1010005 -                 

-                 

                                    7 1010011 959.00                  959.00     1,396.43     1,227.20     1,206.84     1,786.14     1,430.30     1,104.00 

Kirks 233335 -                  stock  stock  10d  stock  6w  30d  7w 

                                    7 1010012 1,244.00           1,244.00     1,994.79     1,512.11     1,481.43     2,633.76     1,689.05     1,275.00 

Kirks 233335  stock stock  10d  stock  5w  30d  stock 

                                    2 1210016 1,500.00           2,706.83     1,500.00 

Eldorado 233330  18w  20w 

Pace RFQ# 421759a



due 04/08/2022 1:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid MW Bus CBM Kirks Interstate 

Power
Coffman Neopart Gillig Vehicle 

Maintenance
Suburban 

Truck
Crossline 

Supply
Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Mohawk Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421759a

                                    7 1010015 998.00                  998.00     1,523.38     1,282.40     1,290.46     1,931.60     1,465.99     1,065.25 

Kirks 233335  stock stock  10d  stock  stock  45d  stock 

                                    2 1010016 2,503.86           2,503.86     3,123.24 

Coffman 233336 90d  7w 

                                    3 1210020 46.86                      46.86         187.33           81.56 

Gillig 233328 -                  stock  stock  5w 

                                    1 1310009 83.01                      83.01 

Eldorado 233330  stock 

                                    5 1010025 3.25                           3.25             9.04           10.46           10.80             7.83 

Kirks 233335  stock stock  stock  30d 
 unapproved 

part 

                                    1 1010027 36.31                      36.31 

Eldorado 233330 -                  stock 

                                    6 1010028 5.99                           5.99           12.74           12.50           16.33           15.72             6.36 

Kirks 233335 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  30d 
 unapproved 

part 

                                    2 1210047 1.82                         59.93             1.82 

Eldorado 233330 -                  MOQ  stock 

                                    2 1210048 0.68                           0.68             1.82 

Aftermarket Parts 233334 -                  8w  stock 

                                    6 1010032 55.00                    118.92           78.67         143.13           55.00         147.87           70.50 

Crossline 233341 -                  stock  stock  6w  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                    4 1010034 32.21                      45.76           58.56           54.54           32.21 

Coffman 233336 -                  stock  stock  30d 
 unapproved 

part 



due 04/08/2022 1:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid MW Bus CBM Kirks Interstate 

Power
Coffman Neopart Gillig Vehicle 

Maintenance
Suburban 

Truck
Crossline 

Supply
Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Mohawk Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421759a

                                    1 1110002 78.86                      78.86 

Eldorado 233330 -                  stock 

                                    7 1210070 49.00                      52.56           54.14           63.99           49.00           66.23           66.96           56.02 

Availability - Coffman 233336 -                  stock  4w  4w  45d  6w  30d  7w 

                                    3 1010044 217.35                  221.42         275.32         217.35 

Muncie 233332 -                  stock  5w  stock 

                                    3 1010049 1,575.30           1,777.28     1,575.30     2,286.56 

Neopart 233329 -                  90d  10d  9w 

                                    2 1010050 4,340.30           4,340.30     5,929.06 

Coffman 233336 -                  stock  6w 

                                    3 1010067 201.91                  201.91         256.10         240.04 

Coffman 233336 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 1010068 605.00                  605.00     1,206.94     1,279.81 

Kirks 233335 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                    1 1210130 1,500.00           1,500.00 

Eldorado 233330 -                  30w 

                                    1 1210133 142.55                  142.55 

Aftermarket Parts 233334 -                  4w 

                                    1 1110006 47.79                      47.79 

Aftermarket Parts 233334 -                  12w 

                                     - 1210152 -                 

-                 



due 04/08/2022 1:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid MW Bus CBM Kirks Interstate 

Power
Coffman Neopart Gillig Vehicle 

Maintenance
Suburban 

Truck
Crossline 

Supply
Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Mohawk Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421759a

                                    1 1210078 1,500.00           1,500.00 

Eldorado 233330 -                  30w 

                                    1 1210150 214.19                  214.19 

Eldorado 233330 -                  stock 

                                    1 130782 102.62                  102.62 

Eldorado 233330 -                  6w 

                                    1 1010007 168.09                  168.09 

Eldorado 233330 -                  stock 

1210081 155.96                  155.96 

Eldorado 233330 -                  6w 

                                    1 1210134 560.32                  560.32 

Eldorado 233330 -                  8w 

                                    1 1210069 205.97                  205.97 

Eldorado 233330 -                  stock 


	421759a

