
due 04/08/2022 
11:00 AM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid MW Bus - 

NO BID
CBM Kirks Interstate 

Power
Gillig Neopart Coffman Crossline 

Supply
Aftermarket 

Parts
Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie Mohawk Suburban 
Truck

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Eldorado

                                    1 81297 80.60                      80.60 

Eldorado 233330 -                  stock 

                                    1 81423 49.66                      49.66 

Eldorado 233330 -                  stock 

                                    8 81521 17.86                      36.65           20.56           19.45           19.75           23.26           17.86           19.10           20.56 

Availability - Mohawk 233333 -                  stock  4w  stock  90d  3w  60d  stock  3w 

                                    1 810000 71.58                      71.58 

Eldorado 233330  stock 

                                    1 810374 173.55                  173.55 

Aftermarket Parts 2333334 -                  7w 

                                    6 81262 5.79                         10.55             6.83             6.25             6.42             5.79             7.30 

Muncie 233332 -                  stock  4w  90d  4w  21d  30d 

                                    5 81298 53.00                      59.10           63.00           61.77           53.00           71.88 

Hydraulic Electric 233338 -                  stock  90d 
 no lead 

time 30d  stock 

                                    5 81343 7.87                           7.87           25.30           32.55           29.99             8.29 

Kirks 233335 -                  stock  stock  4w  30d 
 unapproved  

part 

                                    1 81366 133.03                  133.03 

Eldorado 233330 -                  stock 

                                    4 81422 1.60                           2.16             2.75             2.58             1.60 

Availability - Coffman 233336  stock  7w  30d  6w 

                                    4 81431 992.00              1,250.45         992.00     1,608.76     1,479.50 

Crossline 233341  stock  stock  5w  21d 

Pace RFQ# 421758



due 04/08/2022 
11:00 AM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid MW Bus - 

NO BID
CBM Kirks Interstate 

Power
Gillig Neopart Coffman Crossline 

Supply
Aftermarket 

Parts
Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie Mohawk Suburban 
Truck

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421758

                                    5 81444 59.40                      71.00           73.44           80.75           77.90           59.40 

Mohawk 233333 stock  6w  8w  60d  stock 

                                    4 81498 655.95                  655.95         765.00         878.08         774.18 

Coffman 233336  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    4 81503 10.97                      21.32           27.28           26.05           10.97 

Coffman 233336 -                  stock  stock  21d 
 unapproved 

part 

                                    4 81516 10.61                      10.61           12.41           11.50           12.72 

Coffman 233336  stock  stock  21d  6w 

                                    7 81519 65.00                      75.20           65.00           81.25         116.47           79.00           88.42           93.34 

Kirks 233335  stock  stock stock  stock  30d  stock  stock 

                                    2 810026 976.78                  976.78     1,217.69 

Coffman 233336 -                  stock  9w 

                                    2 810027 561.37                  561.37         702.03 

Coffman 233336 -                  stock  9w 

                                    5 810030 1.39                           3.75             2.50             3.23             3.02             1.39 

Coffman 233336 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                    3 810048 20.07                      20.07           20.29           22.49 

Coffman 233336 -                  stock  7w  45d 

                                    2 810061 3,603.46           3,603.46     4,506.34 

Coffman 233336 -                  90d  9w 

                                    2 810064 4,427.93           4,579.65     4,427.93 

Aftermarket Parts 233334 -                  90d  8w 



due 04/08/2022 
11:00 AM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid MW Bus - 

NO BID
CBM Kirks Interstate 

Power
Gillig Neopart Coffman Crossline 

Supply
Aftermarket 

Parts
Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie Mohawk Suburban 
Truck

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421758

                                    4 810070 734.04                  920.00         734.04     1,347.44     1,233.74 

Coffman 233336 -                  stock  90d  7w  6w 

                                    3 810075 268.56                  268.56         336.72         318.75 

Coffman 233336 -                  stock  stock  21d 

                                    3 810076 133.99                  133.99         157.65         143.89 

Coffman 233336 -                  stock  5w  30d 

                                    4 810078 431.48                  492.14         431.48         555.12         527.65 

Coffman 233336 -                  stock  stock  stock  30d 

                                    3 810079 428.08                  431.48         593.29         428.08 

Muncie 233332 -                  stock  7w  stock 

                                    3 810084 645.00                  645.00         825.03     1,059.21 

Neopart 233329 -                  3w  stock  6w 

                                    6 810093 17.99                      17.99           35.38           32.00           42.02           20.00           29.37 

Kirks 233335 -                  stock  stock  stock  7w  stock  30d 

                                    4 810098 263.20                  263.20         334.89         309.22         353.87 

Coffman 233336 -                  stock  stock  30d  7w 

                                    3 810110 1,420.52           1,471.47     1,420.52     1,595.70 

Aftermarket Parts 233334 -                  stock  stock  21d 

                                    3 810130 431.48                  431.48         555.12         520.85 

Coffman 233336 -                  stock  5w  30d 

                                    6 810155 199.00                  303.68         264.00         359.82         199.00         332.40         343.72 

Hydraulic Electric 233338 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  21d  7w 



due 04/08/2022 
11:00 AM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid MW Bus - 

NO BID
CBM Kirks Interstate 

Power
Gillig Neopart Coffman Crossline 

Supply
Aftermarket 

Parts
Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie Mohawk Suburban 
Truck

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421758

                                    3 810167 58.99                      58.99           76.76           91.08 

Gillig 233328 -                  2w  stock  stock 

                                    3 810197 164.95                  164.95         189.38         174.65 

Coffman 233336 -                  stock  7w  30d 

                                    4 810216 4.01                           4.48             5.75             5.28             4.01 

Vehicle Maintenance 233337 -                  stock  9w  21d  stock 

                                    3 810220 452.92                  452.92         569.66         620.55 

Coffman 233336 -                  stock  5w  30d 

                                    3 810230 3.65                           3.65             4.22             4.02 

Coffman 233336 -                  stock  5w  30d 

                                    5 810232 376.90                  405.13         431.48         376.90         558.39         516.15 

Crossline 233341 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    8 810271 34.75                      42.00           82.61           88.00           97.30           37.99           88.95           96.98           34.75 

Vehicle Maintenance 233337 -                  stock  1w  stock  8w  stock  30d  7w  stock 


	421758

