due 04/08/2022

11:00 AM Pace RFQ# 421757
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
N
Sku Winning bid | Battery | Interstate Kirks Gillig Neopart Vehicle P&G Mohawk | Kirks - NO | Aftermarket | Muncie Coffman | Eldorado
NO # of Bids Service Power Maintenance BID Parts
- 71038 -
1 71486 10.25 10.25
Eldorado 233330 - stock
1 710004 25.87 25.87
Eldorado 233330 - stock
- 710047 -
NLA
2 71733 78.99 82.66 78.99
Muncie 233332 - stock stock
3 71875 5.25 5.35 5.25 10.25
Aftermarket Parts 233334 - stock 7w stock
4 72121 55.00 55.00 69.88 63.29 100.92
Gillig 233328 - 8w 5w 45d 6w
3 72057 3.37 3.37 13.92 4.73
Vehicle Maintenance 233337 - stock stock stock
5 72143 10.50 10.50 11.57 11.13 12.12 23.70
Availability -
Aftermarket Parts 233334 - 4w 8w stock 45d stock




due 04/08/2022

11:00 AM Pace RFQ# 421757
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
N
Sku Winning bid | Battery | Interstate Kirks Gillig Neopart Vehicle P&G Mohawk | Kirks - NO | Aftermarket | Muncie Coffman | Eldorado

NO # of Bids Service Power Maintenance BID Parts

4 70583 9.70 29.29 19.50 14.81 9.70
Muncie 233332 stock 5w stock stock

4 71178 0.04 0.12 0.04 0.05 0.20
Mohawk 233333 5d stock stock stock

5 71103 0.28 2.04 2.50 0.28 0.51 0.53
Mohawk 233333 10d stock stock stock stock

4 71100 0.09 1.16 0.11 0.09 0.10
Availability - Muncie 233332 10d stock 4w stock

5 72135 57.63 57.63 64.71 61.04 68.79 107.64
Gillig 233328 - 12w 8w 4w 30d 8w

4 71175 0.56 4.45 1.70 0.56 0.70
Mohawk 233333 10d stock stock stock

5 71179 0.50 3.42 1.45 0.53 0.50 0.82
Aftermarket Parts 233334 10d stock stock stock stock

5 72094 16.91 16.91 25.50 20.95 23.23 27.99
Vehicle Maintenance 233337 - stock 3w 5w 30d stock

4 71278 0.90 1.58 1.19 1.17 0.90
Muncie 233332 - stock 5w stock stock




due 04/08/2022

11:00 AM Pace RFQ# 421757
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
N
Sku Winning bid | Battery | Interstate Kirks Gillig Neopart Vehicle P&G Mohawk | Kirks - NO | Aftermarket | Muncie Coffman | Eldorado

NO # of Bids Service Power Maintenance BID Parts

3 70582 5.49 13.85 6.71 5.49

unapproved

Muncie 233332 - part stock stock

1 71001 0.48 0.48

- MoQ

2 72170 21.77 31.40 21.77
Eldorado 233330 - stock Eldorado

3 72238 1,672.86 1,800.00 2,496.97 1,672.86
Eldorado 233330 - 8w 14w 6w

3 72301 285.50 285.50 450.00 328.43
Battery Service 233339 - 1w stock 5w

5 72378 197.67 197.67 334.69 223.93 220.20 311.29
Gillig 233328 - stock 10w stock 60d stock

3 72382 307.35 350.00 307.35 421.15
Aftermarket Parts 233334 - 8w 15w 8w

1 710044 205.15 205.15
Eldorado 233330 - stock

4 710046 31.95 37.11 36.73 31.95 36.41
Muncie 233332 - stock 9w stock stock




due 04/08/2022

11:00 AM Pace RFQ# 421757
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
N
Sku Winning bid | Battery | Interstate Kirks Gillig Neopart Vehicle P&G Mohawk | Kirks - NO | Aftermarket | Muncie Coffman | Eldorado

NO # of Bids Service Power Maintenance BID Parts

4 710057 50.24 62.85 64.29 58.90 50.24
Coffman 233336 - 6w 13w 30d stock

1 710097 63.34 63.34
Eldorado 233330 - stock

3 710115 27.75 27.75 73.60 57.07
Vehicle Maintenance 233337 - stock 5w stock

5 710120 404.04 467.00 446.42 404.04 493.95 448.99
P&G 233340 - 90d 12w stock 10w 30d

4 710168 430.77 475.00 483.67 430.77 535.16
P&G 233340 - 90d 6w stock 7w

4 710281 41.52 59.29 60.24 55.59 41.52
Eldorado 233330 - 3w 5w 21d stock

3 710292 20.90 24.64 20.90 35.58
Muncie 233332 - 5w 30d 8w

- 710366 -

3 710380 669.82 852.26 796.96 669.82
Coffman 233336 - stock 60d stock




due 04/08/2022

11:00 AM Pace RFQ# 421757
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0
N
Sku Winning bid | Battery | Interstate Kirks Gillig Neopart Vehicle P&G Mohawk | Kirks - NO | Aftermarket | Muncie Coffman | Eldorado
NO # of Bids Service Power Maintenance BID Parts
710384 650.21 832.14 650.21
Coffman 233336 - 5w 90d




	421757

