
due 04/08/2022 
10:00 AM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid MW Bus - 

NO BID
CBM Interstate 

Power
Kirks Coffman Neopart Gillig Vehicle 

Maintenance
Eldorado Suburban 

Truck
Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 

Parts
Hydraulic 
Electric

                                    1 60770 84.41                      84.41 

Eldorado 233330 -                  2w 

                                    1 60772 26.81                      26.81 

Eldorado 233330 -                  stock 

                                    1 810000 53.69                      53.69 

Eldorado 233330 -                  stock 

                                    1 610036 7,600.00           7,600.00 

 12w 

                                    1 610083 855.83                  855.83 

Eldorado 233330 -                  4w 

                                    1 610087 8,682.00           8,682.00 

-                  stock 

                                    1 610102 1,292.00           1,292.00 

Eldorado 233330 -                  4w 

                                    3 60734 2.40                           4.06             2.82             2.40 
Availability - Vehicle 
Maintenenac 233337 -                  stock  stock  30d 

                                    5 60386 2.85                           7.10             4.97             2.85             5.05             5.70 

Availability - Gillig 233328 -                  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  21d  stock 

                                    7 60494 10.98                      12.38           10.98           19.71           12.38           11.32           11.68           12.03 
Availability - 
Suburban Truck 233331  10d 90d  stock  stock  4w  30d  3w 

Pace RFQ# 421756



due 04/08/2022 
10:00 AM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid MW Bus - 

NO BID
CBM Interstate 

Power
Kirks Coffman Neopart Gillig Vehicle 

Maintenance
Eldorado Suburban 

Truck
Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 

Parts
Hydraulic 
Electric

Pace RFQ# 421756

                                    3 60723 26.45                      42.66           26.45           29.86 

Muncie 233332  4w  46d  10w 

                                    4 60085 13.80                      55.00           13.80           15.11           16.76 

Mohawk 233333  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    1 60742 4.53                           4.53 

Eldorado 233330  2w 

                                    4 610014 13.58                      14.75           15.17           13.58           19.52 

Muncie 233332 -                  stock  stock  stock  7w 

                                    3 610025 34.32                      34.32           40.36           43.66 

Coffman 233336 stock  stock  stock 

                                    9 610026 120.00                  154.06         132.00         326.95         167.32         125.94         172.17         168.39         129.44         120.00 

Hydraulic Electric 233338  stock  stock stock  4w  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock  stock 

                                    6 610031 26.00                      44.24           26.00           30.68           37.81           30.83           38.94 

Kirks 233335 -                  stock  stock  stock  5w  stock  stock 

                                    3 610032 2.38                           2.38             2.58             2.63 

Coffman 233336 -                  stock  30d  9w 

                                    5 610055 12.40                      41.77           51.57           12.40           49.30           53.93 

Coffman 233336 -                  stock  4w 
 unapproved 

part  30d  7w 

                                    4 610064 86.08                      86.08         108.57         101.30         110.81 

Coffman 233336 -                  stock  5w  30d  stock 



due 04/08/2022 
10:00 AM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid MW Bus - 

NO BID
CBM Interstate 

Power
Kirks Coffman Neopart Gillig Vehicle 

Maintenance
Eldorado Suburban 

Truck
Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 

Parts
Hydraulic 
Electric

Pace RFQ# 421756

                                    1 610082 7.80                           7.80 

Eldorado 233330 -                  2w 

                                    3 610118 30.48                      30.48           35.88           39.23 

Coffman 233336 -                  stock  30d  4w 


	421756

