due 04/08/2022 10:00

AM Pace RFQ# 421754

WHITE=NO BID

TOTAL

Sku Winning bid Gillig MW Bus- CBM Neopart | Eldorado | Suburban Muncie Mohawk | Aftermarket
NO # of Bids NO BID Truck Parts
20705 42.55 69.29 42.55 48.00
Mohawk 233333 - 45d stock stock
30357 57.93 59.59 57.93
Aftermarket Parts 233334 - 60d stock
30014 3.10 4.13 6.00 6.64 4.82 3.10 4.24
Mohawk 233333 - stock stock stock 30d stock 5w
40504 1.05 2.04 1.49 3.30 1.25 1.05 1.59
Mohawk 233333 stock MOQ stock stock stock Sw
41238 97.76 99.15 97.76 100.60 100.95 103.61
Neopart 233329 - stock 4w 21d 5w stock
40798 108.74 120.70 109.86 150.00 108.74 125.90 157.86 118.88
Suburban Truck 233331 - 4w stock stock stock 21d 3w 7w
30361 7.28 8.91 9.15 11.00 7.64 7.30 7.28




due 04/08/2022 10:00
AM

Pace

RFQ# 421754

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
Sku Winning bid Gillig MW Bus- CBM Neopart | Eldorado | Suburban Muncie Mohawk | Aftermarket
NO # of Bids NO BID Truck Parts
Aftermarket Parts 233334 - stock MOQ stock stock stock stock
5 41132 49.75 98.64 130.00 113.03 49.75 108.96
Mohawk 233333 - 4w 4w 60d 3w 9w
1 30411 256.03 256.03
Eldorado 233330 - 4w
1 10417 599.04 599.04
Eldorado 233330 stock
1 10420 6.84 6.84
Eldorado 233330 1w
7 30181 23.20 24.94 36.17 60.00 38.41 23.87 44.76 23.20
Availability - Muncie 233332 aw stock stock stock stock stock 13w
6 41332 290.34 488.28 549.32 400.00 631.20 461.39 290.34
unapproved
Eldorado 233330 l6w 12w 4w 30d 4w part




due 04/08/2022 10:00

AM Pace RFQ# 421754

WHITE=NO BID

TOTAL

Sku Winning bid Gillig MW Bus- CBM Neopart | Eldorado | Suburban Muncie Mohawk | Aftermarket
NO # of Bids NO BID Truck Parts
110003 337.89 337.89
Eldorado 233330 - 8w
110004 137.12 137.12
Eldorado 233330 stock
410001 882.88 882.88| 1,380.00 913.40| 1,413.03 951.56
Neopart 233329 stock stock 30d 4w stock
410002 903.32 903.32| 1,380.00 913.40| 1,413.03 951.56
Neopart 233329 - stock stock 30d 4w stock
410006 101.76 200.00 223.17 240.00 238.70 101.76 229.45
unapproved
Gillig 233328 - 4w 8w 4w stock part stock
410010 127.90 146.60 182.36 195.00 151.20 127.90 150.24
unapproved
Gillig 233328 - 4w stock stock stock part stock
210002 460.79 460.79




due 04/08/2022 10:00

AM Pace RFQ# 421754
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
Sku Winning bid Gillig MW Bus- CBM Neopart | Eldorado | Suburban Muncie Mohawk | Aftermarket

NO # of Bids NO BID Truck Parts
Eldorado 233330 - aw

1 110006 337.89 337.89
Eldorado 233330 - stock

5 310008 93.60 109.12 93.60 199.63 103.12 112.05
Neopart 233329 - aw stock aw stock 10w

5 410034 234.89 250.00 234.89 242.80 312.23 268.63
Neopart 233329 - aw aw 30d 3w stock

1 110027 1.75 1.75
Eldorado 233330 - 1w

1 310031 267.55 267.55
Eldorado 233330 - stock

7 410080 304.84 350.00 323.54 380.00 425.38 360.60 304.84 382.31

unapproved

Availability - Neopart 233329 - aw stock stock stock 21d part 8w




due 04/08/2022 10:00

AM Pace RFQ# 421754
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
Sku Winning bid Gillig MW Bus- CBM Neopart | Eldorado | Suburban Muncie Mohawk | Aftermarket

NO # of Bids NO BID Truck Parts

1 310049 3.15 3.15
Eldorado 233330 - stock

1 410122 16.23 16.23
Aftermarket Parts 233334 - 9w

3 310060 157.57 157.57 169.12 221.56
Availability - Mohawk 233333 - 45d stock 3w

4 210040 24.04 76.50 47.90 24.04 76.49
Availability -
Aftermarket Parts 233334 - stock 70d 14w stock




	421754

