DUE: 03/23/22

11:00 AM Pace RFQ# 421728
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid Vehicle Rome CBM Suburban | Prevost- | MW Bus | Interstate Kirks Neopart | Crossline | Mohawk Muncie Gillig Coffman | Aftermarket | Hydraulic
Maintenance | Tryck - NO Truck NO BID Power Parts Electric
NO # of Bids BID
5 130684 5.94 6.43 5.94 6.20 6.15 14.29
Mohawk 233284 - stock stock 30d stock 8w
7 130581 42.90 51.00 55.72 48.86 53.10 48.25 42.90 60.44
Coffman 233293 - 7d stock 3w stock stock stock stock
4 110113 16.54 16.54 32.65 27.43 36.05
Mohawk 233284 - stock 21d stock 5w
8 130611 175.00 175.00 287.48 214.00 262.03 266.06 245.61 311.73 205.00
unapproved
MW Bus 233303 7d stock stock part stock stock stock stock
- 110135 -
10 120488 14.42 17.17 14.42 19.48 19.48 25.00 18.35 18.08 18.13 25.39 17.00
bid 19,
CBM 233282 - stock stock stock 10d need 96 stock 21d 2w stock 45d
1 100225 230.94 230.94
Aftermarket Parts 233289 - 8w
9 1210003 20.22 20.22 31.55 21.77 24.45 26.06 40.63 22.75 30.88 21.00
Vehicle Maintenance 233291 - stock stock stock stock stock stock stock stock 45d
- 1010005 -
2 1010004 228.57 228.57 259.55
Coffman 233293 90d 4w
6 1010012 1,250.00 1,455.21 1,250.00| 1,512.11 1,280.00 2,180.10| 2,649.08
unapproved
Kirks 233292 part stock 10d stock stock 5w
6 1010014 2.80 7.11 2.80 8.13 2.99 9.83 12.43




DUE: 03/23/22

11:00 AM Pace RFQ# 421728
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid Vehicle Rome CBM Suburban | Prevost- | MW Bus | Interstate Kirks Neopart | Crossline | Mohawk Muncie Gillig Coffman | Aftermarket | Hydraulic
Maintenance | Tryck - NO Truck NO BID Power Parts Electric
NO # of Bids BID
Muncie - incorrect
shipment pending
review from low unapproved
bidder 233290 stock stock part stock stock stock
1010015 988.00 1,267.22 988.00| 1,282.40 1,045.00 1,523.38| 1,904.23
unapproved
Kirks 233292 part stock 10d stock stock 13w
1010016 2,503.86 2,503.86| 3,123.24
Coffman 233293 - 90d 7w
1210024 180.02 180.02
Aftermarket Parts 233289 stock
1010027 -
1010030 87.32 100.11 95.00 87.32 112.14 133.33 101.86 126.66
unapproved
Crossline 233302 - stock stock part stock 2w stock stock
1010032 50.00 79.39 55.00 72.50 130.00 118.93 147.87 50.00
unapproved
Hydraulic Electric 233304 - stock stock part stock stock stock 14d
1010038 24.00 24.75 24.00 31.97 60.60 66.25 35.10 64.78
unapproved
Crossline 233302 - stock stock part 30d stock stock stock
1110002 -
1210069 -
1010060 2,807.02 2,909.90 2,807.02| 3,546.29
Coffman 233293 - 30d 90d 9w




DUE: 03/23/22

11:00 AM Pace RFQ# 421728
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- . . ' [ [ | ' | | [ | [ [ | | |
Sku Winning bid Vehicle Rome CBM Suburban | Prevost- | MW Bus | Interstate Kirks Neopart | Crossline | Mohawk Muncie Gillig Coffman | Aftermarket | Hydraulic
Maintenance | Tryck - NO Truck NO BID Power Parts Electric

NO # of Bids BID

7 1010061 964.00 1,104.45 964.00 1,067.20 1,068.00 1,520.20 1,272.16 1,586.86

unapproved

Kirks 233292 - part stock 10d 3w 30d stock 9w

5 1010068 512.97 619.00 875.00 837.56 1,200.63 512.97

unapproved

Kirks 233292 - stock stock stock stock part

3 1010070 518.13 620.20 518.13 666.60
Coffman 233293 - 65d stock 5w

- 1210130 -

3 1010075 98.42 122.66 98.42 122.38
Coffman 233293 - 30d stock 5w

4 1010097 305.51 308.00 365.49 305.51 379.89
Coffman 233293 - stock 30d 90d 6w

- 130782 -

- 120553 -

- 1010007 -

1 810143 9.78 9.78
Coffman 233293 - stock

- 1210078 -

1210081




DUE: 03/23/22

11:00 AM Pace RFQ# 421728
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid Vehicle Rome CBM Suburban | Prevost- | MW Bus | Interstate Kirks Neopart | Crossline | Mohawk Muncie Gillig Coffman | Aftermarket | Hydraulic
Maintenance | Tryck - NO Truck NO BID Power Parts Electric
NO # of Bids BID
610134 122.42 122.42
Coffman 233293 - 90d
1210134 -
1010092 -

1210150




	421728

