
DUE:  03/23/22 1:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Suburban 
Truck

Prevost CBM Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Kirks A&A Auto Crossline Mohawk Neopart Coffman Gillig Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie

                                     - 81297 -                 

-                 

                                    4 81089 1.37                           1.37             4.26             5.48             5.09 

Coffman 233293 -                 
 unapproved 

part  stock  5w  30d 

                                    3 81311 116.23                  116.23         149.62         136.77 

Coffman 233293 -                  stock  5w  45d 

                                    3 81378 18.59                      39.00           18.59           51.81 

Mohawk 233284  2w  21d  6w 

                                    4 81385 13.99                      15.32           13.99           17.10           15.75 

Coffman 233293 -                  6w  stock  10w  30d 

                                     - 81423 -                 

-                 

                                    4 81422 1.58                           1.58             2.16             2.76             2.57 

Mohawk 233284 -                 stock  stock  7w  30d 

                                    5 81430 295.28                  295.28         392.58         310.82         400.14         365.75 

CBM 233282 -                  stock  5w  stock  5w  45d 

                                    6 81444 59.40                    109.23           59.40           74.80           71.00           80.75           79.19 

Mohawk 233284 -                  stock  stock  6w  stock  stock  60d 

                                 11 81520 8.08                           8.08           39.09           11.78           13.50           10.89           10.90           11.84           11.14           20.22           11.44           21.89 

Availability - Mohawk 233284  90d  75d  3w 
 bid 8, need 

48  4w  stock  stock  stock  stock  4w  45d 

                                 10 81521 17.86                      18.18           20.56           35.53           20.56           21.00           19.30           19.53           19.75           23.39           17.86 

Availability - Mohawk 233284  90d  6w  75d  3w  4w  stock  3w  7d  3w  30d 

                                    3 81534 24.39                      24.39           30.48           37.81 

A&A Auto 233301  2w 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

Pace RFQ# 421727



DUE:  03/23/22 1:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Suburban 
Truck

Prevost CBM Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Kirks A&A Auto Crossline Mohawk Neopart Coffman Gillig Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie

Pace RFQ# 421727

                                     - 810000 -                 

                                    1 810007 419.85                  419.85 

Aftermarket Parts 233289 -                  stock 

                                    2 810026 973.72                  973.72      1,224.69 

Coffman 233293  90d  9w 

                                    2 810027 559.60                  559.60         706.06 

Coffman 233293  stock  9w 

                                    6 810060 27.50                      29.00           27.50           32.40           39.57           50.64           32.00 

Crossline 233302 -                  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    2 810061 3,603.45            3,603.45      4,532.24 

Coffman 233293 -                  90d  9w 

                                    2 810064 4,427.93            4,579.65      4,427.93 

Availability - Coffman 233293 -                  stock  7w 

                                    5 810073 117.56                  139.38         117.56         153.88         147.02         118.05 

Coffman 233293 -                  4w  stock  6w  7w  stock 

                                    3 810084 645.00                  645.00         823.30      1,065.45 

Neopart 233288 -                  3w  stock  6w 

                                    4 810098 263.77                  334.87         263.77         336.84         309.22 

Coffman 233293 -                  stock  stock  stock  30d 

                                    4 810101 229.66                  263.68         230.80         291.96         229.66 

Muncie 233290 -                  4w  stock  6w  stock 

                                    4 810110 1,428.78            1,450.00      1,877.07      1,449.90      1,428.78 

Aftermarket Parts 233289 -                  stock  4w  stock  stock 



DUE:  03/23/22 1:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Suburban 
Truck

Prevost CBM Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Kirks A&A Auto Crossline Mohawk Neopart Coffman Gillig Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie

Pace RFQ# 421727

                                    4 810122 8.73                           8.73           29.55           38.04           34.80 

Coffman 233293 -                 
 unapproved 

part  stock  6w  20d 

                                    4 810125 41.37                      41.37         107.38         128.80         118.40 

Coffman 233293 -                 
 unapproved 

part  stock  7w  30d 

                                    2 810126 40.82                      40.82           44.58 

Coffman 233293 -                  90d  30d 

                                    4 810141 23.90                      23.90           65.97           78.05           49.49 

Muncie 233290 -                 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock  stock 

                                    4 810154 6.37                           6.37             8.95           11.45           10.95 

Coffman 233293 -                 
 unapproved 

part  stock  8w  30d 

                                    3 810179 49.90                      64.23           49.90           64.24 

Coffman 233293 -                  5w  stock  4w 

                                    4 810180 6.65                           9.83             6.65             8.71             7.92 

Coffman 233293 -                  5w  stock  stock  21d 

                                    3 810181 2.45                           2.45             3.15             2.94 

Coffman 233293 -                  stock  6w  30d 

                                    3 810209 22.30                      22.30           25.96           24.05 

Coffman 233293 -                  stock  5w  30d 

                                    3 810231 256.50                  256.50         299.02         279.88 

Coffman 233293 -                  stock  stock  30d 

                                    3 810239 4.46                           4.46             5.24             4.80 

Coffman 233293 -                  stock  5w  stock 

                                    3 810279 306.50                  355.87         306.50         394.57 

Coffman 233293 -                  5w  stock  7w 



DUE:  03/23/22 1:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Suburban 
Truck

Prevost CBM Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Kirks A&A Auto Crossline Mohawk Neopart Coffman Gillig Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie

Pace RFQ# 421727

                                    1 810284 617.14                  617.14 

Coffman 233293 -                  90d 

                                    4 810350 12.12                      18.91           12.12           15.60           14.30 

Coffman 233293 -                 
 unapproved 

part  stock  5w  30d 

                                    4 810393 57.21                      77.86           57.21           73.22           68.90 

Coffman 233293 -                  5w  90d  5w  30d 

                                    4 810394 1.93                           4.82             1.93             2.54             2.35 

Coffman 233293 -                  5w  stock  9w  30d 

                                    3 810395 13.96                      13.96           17.97           16.52 

Coffman 233293 -                  stock  9w  30d 

                                    4 810397 4.95                           5.59             4.95             6.37             5.85 

Coffman 233293 -                  stock  stock  stock  30d 

                                    1 810143 9.78                           9.78 

Coffman 233293 -                  stock 

                                     - 810374 -                 

-                 


	421727

