DUE: 03/23/22 1:00

PM Pace RFQ# 421725
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid Vehicle P&G Suburban | Prevost- | Interstate Kirks Battery Mohawk | Neopart | Aftermarket Gillig Muncie Eldorado
NO # of Bids Maintenance Truck NO BID Power Service Parts
2 71733 78.99 82.66 78.99
bid 4, need
Aftermarket Parts 233289 - stock 5
1 72125 80.62 80.62
Eldorado 233300 - 6w
3 71287 0.23 0.43 0.23 0.23
Mohawk 233284 - stock stock 8w
5 70220 7.65 7.65 18.21 15.25 13.15 37.18
Mohawk 233284 stock stock stock stock 1w
1 72133 68.21 68.21
Eldorado 233300 - 6w
4 71976 1.70 6.25 2.49 1.70 1.77
Aftermarket Parts 233289 - 5d stock stock stock
2 71357 12.39 12.39 17.32
unapproved
Eldorado 233300 - part 1w
5 72135 57.63 63.54 58.62 57.63 68.79 98.00
Gillig 233287 - 8w 10w 12w 80d 3w
3 72056 14.75 23.60 14.75 16.80
unapproved
Aftermarket Parts 233289 - stock part stock




DUE: 03/23/22 1:00

PM Pace RFQ# 421725
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
N
Sku Winning bid Vehicle P&G Suburban | Prevost- | Interstate Kirks Battery Mohawk | Neopart | Aftermarket Gillig Muncie Eldorado

NO # of Bids Maintenance Truck NO BID Power Service Parts

3 70730 0.15 0.43 0.15 0.87
Mohawk 233284 stock stock stock

1 72144 30.97 30.97
Eldorado 233300 4w

1 72163 496.45 496.45
Eldorado 233300 10w

4 72167 38.25 40.67 39.44 38.25 44.52
Gillig 233287 8w 13w 12w 42d

3 72184 5.39 5.39 6.42 21.66
Aftermarket Parts 233289 - stock stock 1w

1 72204 21.66 21.66
Eldorado 233300 1w

1 72222 21.66 21.66
Eldorado 233300 1w

3 72238 1,267.53 2,511.49 1,800.00 1,267.53
Eldorado 233300 - 14w 8w 10w

3 72301 225.00 225.00 285.50 330.32

unapproved

Battery Service 233297 - part 3w 5w




DUE: 03/23/22 1:00

PM Pace RFQ# 421725
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
-
Sku Winning bid Vehicle P&G Suburban | Prevost- | Interstate Kirks Battery Mohawk | Neopart | Aftermarket Gillig Muncie Eldorado

NO # of Bids Maintenance Truck NO BID Power Service Parts

1 710004 24.76 24.76
Eldorado 233300 - 6w

1 710008 192.52 192.52
Eldorado 233300 - Aw

1 710013 8.01 8.01
Eldorado 233300 - 6w

6 710043 276.83 276.83 305.00 399.38 335.57 325.00 314.95
P&G 233296 - stock stock 6w 15w 4w 30d

1 710105 1,014.98 1,014.98
Eldorado 233300 - 20w

1 710129 3,799.00 3,799.00
Eldorado 233300 - 20w

1 710130 140.94 140.94
Eldorado 233300 - 20w

1 710157 38.16 38.16
Eldorado 2333300 - 6w

3 710170 2,893.44 2,893.44 3,600.00 3,890.00
P&G 233296 - stock 6w 4w




DUE: 03/23/22 1:00

PM Pace RFQ# 421725
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
-
Sku Winning bid Vehicle P&G Suburban | Prevost- | Interstate Kirks Battery Mohawk | Neopart | Aftermarket Gillig Muncie Eldorado

NO # of Bids Maintenance Truck NO BID Power Service Parts

1 710271 40.43 40.43
Aftermarket Parts 233289 - 4w

1 710278 1,697.00 1,697.00
Eldorado 233300 - 20w

- 71038 -

1 72077 69.05 69.05
Eldorado 233300 - 6w

1 72185 13.75 13.75
Eldorado 233300 - Aw

4 72192 21.15 23.15 22.68 21.15 26.95
Muncie 233290 - stock 6w 30d 4w

2 72249 1.70 1.70 6.00
Muncie 233290 - stock aw

1 72366 237.55 237.55
Eldorado 233300 - 10w

- 710047 -




DUE: 03/23/22 1:00

PM Pace RFQ# 421725
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0
-
Sku Winning bid Vehicle P&G Suburban | Prevost- | Interstate Kirks Battery Mohawk | Neopart | Aftermarket Gillig Muncie Eldorado

NO # of Bids Maintenance Truck NO BID Power Service Parts

1 710200 318.02 318.02
Eldorado 233300 - 20w

1 710247 312.89 312.89
Eldorado 233300 - 20w

1 710297 205.35 205.35
Eldorado 233300 - 8w




	421725

