DUE: 03/23/22 3:00
PM Pace

WHITE=NO BID

TOTAL

RFQ# 421722

Sku Winning bid Vehicle Suburban | Prevost - CBM Transit Rome Interstate Kirks Muncie Coffman Neopart Gillig Mohawk | Aftermarket Hydraulic
Maintenance | Tryck NO BID Parts 101 | Truck-NO | Power Parts Electric -
NO # of Bids BID BID LATE
6 60494 10.98 12.38 12.38 11.68 10.98 11.39 12.10
no lead
Coffman 233293 - stock 10d 30d stock 30d given
6 60739 13.11 [ISHIN} 35.70 41.20 50.75 13.25 53.04
Vehicle Maintenance 233291 - stock stock 7d 4w 4w stock
2 60748 46.03 48.47 46.03
Aftermarket Parts 233289 - 60d stock
- 60770 -
- 60772 -
2 610009 2.49 521 2.49
Aftermarket Parts 233289 - 30d stock
3 610025 34.32 40.36 34.32 43,91
Coffman 233293 - 30d stock 7w
8 610026 125.94 125.94 139.63 135.00 168.39 326.94 165.84 172.17 130.20
Suburban Truck 233281 - stock stock stock stock 7d 4w 45d 19w
6 610031 26.00 40.48 26.00 30.83 30.62 40.61 39.16
Kirks 233292 - stock stock stock stock 28d stock
4 610033 600.00 600.00 739.49 1,220.15 985.99
Kirks 233292 stock stock 4w 5w
- 610036 -
2 610050 23.23 23.23 32.04




DUE: 03/23/22 3:00

PM Pace RFQ# 421722
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- . 4 ' . [ [ J ' | [ [ [ | [ | |
Sku Winning bid Vehicle Suburban | Prevost - CBM Transit Rome Interstate Kirks Muncie Coffman Neopart Gillig Mohawk | Aftermarket Hydraulic
Maintenance | Tryck NO BID Parts 101 | Truck-NO | Power Parts Electric -

NO # of Bids BID BID LATE
Vehicle Maintenance 233291 stock stock

3 610058 45.01 100.22 45.01 313.50

unapproved

Gillig 233287 AW part 5w

- 610083 =

- 610087 =

4 610097 246.00 257.90 249.49 246.00 313.50
Gillig 233287 3w stock stock stock

- 610102 =

4 610111 35.47 38.15 35.47 38.18 44.27
Coffman 233293 - 30d stock 30d 9w

3 610121 72.63 86.42 72.63 92.95
Coffman 233293 - 30d stock 4w

4 610126 12.20 27.22 23.95 12.20 29.27
Mohawk 233284 - 30d stock stock 5w

4 610139 72.02 85.69 72.02 84.83 92.17
Coffman 233293 - 30d stock 3w 7w

1 610174 29.26 29.26
Aftermarket Parts 233289 - 8w

1 610175 30.38 30.38




DUE: 03/23/22 3:00

PM Pace RFQ# 421722
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- . 4 ' . [ [ J ' | [ [ [ | [ | |
Sku Winning bid Vehicle Suburban | Prevost - CBM Transit Rome Interstate Kirks Muncie Coffman Neopart Gillig Mohawk | Aftermarket Hydraulic
Maintenance | Tryck NO BID Parts 101 | Truck-NO | Power Parts Electric -

NO # of Bids BID BID LATE
Aftermarket Parts 233289 - 2w

2 610176 30.37 36.10 30.37
Aftermarket Parts 233289 - 30d 2w

1 610177 33.53 33.53
Aftermarket Parts 233289 - stock

1 610178 51.74 51.74
Aftermarket Parts 233289 - stock

1 610179 29.85 29.85
Aftermarket Parts 233289 - 8w

1 610180 43.39 43.39
Aftermarket Parts 233289 - 5w

1 610164 122.42 122.42
Coffman 233293 - stock




	421722

