DUE: 03/23/22 3:00

PM Pace RFQ# 421721
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
[N I A A N O
Sku Winning bid Vehicle Suburban | Prevost CBM Rome Kirks - NO | Mohawk Gillig Neopart | Aftermarket | Muncie
Maintenance Truck Truck - NO BID Parts
NO # of Bids BID
41131 49.75 107.94 49.75 98.64 106.48 113.50
Mohawk 233284 - stock stock stock 9w 60d
40109 0.30 2.51 0.30 2.25 1.79 1.07 2.20
Mohawk 233284 - stock stock stock stock stock stock
41217 91.71 144.17 142.63 104.36 91.71 113.44
Aftermarket Parts 233289 - stock 75d stock stock 21d
41227 14.00 31.63 36.73 14.00 25.99 45.66 48.19 23.40
Mohawk 233284 stock stock stock stock 3w stock stock
30361 7.30 12.80 7.30 8.91 9.15 7.46 7.88
Mohawk 233284 - stock stock stock MoQ stock stock
40079 8.10 36.16 18.63 8.10 13.57 17.40 18.75 18.31
Mohawk 233284 - stock 75d stock stock stock stock 21d
41205 0.95 0.95 1.09 3.56 0.96 1.01 1.10
Suburban Truck 233281 - stock 75d stock stock stock 21d
40134 25.25 58.60 97.95 25.25 74.91 59.68 65.56 82.88




DUE: 03/23/22 3:00

PM Pace RFQ# 421721
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid Vehicle Suburban | Prevost CBM Rome Kirks - NO | Mohawk Gillig Neopart | Aftermarket | Muncie
Maintenance Truck Truck - NO BID Parts
NO # of Bids BID
CBM 233282 - stock 155d stock stock stock 18w stock
7 40596 0.46 2.30 2.09 0.46 1.89 1.94 1.90 0.60
Mohawk 233284 - stock stock stock stock MOQ stock stock
2 30421 114.80 114.80 132.49
Gillig 233287 stock 30d
4 41272 36.08 43.26 36.08 40.09 41.50
Neopart 233288 3w 6w 5w 30d
5 41273 36.08 44.54 43.26 36.08 40.09 41.50
Neopart 233288 75d 3w 6w 8w 30d
5 41288 63.60 63.60 82.16 108.90 106.91 107.10
unapproved
Gillig 233287 part stock 6w 15w stock
5 41332 270.28 499.39 395.00 549.32 270.28 517.56
unapproved
Gillig 233287 - 21d 10w 10w part 30d
- 110004 -




DUE: 03/23/22 3:00

PM Pace RFQ# 421721
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid Vehicle Suburban | Prevost CBM Rome Kirks - NO | Mohawk Gillig Neopart | Aftermarket | Muncie
Maintenance Truck Truck - NO BID Parts
NO # of Bids BID
410000 103.48 164.26 114.34 103.48 109.33
Aftermarket Parts 233289 75d 21d stock 21d
410003 175.42 235.00 175.42 176.77 198.89 183.95
Mohawk 233284 - 75d stock 4w 6w 21d
410009 125.97 134.09 164.26 996.74 125.97 131.01 130.65
Avaliability -
Aftermarket Parts 233289 - stock 75d stock 4w stock 21d
210002 -
310008 93.60 109.12 93.60 112.70 94.60
Neopart 233288 - 4w stock 13w stock
310012 80.20 108.09 80.22 80.20 128.63
unapproved
Aftermarket Parts 233289 - part stock stock stock
410034 235.98 303.91 259.76 251.15 235.98 268.63 249.55
Availability -
Aftermarket Parts 233289 - 75d 5w 4w 4w stock 30d

110027




DUE: 03/23/22 3:00

PM Pace RFQ# 421721
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
[N I A A N O
Sku Winning bid Vehicle Suburban | Prevost CBM Rome Kirks - NO | Mohawk Gillig Neopart | Aftermarket | Muncie
Maintenance Truck Truck - NO BID Parts
NO # of Bids BID
- 310031 -
6 410080 304.75 418.55 304.75 350.00 355.89 384.56 359.89
unapproved
Gillig 233287 - 75d part stock 3w 8w 21d
2 410092 111.98 111.98 132.45
Neopart 233288 - 6w 21d
3 410095 82.16 82.16 91.04 91.11
Gillig 233287 - stock 6w stock
3 110058 282.55 371.95 282.55 341.50
Aftermarket Parts 233289 - 12w 20w 140d
3 410102 67.35 79.16 91.60 67.35
Muncie 233290 - 5w stock stock
3 410109 800.00 800.00 949.49 808.82
Neopart 233288 - stock stock stock




DUE: 03/23/22 3:00

PM Pace RFQ# 421721
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid Vehicle Suburban | Prevost CBM Rome Kirks - NO | Mohawk Gillig Neopart | Aftermarket | Muncie
Maintenance Truck Truck - NO BID Parts
NO # of Bids BID
4 410111 800.00 996.74 800.00 917.24 808.82
Neopart 233288 - stock stock stock stock
1 110070 41.45 41.45
Aftermarket Parts 233289 - 11w
1 110075 327.18 327.18
Aftermarket Parts 233289 - stock
4 110076 108.95 159.41 108.95 175.00 308.26
Availability - unapproved unapproved
Aftermarket Parts 233289 - part part 6w stock




	421721

