Pace RFQ# 421718
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- ! | ' ! | | . | . | [ | |
Sku Winning bid VEHICLE MUNCIE FILTER HYDRAULIC | NEOPART | PREVOST KIRK'S MIDWEST | ELDORADO KELLER GILLIG TRANSIT MOHAWK RILCO TRANSLITE

NO # of Bids MAINT. SERVICES ELECTRIC BUS HEARTT HOLDINGS ENT.

4| 160605 11.55 16.05 11.55 16.00 31.83

14D - OEM
NOT PACE

GILLIG 233279 - S APPROVED S S

5| 290415 534.01 597.88 534.01 651.43 570.00 600.81
NEOPART 233274 - 21D 3W S 4 W S

7 | 200901 29.76 66.55 64.99 60.35 29.76 45.23 70.16 45.00
ELDORADO 233278 - 30D 4 W S 8W S S S

5| 180359 62.00 62.00 148.93 121.41 126.88 62.53
HYDRAULIC ELECTRIC| 233273 S S 8W S S

1| 160795 14.07 14.07
ELDORADO 233278 - S

4| 250567 305.00 315.99 305.00 311.06 353.50
MIDWEST BUS 233277 - S 14D 4 W S

5| 151458 160.71 174.99 244.46 359.69 160.71 191.65
GILLIG 233279 - S S S S 5W

4| 200522 17.84 17.84 25.73 25.98 21.70
AVAIL./MOHAWK 233283 - 75D 4 W 5W S

6 | 200548 17.58 19.15 21.33 17.58 17.97 20.73 19.66
PREVOST 233275 - 30D 4 W S S 5W 40D




Sku Winning bid VEHICLE MUNCIE FILTER HYDRAULIC | NEOPART | PREVOST KIRK'S MIDWEST | ELDORADO KELLER GILLIG TRANSIT MOHAWK RILCO TRANSLITE

NO # of Bids MAINT. SERVICES ELECTRIC BUS HEARTT HOLDINGS ENT.

4| 160600 9.03 9.37 10.33 9.03 9.54
GILLIG 233279 S S S

3| 290646 96.45 96.45 170.61 131.08
MUNCIE 233271 21D S 8W

3| 170622 345.60 353.49 411.08 345.60
TRANSLITE ENT. 233285 30D 10W S

6| 200611 43.45 117.65 115.72 116.91 49.56 128.58 43.45
MOHAWK 233283 30D 4W S 2W S S

4| 290645 43.47 43.47 56.10 75.03 71.78
VEHICLE MAINT. 233270 - S S S 7W

6| 290537 175.00 210.15 175.00 192.95 229.51 181.93 213.86
HYDRAULIC ELECTRIC| 233273 S S S S S S

2| 620154 1.10 1.35 1.10
HYDRAULIC ELECTRIC| 233273 30D S

2| 200813 2.60 3.55 2.60
TRANSIT HOLDINGS 233280 - 21D 4 W

4| 170615 222.85 222.85 307.53 244.52 268.63
MUNCIE 233271 - 42D 6 W 4 W 8W

3| 170621 340.99 340.99 411.08 345.60
AVAIL./TRANSLITE
ENT. 233285 - 30D S S

5| 290428 9.25 10.24 9.80 9.86 9.25 62.17
GILLIG 233279 - 21D S 3W S 6W




Sku Winning bid VEHICLE MUNCIE FILTER HYDRAULIC | NEOPART | PREVOST KIRK'S MIDWEST | ELDORADO KELLER GILLIG TRANSIT MOHAWK RILCO TRANSLITE
NO # of Bids MAINT. SERVICES ELECTRIC BUS HEARTT HOLDINGS ENT.
200724 320.89 320.89 322.15 353.62
AVAIL./NEOPART 233274 - 80D 4 W 5W
910005 2.49 2.49 2.62
KELLER HEARTT 233286 - S S
210953 75.50 196.96 201.44 75.50
TRANSIT HOLDINGS 233280 - 21D 4 W S
200751 183.29 188.98 183.29 183.93 206.74 211.88
AVAIL./PREVOST 233275 - 30D 4 W S 5W 40D
220359 24.93 24.93
TRANSIT HOLDINGS 233280 - S
290666 25.53 225,53 34.06
MUNCIE 233271 - 30D S
910126 =
NO BID -
211036 697.37 699.52 783.78 697.37
MOHAWK 233283 - 21D 10w 30D
200932 40.20 69.90 67.92 182.05 53.61 40.20
TRANSIT HOLDINGS 233280 - 30D 75D 8W S S
200949 875.00 875.00 1,257.37
KIRK'S 233276 - S 8W
152031 0.67 0.67
ELDORADO 233278 - 1w




Sku Winning bid VEHICLE MUNCIE FILTER HYDRAULIC | NEOPART | PREVOST KIRK'S MIDWEST | ELDORADO KELLER GILLIG TRANSIT MOHAWK RILCO TRANSLITE

NO # of Bids MAINT. SERVICES ELECTRIC BUS HEARTT HOLDINGS ENT.

1| 152036 9.49 9.49
ELDORADO 233278 - S

3| 290694 96.16 108.98 98.24 96.16
GILLIG 233279 - S 3W S

5| 250784 231.00 243.41 303.02 231.00 241.48 258.29
MIDWEST BUS 233277 - 30D S 10D S S

4| 170715 685.00 709.87 948.96 685.00 705.54
GILLIG 233279 - 30D 10W 6W S

5| 152074 11.67 11.67 20.63 14.99 14.15 15.35
MUNCIE 233271 - S S S 5W 30D

3| 290700 169.04 169.04 345.36 176.18
MUNCIE 233271 - 90D S 24 W

4| 170718 61.20 61.20 102.91 69.80 64.03
MUNCIE 233271 - S S 6W 5W

2 | 1510001 1.95 1.95 3.50
MUNCIE 233271 - 30D 1w

6 | 2210000 30.60 42.72 71.82 30.60 48.25 60.13 116.07
ELDORADO 233278 S S S S S 45D

6| 1610013 90.00 195.60 196.22 404.37 178.76 191.75 90.00

OEM NOT
PACE

GILLIG 233279 - S 10D 8W S S APPROVED




Sku Winning bid VEHICLE MUNCIE FILTER HYDRAULIC | NEOPART | PREVOST KIRK'S MIDWEST | ELDORADO KELLER GILLIG TRANSIT MOHAWK RILCO TRANSLITE

NO # of Bids MAINT. SERVICES ELECTRIC BUS HEARTT HOLDINGS ENT.

2510006 121.95 128.86 136.16 121.95
TRANSIT HOLDINGS 233280 - 37D 6W S

4 | 2510007 727.70 758.53 775.00 727.70 866.45

GILLIG 233279 - 10D 10D 2W 5W

2010021 168.25 193.00 181.84 184.85 168.25 196.31 200.50
GILLIG 233279 - 30D 4 W S S 5W S

1710033 -
NO BID -

2110016 3.25 3.25
FILTER SERVICES 233272 - 60D

2910015 14.45 28.20 14.45
TRANSIT HOLDINGS 233280 - S S

1710055 83.53 83.53
ELDORADO 233278 - 3W

2010037 529.59 561.00 529.59 548.31 686.06 595.84 595.36
NEOPART 233274 - 30D 4 W S S 5W 30D

4| 2010041 1,500.00 1,500.00 2,645.95 1,625.00 3,201.50
21D-ITEM
OUT OF
STOCK PER

KIRK'S 233276 - GM S S S

1610086 55.96 55.96
ELDORADO 233278 - S




Sku Winning bid VEHICLE MUNCIE FILTER HYDRAULIC | NEOPART | PREVOST KIRK'S MIDWEST | ELDORADO KELLER GILLIG TRANSIT MOHAWK RILCO TRANSLITE

NO # of Bids MAINT. SERVICES ELECTRIC BUS HEARTT HOLDINGS ENT.

4| 2510067 910.00 984.69 1,003.20 910.00 1,154.88
GILLIG 233279 - 10D 10D 4 W 7W

3 | 2510084 7.14 7.14 8.10 8.07
NEOPART 233274 - 10D 2W S

3| 1610112 96.04 147.47 96.04 125.16
GILLIG 233279 - 30D S S

1| 2110142 21.89 21.89
TRANSIT HOLDINGS 233280 - S

4| 2110151 96.99 96.99 120.43 144.05 100.68
MUNCIE 233271 - 30D 90D 8W 25W

2 | 1510243 180.00 180.00 288.02
GILLIG 233279 - S S

2 | 2110185 47.43 47.43 91.33
MUNCIE 233271 - 30D 10w

3| 2110186 1,391.33 PSCHESS 1,455.00 1,644.40
MUNCIE 233271 - 30D 18 W 27 W

4| 2910070 11.00 22.47 11.00 14.50 23.08
HYDRAULIC ELECTRIC| 233273 - 21D S S S

1| 1610195 214.75 214.75
TRANSIT HOLDINGS 233280 - 6W

1| 1610197 285.51 285.51
TRANSIT HOLDINGS 233280 - S




Sku Winning bid VEHICLE MUNCIE FILTER HYDRAULIC | NEOPART | PREVOST KIRK'S MIDWEST | ELDORADO KELLER GILLIG TRANSIT MOHAWK RILCO TRANSLITE
NO # of Bids MAINT. SERVICES ELECTRIC BUS HEARTT HOLDINGS ENT.
3| 2110216 91.55 G55 95.06 115.33
MUNCIE 233271 - 30D 12W 1w
1| 2110217 138.74 138.74
TRANSIT HOLDINGS 233280 - 11w
- | 2810001 =
NO BID -
- | 2810002 =
NO BID -
- | 2810003 -
NO BID -
- | 2810004 =
NO BID -
- | 2810005 -
NO BID -
- | 2810006 -
NO BID -
- | 2810007 =
NO BID -
- | 2810008 -
NO BID -
- | 2810009 -
NO BID -

2810010




Sku Winning bid VEHICLE MUNCIE FILTER HYDRAULIC | NEOPART | PREVOST KIRK'S MIDWEST | ELDORADO KELLER GILLIG TRANSIT MOHAWK RILCO TRANSLITE

NO # of Bids MAINT. SERVICES ELECTRIC BUS HEARTT HOLDINGS ENT.
NO BID -

- | 2810011 =
NO BID -

- | 2810012 =
NO BID -

2 | 2510182 6.38 6.38 6.71
NEOPART 233274 - 10D 2W

1| 1610199 2.33 2.33
TRANSIT HOLDINGS 233280 - S

1| 1610200 2.33 2.33
TRANSIT HOLDINGS 233280 - IW

2 | 2110225 21.25 21.25 26.81
MUNCIE 233271 - 30D 15W

2 | 2110226 5.85 5.85 8.21
MUNCIE 233271 - 60D 11w

1| 2110227 568.18 568.18
TRANSIT HOLDINGS 233280 - 9w

1| 1710152 150.73 150.73
ELDORADO 233278 - 2W




