
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Neopart - 
NO BID

Kirks - NO 
BID

Aftermarket 
Parts

Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

Gillig - NO 
BID

Prevost - 
NO BID

Mohawk MWFI Muncie Coffman

                                  5 81240 1.01                          3.54             1.01             3.32             3.28             2.76 

Availability - Coffman 233226 -                 3w 
 unapproved 

part  stock  21d  stock 

                                  3 810061 3,584.59          4,558.44     4,339.24     3,584.59 

Coffman 233226 -                 9w  8w  stock 

                                  4 810393 57.21                     73.65          68.90          68.90          57.21 

Coffman 233226 -                 5w  stock  stock  stock 

                                  4 810394 1.94                          2.57             2.32             2.35             1.94 

Coffman 233226  9w  stock  30d  stock 

Pace RFQ# 421698


	421698

