
Due 03.10.22 @ 2:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Interstate 
Power

Hydraulic 
Electric

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Gillig Prevost - 
NO BID

Kirks CBM Suburban 
Truck

Crossline 
Supply

A&A Auto - 
NO BID

Coffman Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Mohawk

                                  2 130756 951.31                951.31     1,003.72 

Interstate Power 233260 -                 1w  3w 

                                  6 130581 43.04                      43.04           49.25           44.79           60.44           53.10           49.96 

Interstate Power 233260 -                 20d  stock  stock  stock  stock  21d 

                                  5 130813 2.60                        15.97           13.64           18.50           15.60             2.60 

Coffman 233256 -                 stock  stock  7w  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                   - 110135 -                

                                  9 120488 16.63                      19.48           17.50           16.63           24.50           19.48           18.13           20.61           19.35           18.69 

Vehicle Maintenance 233242 -                 14d 30d  stock  stock  stock  3w  5w  30d  3w 

                                  3 110085 16.55                   121.61        115.22           16.55 

Muncie 233245 -                 stock  21d 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  7 100223 51.00                      61.00           51.00        102.87           65.77        145.29        105.11           70.47 

Crossline Supply 233262 -                 stock stock  stock  stock  6w  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  4 120502 85.00                      85.00        105.92        123.25           94.77 

Hydraulic Electric 233261 -                 stock  stock  11w  stock 

                                   - 130782 -                

-                

                                  3 1110000 42.42                      42.42           48.00           55.00 

Kirks 233237
 unapproved 

part  30d  5w 

                                  9 1210003 20.22                      20.92           20.22           31.63           20.92           22.75           21.79           30.88           24.59           21.79 

Vehicle Maintenance 233242  3w  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock  stock  30d  3w 

                                   - 1010005 -                

Pace RFQ# 421695



Due 03.10.22 @ 2:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Interstate 
Power

Hydraulic 
Electric

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Gillig Prevost - 
NO BID

Kirks CBM Suburban 
Truck

Crossline 
Supply

A&A Auto - 
NO BID

Coffman Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 421695

                                   - 1010007 -                

                                  7 1010011 948.00                948.00     1,185.48     1,396.43     1,227.20     1,796.58     1,190.45     1,090.00 

Kirks 233237 -                 stock  stock  stock  10d  6w  21d  5w 

                                  7 1010012 1,245.00          1,245.00     1,455.21     2,180.10     1,512.11     2,649.08     1,689.05     1,310.00 

Kirks 233237  stock  stock  stock  10d  5w  30d  stock 

                                  6 1010014 3.01                          5.61             3.01             9.78           12.43           11.99             8.25 

Kirks 233237  stock  stock  stock  stock  30d 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  7 1010015 989.00                989.00     1,267.62     1,507.35     1,282.40     1,904.23     1,465.99     1,075.25 

Kirks 233237 -                 stock  stock  stock  10d  13w  45d  stock 

                                  2 1010016 2,485.45          2,485.45     3,123.24 

Coffman 233256 -                 90d  7w 

                                  1 1210024 180.02                180.02 

Aftermarket Parts 233259 -                 stock 

                                  2 1210030 317.87                317.87        411.36 

Coffman 233256 -                 10d  9w 

                                  3 1010024 66.07                      66.07           76.19           74.35 

Coffman 233256 -                 stock  7w  30d 

                                   - 1010027 -                

-                

                                  2 1210038 2,123.57          2,123.57     2,793.40 



Due 03.10.22 @ 2:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Interstate 
Power

Hydraulic 
Electric

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Gillig Prevost - 
NO BID

Kirks CBM Suburban 
Truck

Crossline 
Supply

A&A Auto - 
NO BID

Coffman Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 421695

Coffman 233256 -                 90d  10w 

                                  8 1010032 50.00                      50.00        130.00           55.00        118.30           80.12        147.87        115.70           73.60 

Hydraulic Electric 233261 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  5 1010038 24.75                      24.75           29.10           27.77           64.78           60.60 

Neopart 233248 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  30d 

                                   - 1110002 -                

-                

                                  4 1210077 347.40                347.40        420.00        448.64        414.04 

Coffman 233256 -                 stock  stock  9w  stock 

                                  3 1010044 199.24                221.42        275.32        199.24 

Muncie 233245 -                 stock  5w  stock 

                                   - 1210081 -                

-                

                                  3 1210097 18.54                      18.54           39.01           22.35 

Coffman 233256 -                 60d  9w  30d 

                                  5 1010049 1,295.00          1,295.00     1,870.82     1,575.30     2,300.01     1,404.40 

Availability - Coffman 233256 -                
 unapproved 

part  stock  10d  9w  30d 

                                  3 1010050 4,317.69          4,317.69     5,963.94     5,145.50 

Coffman 233256 -                 stock  6w  30d 

                                  3 1010052 98.12                      98.12        125.23        117.70 

Coffman 233256 -                 stock  9w  30d 

                                  5 1010053 5.45                          6.50             8.37           10.74             9.99             5.45 

Coffman 233256 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 



Due 03.10.22 @ 2:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Interstate 
Power

Hydraulic 
Electric

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Gillig Prevost - 
NO BID

Kirks CBM Suburban 
Truck

Crossline 
Supply

A&A Auto - 
NO BID

Coffman Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 421695

                                  6 1010054 2.99                        15.30             2.99             9.80           12.65           11.99             4.62 

Kirks 233237 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  3 1010055 98.12                      98.12        125.96        117.70 

Coffman 233256 -                 stock  14w  30d 

                                  3 1010060 2,429.35          2,429.35     3,546.29     2,909.90 

Coffman 233256 -                 90d  9w  30d 

                                  7 1010061 965.00                965.00     1,104.45     1,276.17     1,067.20     1,586.86     1,520.20     1,042.00 

Kirks 233237 -                 stock  stock  stock  10d  9w  30d  2w 

                                  3 1010067 200.64                200.64        257.60        240.54 

Coffman 233256 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                  4 1010070 309.18                309.18        520.86        666.60        620.20 

Crossline Supply 233262 -                 stock  stock  5w  30d 

                                  2 1110004 81.08                      86.64           81.08 

Muncie 233245 -                 3w  30d 

                                   - 1210130 -                

-                

                                  3 1010075 98.56                      98.56        122.38        122.66 

Coffman 233256 -                 stock  5w  30d 

                                   - 1210134 -                

-                

                                  3 1010080 908.93                908.93     1,049.75        990.90 

Coffman 233256 -                 90d  9w  30d 



Due 03.10.22 @ 2:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Interstate 
Power

Hydraulic 
Electric

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Gillig Prevost - 
NO BID

Kirks CBM Suburban 
Truck

Crossline 
Supply

A&A Auto - 
NO BID

Coffman Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 421695

                                  5 1210144 640.00                640.00        670.00        814.21        964.12        891.91 

Hydraulic Electric 233261 -                 stock  stock  stock  7w  30d 

                                   - 81055 -                

-                

                                   - 120553 -                

-                

                                   - 810129 -                

-                

                                   - 1210078 -                

-                

                                   - 1010092 -                

-                

                                   - 1210150 -                

-                

                                  1 1210151 379.81                379.81 

Aftermarket Parts 233259 -                 7w 


	421695

