
Due 03.10.22 @ 1:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Interstate 
Power

P&G Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

Gillig Suburban 
Truck

Kirks Prevost Neopart Coffman Battery 
Service

A&A Auto Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie

                                     - 72125 -                 

-                 

                                    2 71875 5.25                           5.35             5.25 

Availability - Mohawk 233250 -                  stock  12w 

                                    2 71287 0.23                           0.23             0.24 

Mohawk 233250 -                  stock  8w 

                                    3 71441 6.25                           7.08             6.89             6.25 

Muncie 233245  stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 72134 42.11                      57.67           42.11           85.49 

Aftermarket Parts 233259 -                  stock  stock  MOQ 

                                    3 71178 0.04                           0.04             0.05             0.06 

Mohawk 233250 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                    2 71357 10.75                      12.39           10.75 

Aftermarket Parts 233259 -                 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                     - 72077 -                 

-                 

                                    1 71486 4.95                           4.95 

Muncie 233245 -                  stock 

                                    3 71442 6.27                           6.90             9.51             6.27 

Muncie 233245  stock  stock  stock 

                                    2 70249 4.96                           4.96             9.94 

Aftermarket Parts 233259
 unapproved 

part  stock 

Pace RFQ# 421694



Due 03.10.22 @ 1:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Interstate 
Power

P&G Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

Gillig Suburban 
Truck

Kirks Prevost Neopart Coffman Battery 
Service

A&A Auto Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie

Pace RFQ# 421694

                                    3 70725 0.14                           0.14             0.29             0.21 

Mohawk 233250  stock  stock  stock 

                                    6 72078 1,904.72           1,904.72     2,150.00     2,300.00     2,584.94     2,311.00     2,399.65 

P&G 233254  stock  stock  stock  105d  stock  30d 

                                     - 72144 -                 

-                 

                                    3 72148 89.04                    114.05           89.04         126.12 

Mohawk 233250  stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 72156 22.45                      23.10           22.61           22.45 
Availability - 
Aftermarket Parts 233259  8w  stock  42d 

                                    3 72162 28.15                      62.31           28.15           50.24 

Mohawk 233250 -                  75d  stock  7w 

                                    2 72164 1,250.00           1,250.00     1,683.25 

Gillig 233253 -                  10w  14w 

                                    2 72181 615.64                  615.64         835.35 

Gillig 233253 -                  10w  14w 

                                     - 72185 -                 

-                 

                                    3 72192 21.80                      24.98           22.81           21.80 

Muncie 233245 -                  stock  6w  30d 

                                    2 72184 5.39                           5.39             6.45 

Aftermarket Parts 233259 -                  stock  stock 



Due 03.10.22 @ 1:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Interstate 
Power

P&G Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

Gillig Suburban 
Truck

Kirks Prevost Neopart Coffman Battery 
Service

A&A Auto Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie

Pace RFQ# 421694

                                    4 72194 70.55                      95.39           70.55           74.47           88.95 
Availability - 
Aftermarket Parts 233259 -                  75d  8w  stock  42d 

                                     - 72204 -                 

-                 

                                    3 72294 55.55                      55.55           58.60         103.39 

Prevost 233255 -                  75d  4w  16w 

                                    2 72295 26.59                      26.59           40.61 

Mohawk 233250 -                  stock  stock 

                                    4 72301 258.21                  258.21         277.50         379.00         332.23 

Battery Service 233257 -                 
 unapproved 

part  4w  4w  5w 

                                     - 72366 -                 

-                 

                                    6 72388 38.25                      40.00           84.86           67.56           38.25           56.56           73.03 

Mohawk 233250 -                  stock  stock  8w  stock  9w  60d 

                                     - 710004 -                 

-                 

                                    5 710025 34.65                      43.50           99.00           34.65           36.88           77.77 

Neopart 233248 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  120d 

                                    6 710043 276.83                  276.83         325.00         335.00         394.55         337.55         316.16 

P&G 233254 -                  stock  4w  stock  75d  14w  30d 

                                     - 710047 -                 

-                 



Due 03.10.22 @ 1:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Interstate 
Power

P&G Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

Gillig Suburban 
Truck

Kirks Prevost Neopart Coffman Battery 
Service

A&A Auto Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie

Pace RFQ# 421694

                                    1 710054 12.51                      12.51 

Aftermarket Parts 233259 -                  5w 

                                     - 710130 -                 

-                 

                                    6 710149 345.27                  404.12         364.51         345.27         367.67         433.68         385.05 

Coffman 233256 -                  stock  stock  stock  3w  stock  30d 

                                     - 710157 -                 

-                 

                                    1 710178 4.99                           4.99 

Aftermarket Parts 233259 -                  stock 

                                     - 710200 -                 

-                 

                                    3 710244 70.70                      75.00           71.53           70.70 

Muncie 233245 -                  8w  12w  30d 

                                     - 710247 -                 

-                 

                                    1 710260 585.85                  585.85 

Aftermarket Parts 233259 -                  14w 

                                     - 710297 -                 

-                 

                                    3 710300 46.64                      46.64           54.88           50.90 

Coffman 233256 -                  stock  6w  30d 



Due 03.10.22 @ 1:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Interstate 
Power

P&G Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

Gillig Suburban 
Truck

Kirks Prevost Neopart Coffman Battery 
Service

A&A Auto Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie

Pace RFQ# 421694

                                    3 710374 16.10                      16.50           16.10           16.16 

Aftermarket Parts 233259 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                    1 710414 570.14                  570.14 

Aftermarket Parts 233259 -                  8w 

                                    3 710425 192.71                  192.71         224.63         207.70 

Coffman 233256 -                  stock  stock  30d 

                                     - 71038 -                 

-                 

                                     - 72249 -                 

-                 

                                     - 710013 -                 

-                 


	421694

