
Due 03.09.22 @ 3:00 
PM

TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid A&A Auto Interstate 
Power

MW Bus - 
NO BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Prevost - 
NO BID

Suburban 
Truck Parts

Kirks Eldorado Vehicle 
Maintenance

Gillig Muncie Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Coffman - 
BID LATE

Crossline 
Supply - 
BID LATE

                                  4 60734 2.40                          2.59           10.00             2.52             2.40 

Muncie 233245 -                 stock  stock  stock  30d 

                                  1 60735 1,026.48          1,026.48 

Eldorado 233240 -                 12w 

                                  1 81055 152.04                152.04 

Eldorado 233240 -                 2w 

                                  3 81089 3.33                          3.33             5.09             5.51 

Vehicle Maintenance 233242  stock  21d  5w 

                                  2 81085 3.80                          5.70             3.80 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  1 80971 43.38                      43.38 

Eldorado 233240 -                 2w 

                                  1 81065 434.97                434.97 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 stock 

                                  4 81343 7.77                          7.77           30.26           32.74             8.29 

Kirks 233237 -                 stock  30d  4w 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  1 81374 80.62                      80.62 

Eldorado 233240 -                 4w 

                                  2 81377 3.65                          3.65             3.94 

Muncie 233245  30d  5w 

                                  1 60772 21.66                      21.66 

Eldorado 233240  2w 

                                  1 81397 771.74                771.74 

Pace RFQ# 421693



Due 03.09.22 @ 3:00 
PM

TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid A&A Auto Interstate 
Power

MW Bus - 
NO BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Prevost - 
NO BID

Suburban 
Truck Parts

Kirks Eldorado Vehicle 
Maintenance

Gillig Muncie Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Coffman - 
BID LATE

Crossline 
Supply - 
BID LATE

Pace RFQ# 421693

Aftermarket Parts 233249  5w 

                                  1 81417 24.77                      24.77 

Eldorado 233240  4w 

                                  1 81423 49.59                      49.59 

Eldorado 233240 -                 4w 

                                  1 60792 198.54                198.54 

Eldorado 233240  6w 

                                  2 60793 41.75                      41.75           45.42 

Muncie 233245  30d  stock 

                                  4 60794 8.98                          9.99           16.07             8.98           11.93 

Muncie 233245 -                 stock  1w  30d  5w 

                                  2 81498 774.18                774.18        900.03 

Muncie 233245 -                 30d  5w 

                                  3 81503 10.97                      26.26           27.44           10.97 

Mohawk 233250 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                  4 81519 65.00                      65.00           88.42        117.15           95.34 

Kirks 233237 -                 stock  stock  stock  4w 

                                  8 81521 19.53                      21.09           20.56           20.56           21.30           24.16           19.53           23.53           19.65 

Neopart 233248 -                 4w  3w  stock  stock  stock  stock  3w  4w 

                                  4 81533 12.69                      13.61           13.75           27.41           12.69 

Mohawk 233250 -                 stock  42d  stock  stock 

                                  1 810000 43.38                      43.38 



Due 03.09.22 @ 3:00 
PM

TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid A&A Auto Interstate 
Power

MW Bus - 
NO BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Prevost - 
NO BID

Suburban 
Truck Parts

Kirks Eldorado Vehicle 
Maintenance

Gillig Muncie Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Coffman - 
BID LATE

Crossline 
Supply - 
BID LATE

Pace RFQ# 421693

Eldorado 233240 -                 4w 

                                  3 610009 2.49                          8.01             4.95             2.49 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 1w  21d  stock 

                                  4 610018 17.03                      50.00           51.72           54.63           17.03 

Mohawk 233250 -                 stock  30d  5w  stock 

                                  6 610019 78.00                      84.80           78.00        161.86           90.75        107.19           92.25 

Kirks 233237 -                 stock  stock  120d  6w  7w  stock 

                                  1 810026 1,224.69          1,224.69 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 9w 

                                  1 810027 706.06                706.06 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 9w 

                                  5 810028 48.50                   155.10           60.00        113.60           89.71           48.50 

Mohawk 233250 -                 10w  stock  stock  10w  stock 

                                  3 810030 1.39                          3.02             3.25             1.39 

Muncie 233245 -                 30d  10w 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  3 810031 1.95                          9.99           10.66             1.95 

Muncie 233245 -                 30d  4w 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  5 610026 130.20                135.00        168.39        162.88        130.20        174.79 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 stock  120d  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  6 610028 32.00                      32.00           81.28           57.34           60.31           93.02           90.50 

Muncie 233245 -                
 no part number 

reference  stock  stock  stock  5w  6w 

                                  3 610033 599.00                599.00        992.00     1,238.73 

Kirks 233237 -                 stock  5w  10w 



Due 03.09.22 @ 3:00 
PM

TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid A&A Auto Interstate 
Power

MW Bus - 
NO BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Prevost - 
NO BID

Suburban 
Truck Parts

Kirks Eldorado Vehicle 
Maintenance

Gillig Muncie Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Coffman - 
BID LATE

Crossline 
Supply - 
BID LATE

Pace RFQ# 421693

                                  1 610036 6,000.00          6,000.00 

Eldorado 233240 -                 12w 

                                  1 810045 629.77                629.77 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 7w 

                                  2 810046 462.39                462.39        811.03 

Muncie 233245 -                 120d  7w 

                                  2 810048 20.29                      22.65           20.29 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 30d  7w 

                                  4 610050 23.23                      31.89           23.23           32.23           26.65 

Vehicle Maintenance 233242 -                 3w  stock  10w  stock 

                                  2 810050 95.54                   121.47           95.54 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 6w  stock 

                                  1 810071 979.53                979.53 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 9w 

                                  2 810073 118.05                118.05        147.86 

Muncie 233245 -                 120d  7w 

                                  2 610059 21.85                      21.85           23.57 

Muncie 233245 -                 30d  6w 

                                  2 810078 529.50                529.50        558.39 

Muncie 233245 -                 30d  5w 

                                  2 810079 439.00                439.00        616.40 

Muncie 233245 -                 120d  7w 



Due 03.09.22 @ 3:00 
PM

TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid A&A Auto Interstate 
Power

MW Bus - 
NO BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Prevost - 
NO BID

Suburban 
Truck Parts

Kirks Eldorado Vehicle 
Maintenance

Gillig Muncie Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Coffman - 
BID LATE

Crossline 
Supply - 
BID LATE

Pace RFQ# 421693

                                  2 810101 229.66                229.66        293.66 

Muncie 233245 -                 120d  6w 

                                  3 810112 5.68                          5.68             6.11             6.98 

Muncie 233245 -                 30d  6w  6w 

                                  2 810123 75.75                      75.75           78.12 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 stock  5w 

                                  1 610068 61.80                      61.80 

Eldorado 233240 -                 4w 

                                  2 810130 522.79                522.79        558.39 

Muncie 233245 -                 30d  5w 

                                  3 810132 146.99                146.99        192.69        147.73 

Muncie 233245 -                 30d  8w  4w 

                                  2 810133 52.65                      52.65           56.50 

Muncie 233245 -                 30d  9w 

                                  2 810134 6.76                          6.76             7.22 

Muncie 233245 -                 stock  9w 

                                  3 810135 18.92                      18.92           20.33           19.07 

Muncie 233245 -                 30d  9w 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  2 810136 5.70                          5.70             6.07 

Muncie 233245 -                 stock  4w 

                                  1 810137 213.44                213.44 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 5w 



Due 03.09.22 @ 3:00 
PM

TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid A&A Auto Interstate 
Power

MW Bus - 
NO BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Prevost - 
NO BID

Suburban 
Truck Parts

Kirks Eldorado Vehicle 
Maintenance

Gillig Muncie Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Coffman - 
BID LATE

Crossline 
Supply - 
BID LATE

Pace RFQ# 421693

                                  3 810141 24.26                      49.49           78.51           24.26 

Muncie 233245 -                 120d  3w 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  3 610072 26.40                      46.72           49.91           26.40 

Muncie 233245 -                 30d  5w 
 unapproved 

part 

                                   - 810143 -                

-                

                                  2 810181 2.94                          2.94             3.17 

Muncie 233245 -                 30d  6w 

                                  1 610087 9,851.00          9,851.00 

Eldorado 233240 -                 stock 

                                  3 810188 37.15                      37.15           39.64           39.62 

Muncie 233245 -                 stock  7w  stock 

                                  2 810192 1,050.00          1,050.00     1,837.29 

Muncie 233245 -                 stock  6w 

                                  1 610091 40.75                      40.75 

Eldorado 233240 -                 2w 

                                  4 610098 2.45                          5.53             2.45             2.52             2.56 

Muncie 233245 -                 1w  stock  stock  stock 

                                  3 810204 1,602.21          1,824.99     2,000.00     1,602.21 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 30d  stock  stock 

                                  2 810207 170.98                170.98        182.88 

Muncie 233245 -                 30d  stock 

                                  2 810220 532.00                532.00        572.95 



Due 03.09.22 @ 3:00 
PM

TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid A&A Auto Interstate 
Power

MW Bus - 
NO BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Prevost - 
NO BID

Suburban 
Truck Parts

Kirks Eldorado Vehicle 
Maintenance

Gillig Muncie Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Coffman - 
BID LATE

Crossline 
Supply - 
BID LATE

Pace RFQ# 421693

Muncie 233245 -                 30d  5w 

                                  2 810229 17.42                      17.42           18.61 

Muncie 233245 -                 30d  7w 

                                  2 810230 4.02                          4.02             4.24 

Muncie 233245 -                 30d  5w 

                                  2 810231 279.88                279.88        300.76 

Muncie 233245 -                 30d  stock 

                                  2 810234 251.99                251.99        271.53 

Muncie 233245 -                 30d  7w 

                                  2 810237 34.50                      34.50           36.13 

Muncie 233245 -                 30d  5w 

                                  1 810246 17.42                      17.42 

Eldorado 233240 -                 4w 

                                  2 610122 1.74                          1.74             1.79 

Muncie 233245 -                 30d  7w 

                                  3 610127 1.76                          2.28             2.41             1.76 

Muncie 233245 -                 stock  14w 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  2 610133 185.59                214.70        185.59 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 30d  5w 

                                   - 610134 -                

-                

                                  2 810287 1.90                          1.90             2.10 

Muncie 233245 -                 30d  4w 



Due 03.09.22 @ 3:00 
PM

TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid A&A Auto Interstate 
Power

MW Bus - 
NO BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Prevost - 
NO BID

Suburban 
Truck Parts

Kirks Eldorado Vehicle 
Maintenance

Gillig Muncie Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Coffman - 
BID LATE

Crossline 
Supply - 
BID LATE

Pace RFQ# 421693

                                  1 810303 974.05                974.05 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 12w 

                                  2 810304 41.85                      41.85           44.76 

Muncie 233245 -                 30d  7w 

                                  1 810305 221.93                221.93 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 7w 

                                  1 810328 25.29                      25.29 

Muncie 233245 -                 30d 

                                  2 810327 2.95                          2.95             3.25 

Muncie 233245 -                 30d  9w 

                                  1 610148 1,793.63          1,793.63 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 15w 

                                  1 610149 1,824.94          1,824.94 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 stock 

                                  3 810365 36.61                      61.44           66.47           36.61 

Muncie 233245 -                 stock  7w 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  2 810367 2.82                          2.82             3.08 

Muncie 233245 -                 30d  7w 

                                  1 810390 2,994.68          2,994.68 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 6w 

                                  1 810391 2,318.36          2,318.36 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 14w 

                                  1 810392 2,069.05             2,069.05 



Due 03.09.22 @ 3:00 
PM

TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid A&A Auto Interstate 
Power

MW Bus - 
NO BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Prevost - 
NO BID

Suburban 
Truck Parts

Kirks Eldorado Vehicle 
Maintenance

Gillig Muncie Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Coffman - 
BID LATE

Crossline 
Supply - 
BID LATE

Pace RFQ# 421693

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 20w 

                                  1 610169 33.97                      33.97 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 10w 

                                  2 610170 25.28                      25.28           37.09 

Muncie 233245 -                 60d  6w 

                                  2 610171 20.51                      20.51           23.88 
Availability - 
Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 60d  stock 

                                  1 610172 53.66                      53.66 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 11w 

                                  1 810129 338.37                338.37 

Eldorado 233240 -                 10w 

                                   - 810374 -                

-                


	421693

