
Due 03.10.22 @ 3:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Kirks Suburban 
Truck

Eldorado Gillig Prevost Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Neopart Muncie

                                   7 40106 2.05                        30.88             7.25             9.17             7.61             2.05             7.19             5.82 

Mohawk 233250 -                 stock  stock  75d  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                   7 10170 0.88                          2.08             2.25             2.10             1.98             0.88             1.89             2.27 

Mohawk 233250 -                 stock  stock  60d  5w  stock  stock  21d 

                                   6 40798 109.86                  202.94         125.00         119.56         157.86         109.86         125.90 

Neopart 233248 -                 4w  2w  7w  3w  6w  21d 

                                   5 41216 168.98                  168.98         240.00         322.12         345.45         249.82 

Eldorado 233252  4w 2w  stock  3w  120d 

                                   8 41215 134.04                  172.66         310.25         180.99         194.87         178.01         183.65         159.27         134.04 

Muncie 233245 -                stock  6w  10w  75d  5w  3w  stock  stock 

                                   5 41213 98.66                      98.66         170.11         236.33         163.13         191.92 

Eldorado 233252 -                 6w  10w  75d  17w  120d 

                                   7 40165 3.20                        41.85           31.85             7.51           11.90             3.20           11.25             9.88 

Mohawk 233250 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock stock

Pace RFQ# 421692



Due 03.10.22 @ 3:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Kirks Suburban 
Truck

Eldorado Gillig Prevost Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Neopart Muncie

Pace RFQ# 421692

                                   6 41227 14.00                      25.99           36.73           48.48           14.00           45.66           23.40 

Mohawk 233250 -                 stock  stock  stock  3w  3w  stock 

                                   6 41169 34.25                      46.93           34.25           43.90           43.82           43.30           50.33 

Gillig 233253 -                 stock  stock  5w 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock 

                                   6 30361 7.39                          8.91           12.80             7.39             7.41             9.15             7.88 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 stock  75d  stock 
 unapproved 

part  MOQ  stock 

                                   4 40632 0.16                          0.48             0.43             0.16             1.33 

Mohawk 233250  75d  stock  stock  stock 

                                   5 41205 0.95                          0.95             1.09             1.02             0.97             0.96 

Suburban Truck 233251  stock  75d  stock  3w  stock 

                                   5 10365 73.65                      91.57         143.89           73.65           84.60           83.84 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 stock  60d  6w  stock  stock 

                                   4 20535 46.10                      49.39           52.19           46.10           79.50 

Mohawk 233250 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 



Due 03.10.22 @ 3:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Kirks Suburban 
Truck

Eldorado Gillig Prevost Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Neopart Muncie

Pace RFQ# 421692

                                   5 41132 49.75                    107.94         108.96           49.75           98.64         113.88 

Neopart 233248  stock  9w 
 bid 6, need 

17  8w  60d 

                                   3 10416 421.97                  421.97         484.10         560.00 

Eldorado 233252  4w  8w  30d 

                                   1 10417 484.03                  484.03 

Eldorado 233252 -                 2w 

                                   6 41278 164.08                  164.08         225.00         254.33         232.50         219.28         237.77 

Eldorado 233252 -                 6w  stock  stock  2w  4w  21d 

                                   2 41295 19.22                      19.22           21.10 

Gillig 233253 -                 stock  stock 

                                   5 41332 294.83                  395.00         294.83         461.39         549.32         534.48 

Gillig 233253 -                 12w 
 unapproved 

part  4w  22w  30d 

                                   1 110003 273.02                  273.02 



Due 03.10.22 @ 3:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Kirks Suburban 
Truck

Eldorado Gillig Prevost Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Neopart Muncie

Pace RFQ# 421692

Eldorado 233252 -                 16w 

                                   6 410000 104.34                  134.09         155.10         164.26         107.10         104.34         109.55 

Mohawk 233250 -                 stock  4w  75d  stock  stock  21d 

                                   6 410009 120.34                  134.09         155.10         164.26         131.01         120.34         135.25 

Mohawk 233250 -                 stock  4w  75d  stock  7w  21d 

                                   5 410012 97.56                    200.00         229.45           97.56         223.17         226.66 

Gillig 233253 -                 2w  16w 
 unapproved 

part  12w  30d 

                                   5 410023 55.42                      67.54           69.03           72.12           59.22           55.42 

Muncie 233245 -                 stock  stock  3w  stock  stock 

                                   4 110014 104.79                  155.10         104.79         138.42         105.39 

Gillig 233253 -                 4w  stock  stock  stock 

                                   5 310008 93.60                    161.31         109.12         113.36           93.60           94.60 

Neopart 233248 -                 4w  3w  10w  stock  stock 

                                   2 210013 122.36                  122.36         355.89 



Due 03.10.22 @ 3:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Kirks Suburban 
Truck

Eldorado Gillig Prevost Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Neopart Muncie

Pace RFQ# 421692

Eldorado 233252 -                 8w  stock 

                                   1 110026 63.83                      63.83 

Eldorado 233252 -                 4w 

                                   1 110027 1.56                          1.56 

Eldorado 233252 -                 2w 

                                   6 410080 309.75                  425.38         350.00         418.55         364.60         309.75         359.89 

Gillig 233253 -                 stock  2w  75d  5w 
 unapproved 

part  21d 

                                   1 110038 1.56                          1.56 

Eldorado 233252 -                 2w 

                                   1 110039 0.45                          0.45 

Eldorado 233252 -                 2w 

                                   1 110049 5.24                          5.24 

Eldorado 233252 -                 2w 

                                   1 110051 13.34                      13.34 



Due 03.10.22 @ 3:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Kirks Suburban 
Truck

Eldorado Gillig Prevost Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Neopart Muncie

Pace RFQ# 421692

Eldorado 233252 -                 2w 

                                   1 310050 4,917.39           4,917.39 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 10w 

                                   1 110059 227.46                  227.46 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 13w 

                                   3 410112 94.80                    119.03         181.46           94.80 

Gillig 233253 -                 2w  11w 
 unapproved 

part 

                                   1 110064 1,427.46           1,427.46 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 11w 

                                   1 110065 420.58                  420.58 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 stock 

                                   1 110067 640.71                  640.71 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 10w 



Due 03.10.22 @ 3:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Kirks Suburban 
Truck

Eldorado Gillig Prevost Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Neopart Muncie

Pace RFQ# 421692

                                   6 410131 21.60                      69.00           39.80           42.16           21.60           43.96         170.65 

Gillig 233253 -                 stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  6w  stock 

                                   2 310060 169.12                  221.56         169.12 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                   3 310061 148.54                  155.19         183.03         148.54 

Gillig 233253 -                 12w  6w 
 unapproved 

part 

                                   3 110073 5.28                          7.50           11.63             5.28 

Gillig 233253 -                 stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                   2 110074 13.34                      15.00           13.34 

Aftermarket Parts 233249 -                 6w  stock 

                                   1 210002 372.32                  372.32 

Eldorado 233252 -                 8w 

                                   1 410074 317.22                  317.22 



Due 03.10.22 @ 3:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Kirks Suburban 
Truck

Eldorado Gillig Prevost Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Neopart Muncie

Pace RFQ# 421692

Eldorado 233252 -                 10w 

                                   5 41131 49.75                    107.94         106.48           49.75           98.64         113.50 

Mohawk 233250 -                
 bid 15, 
need 17  9w  6w  stock  56d 


	421692

