Pace RFQ# 421665

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

Sku Winning bid | A&A Auto | Interstate Vehicle Neopart | MW Bus- | Coffman Muncie Crossline | Suburban | Mohawk | Aftermarket HECS
Power |Maintenance| Trapgit- NO BID Truck Transit Supply Truck Parts
NO # of Bids NO BID
5 130613 2.74 15.97 13.64 15.25 2.74 18.61
unapproved
Coffman Truck 233218 - stock stock 30d part 7w
6 130611 205.00 287.48 245.61 262.49 245.72 313.55 205.00
unapproved
HECS 233219 - 20d stock stock part stock stock
- 110135 -
9 120488 16.63 19.49 19.48 16.63 18.13 18.49 19.48 18.71 20.73 17.65
Vehicle Maintenance 233208 4w 14d stock aw 30d 2w 30d 5w 21d
2 110100 2.29 3.50 2.29
Aftermarket Parts 233200 - stock stock
3 110058 2.86 5.79 2.86 4.82
unapproved
Aftermarket Parts 233200 - 21d part 5w
1 120535 263.81 263.81
Muncie Transit 233198 - stock
- 120553 -




Pace RFQ# 421665

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

Sku Winning bid | A&A Auto | Interstate Vehicle Neopart | MW Bus- | Coffman Muncie Crossline | Suburban | Mohawk | Aftermarket HECS
Power |Maintenance | Trangit - NO BID Truck Transit Supply Truck Parts

NO # of Bids NO BID

1 1210047 56.33 56.33
Aftermarket Parts 233200 - 8w

1 1210048 59.36 59.36
Aftermarket Parts 233200 4w

- 1110002 -

5 1210071 172.00 205.59 202.80 174.40 172.00 262.96

unapproved

Crossline Supply 233215 stock stock stock part stock

3 1210092 30.32 30.32 33.70 39.14
Coffman Truck 233218 stock stock 5w

4 1210093 36.12 36.12 43.15 44.52 46.64
Coffman Truck 233218 - stock 30d 5w 7w

3 1210097 18.54 18.54 22.35 39.01
Coffman Truck 233218 90d 21d 9w

2 1110004 79.80 79.80 87.14
Muncie Transit 233198 30d 3w




Pace RFQ# 421665

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

Sku Winning bid | A&A Auto | Interstate Vehicle Neopart | MW Bus- | Coffman Muncie Crossline | Suburban | Mohawk | Aftermarket HECS
Power |Maintenance| Trapgit- NO BID Truck Transit Supply Truck Parts
NO # of Bids NO BID
- 1210130 -
1 1210137 65.81 65.81
Coffman Truck 233218 - stock
- 1210150 -
-| 1210151 -
- 1210078 -
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