
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance
Neopart 
Transit

Kirks MW Bus - 
NO BID

Rex Sales  Coffman Muncie 
Transit

Crossline 
Supply

Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Gillig

                                  6 100223 51.00                     66.94        102.66          99.85          51.00        146.14          75.47 

Crossline Supply 233215 -                 stock  90d  stock  stock  6w 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  5 100231 149.61                154.53        149.61        218.00        193.61        177.92 

Coffman 233218 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                   - 1010005 -                

-                

                                  6 1010011 948.00             1,227.20        948.00     1,295.00     1,396.43     1,807.15     1,075.00 

Kirks 233209  10d  stock stock  stock  6w  4w 

                                  7 1010014 3.00                          7.77             3.02             3.00             9.78             3.40          12.50             8.25 

Rex Sales 233211 -                 stock stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  6 1010015 968.00             1,294.56        968.00     1,295.00     1,523.38     1,904.23     1,075.00 

Kirks 233209 -                 10d  stock  stock  90d  13w  stock 

                                  2 1010016 2,485.45          2,485.45     3,123.24 

Coffman 233218 -                 90d  7w 

                                  4 1010024 66.07                     66.07          70.15          76.64          83.90 

Coffman 233218 -                 stock  30d  7w  4w 

Pace RFQ# 421664



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance
Neopart 
Transit

Kirks MW Bus - 
NO BID

Rex Sales  Coffman Muncie 
Transit

Crossline 
Supply

Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Gillig

Pace RFQ# 421664

                                  7 1010028 6.00                          6.00             9.00          12.69          15.72          16.42             6.36          14.50 

Kirks 233209 -                 stock  stock  stock  30d  5w 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  6 1010029 15.75                     15.75          39.86          47.68          51.59          16.44          31.11 

Kirks 233209  stock  stock  30d  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  7 1010032 55.00                     80.12        118.29        115.70          55.00        147.87          73.60        131.72 

Crossline Supply 233214  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  4w 

                                  6 1010038 25.00                     25.00          30.90          60.23          65.16          32.46          59.35 

Kirks 233209  stock  stock  30d  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  4 1010052 98.11                     98.11        114.56        125.96        128.83 

Coffman 233218  stock  30d  9w  stock 

                                  2 1010060 2,429.35          2,429.35     3,579.59 

Coffman 233218 -                 90d  9w 

                                  6 1010061 938.00             1,067.20        938.00     1,025.00     1,269.49     1,586.86        995.00 

Kirks 233209  10d  stock stock  90d  9w  4w 

                                  4 1010068 617.00                617.00     1,198.12        837.56     1,287.29 

Kirks 233209  stock  stock  stock  stock 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance
Neopart 
Transit

Kirks MW Bus - 
NO BID

Rex Sales  Coffman Muncie 
Transit

Crossline 
Supply

Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Gillig

Pace RFQ# 421664

                                  3 1010070 309.18                519.13        309.18        670.52 

Crossline Supply 233215 -                 90d  stock  5w 

                                   - 1010092 -                

-                


	421664

