
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance
Gillig Kirks Prevost MW Bus- 

NO BID
Coffman Rex Sales CBM Neopart 

Transit
Crossline 

Supply
Aftermarket 

Parts
Muncie Mohawk

                                   - 81055 -                

-                

                                  4 81061 34.30                     94.56        122.12        112.72          34.30 

Mohawk 233199 -                 stock  stock  30d  stock 

                                  5 81313 42.00                     67.71          92.93          83.53          55.68          42.00 

Muncie 233198 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  3 81385 13.32                     13.32          17.20          15.99 

Coffman 233210  stock  10w  30d 

                                  4 81422 1.60                         2.15            2.78            2.76            1.60 

Coffman 233210 -                 stock  7w  30d 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  6 81444 59.40                     71.75        109.23          74.80          80.75          79.79          59.40 

Mohawk 233199 -                 4w  stock  6w  8w  60d  stock 

                                  5 81516 10.00                     10.61          10.00          12.48          11.77          12.86 

Rex Sales 233213 -                 stock  stock  9w  30d  30d 

                                  4 81528 2.20                         2.23            2.20            2.84            6.72 

Aftermarket Parts 233200 -                 stock  stock  30d  30d 

                                  4 81533 12.69                     13.61          45.86          27.58          12.69 

Mohawk 233199 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 

Pace RFQ# 421663



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance
Gillig Kirks Prevost MW Bus- 

NO BID
Coffman Rex Sales CBM Neopart 

Transit
Crossline 

Supply
Aftermarket 

Parts
Muncie Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 421663

                                  2 810026 970.56                970.56     1,231.77 

Coffman 233210  stock  9w 

                                  2 810027 559.60                559.60        710.14 

Coffman 233210  90d  9w 

                                  4 810030 1.39                         2.49            3.27            2.97            1.39 

Coffman 233210  stock  7w  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  3 810036 40.83                     40.83          48.60          44.38 

Coffman 233210  stock  7w  30d 

                                  2 810045 567.53                567.53        637.54 

Coffman 233210 -                 90d  7w 

                                  6 810060 28.37                     39.24          32.00          29.00          50.93          32.00          28.37 

Crossline Supply 233215  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  2 810061 3,592.13          3,592.13     4,584.94 

Coffman 233210  90d  9w 

                                  2 810064 4,427.93          4,579.65     4,427.93 

Aftermarket Parts 233200 -                 90d  7w 

                                  2 810070 1,044.02          1,044.02     1,355.37 

Coffman 233210 -                 90d  7w 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance
Gillig Kirks Prevost MW Bus- 

NO BID
Coffman Rex Sales CBM Neopart 

Transit
Crossline 

Supply
Aftermarket 

Parts
Muncie Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 421663

                                  4 810073 117.19                144.82        117.19        148.72        118.05 

Coffman 233210 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  3 810078 431.48                431.48        561.69        455.00 

Coffman 233210 -                 stock  5w  30d 

                                  4 810079 431.48                431.48        495.00        561.69        439.00 

Coffman 233210 -                 stock  stock  7w  stock 

                                  3 810086 87.43                     87.43        103.19          94.65 

Coffman 233210 -                 stock  stock  30d 

                                  4 810101 220.00                230.07        220.00        295.37        229.66 

Crossline Supply 233215 -                 stock  stock  6w  stock 

                                  3 810102 3.21                         3.21            4.13            3.80 

Coffman 233210 -                 stock  5w  30d 

                                  3 810123 59.01                     59.01          76.20          74.12 

Coffman 233210 -                 stock  5w  30d 

                                  4 810118 117.68                145.42        117.68        151.97        138.89 

Coffman 233210 -                 2w  stock  13w  30d 

                                  2 810128 630.41                630.41        756.62 

Coffman 233210 -                 stock  stock 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance
Gillig Kirks Prevost MW Bus- 

NO BID
Coffman Rex Sales CBM Neopart 

Transit
Crossline 

Supply
Aftermarket 

Parts
Muncie Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 421663

                                   - 810129 -                

-                

                                  2 810130 431.48                431.48        561.69 

Coffman 233210 -                 90d  5w 

                                  3 810178 175.56                175.56        225.39        207.20 

Coffman 233210 -                 stock  5w  30d 

                                  4 810220 418.00                451.50        418.00        576.28        532.88 

Coffman 233210 -                 stock 
 unapproved 

part  5w  30d 

                                  3 810241 3.41                         3.41            4.40            4.02 

Coffman 233210 -                 stock  stock  30d 

                                  6 810271 33.99                     35.95          33.99          80.61          97.87          89.45          91.98 

Kirks 233209 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  30d  4w 

                                  4 810286 25.94                     26.97          34.83          31.83          25.94 

Coffman 233210 -                 stock  9w  21d 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  3 810287 1.77                         1.77            2.13            1.90 

Coffman 233210 -                 stock  4w  30d 

                                  3 810346 28.29                     28.29          33.55          30.66 

Coffman 233210 -                 stock  5w  21d 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance
Gillig Kirks Prevost MW Bus- 

NO BID
Coffman Rex Sales CBM Neopart 

Transit
Crossline 

Supply
Aftermarket 

Parts
Muncie Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 421663

                                  3 810369 13.86                     13.86          16.11          14.75 

Coffman 233210 -                 stock  9w  30d 

                                  3 810371 11.51                     11.51          14.69          13.90 

Coffman 233210 -                 stock  5w  30d 

                                  3 810388 40.53                     40.53          48.07          47.39 

Coffman 233210 -                 90d  5w  21d 

                                  4 810389 284.45                339.43        284.45        305.00        402.55 

CBM 233214 -                 90d  stock  stock  90d 

                                   - 810000 -                

-                

                                  1 810313 0.14                         0.14 

Aftermarket Parts 233200 -                 120d 

                                   - 810374 -                

-                


	421663

