
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid P&G Keene Interstate 

Power
Prevost A&A Auto Kirks Coffman MW Bus - 

NO BID
Neopart 
Transit

Muncie 
Transit

Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Gillig Battery 
Service

                                  6 72139 345.27                404.12        345.27        380.25        436.42        372.67        376.66 

Coffman 233210 -                 stock  stock  30d  stock  4w  stock 

                                   - 72125 -                

-                

                                  3 71875 4.70                         4.70            5.25            5.39 

Aftermarket Parts 233200 -                 MOQ  stock  stock 

                                  4 71441 6.25                         6.25            7.72            7.10            7.08 

Muncie Transit 233198  stock  19w  stock  stock 

                                  4 72143 10.50                     11.36          10.95          11.20          10.50 

Gillig 233204 -                 8w  stock  12w  6w 

                                  2 71357 10.75                     10.75          12.47 

Aftermarket Parts 233200 -                 stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  4 71100 0.09                         1.16            0.10            0.09            0.11 

Aftermarket Parts 233200 -                 10d  stock 4w  2w 

                                   - 72077 -                

-                

                                  4 71091 0.09                         0.55            0.09            0.15            0.18 

Muncie Transit 233198 -                 5d  stock  stock  stock 

Pace RFQ# 421661



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid P&G Keene Interstate 

Power
Prevost A&A Auto Kirks Coffman MW Bus - 

NO BID
Neopart 
Transit

Muncie 
Transit

Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Gillig Battery 
Service

Pace RFQ# 421661

                                  2 70730 0.15                         0.88            0.15 

Mohawk 233199  stock  stock 

                                  1 71001 0.30                         0.30 

Muncie Transit 233198  77d 

                                  4 72162 28.15                     62.31          32.85          50.85          28.15 

Mohawk 233199  75d  stock  7w  stock 

                                  2 72171 32.08                     32.08          46.26 

Aftermarket Parts 233200  MOQ  16w 

                                  3 72216 144.00                227.31        161.83        144.00 

Gillig 233204 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                  3 72216 144.00                227.31        161.83        144.00 

Gillig 233204  stock  stock  stock 

                                   - 72249 -                

                                  4 72301 277.50                379.00        450.00        334.16        277.50 

Battery Service 233212 -                 4w  30d  5w  3w 

                                  4 72301 277.50                379.00        450.00        334.16        277.50 

Battery Service 233212 -                 4w  30d  5w  3w 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid P&G Keene Interstate 

Power
Prevost A&A Auto Kirks Coffman MW Bus - 

NO BID
Neopart 
Transit

Muncie 
Transit

Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Gillig Battery 
Service

Pace RFQ# 421661

                                  3 72342 7.76                       16.04            7.76          15.72 

Muncie Transit 233198 -                 75d  21d  stock 

                                  6 72388 38.25                     84.86          67.56          71.50          56.89          38.25          40.00 

Mohawk 233199 -                 stock  8w  45d  9w  stock  stock 

                                   - 710004 -                

-                

                                   - 710013 -                

-                

                                  1 710027 37.28                     37.28 

Aftermarket Parts 233200 -                 9w 

                                  1 710064 7.19                         7.19 

Muncie Transit 233198 -                 49d 

                                  1 710093 73.25                     73.25 

Aftermarket Parts 233200 -                 stock 

                                   - 710130 -                

-                

                                  4 710151 367.55                375.00        478.00        386.98        367.55 
Availability - Muncie 
Transit 233198 -                 180d  6w  stock  13w 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid P&G Keene Interstate 

Power
Prevost A&A Auto Kirks Coffman MW Bus - 

NO BID
Neopart 
Transit

Muncie 
Transit

Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Gillig Battery 
Service

Pace RFQ# 421661

                                  2 710152 662.95             1,045.00        662.95 

Aftermarket Parts 233200 -                 stock  20w 

                                   - 710247 -                

-                

                                  1 710262 669.27                669.27 

Aftermarket Parts 233200 -                 81w 

                                  1 710263 442.96                442.96 

Aftermarket Parts 233200 -                 stock 

                                  4 710281 51.49                     68.29          56.00          60.60          51.49 

Gillig 233204 -                 4w  21d  5w  stock 

                                  1 710302 6.29                         6.29 

Aftermarket Parts 233200 -                 stock 

                                  3 710380 666.31                666.31        797.02        857.27 

Coffman 233210 -                 stock  30d  stock 

                                  2 710419 8.10                         8.10          10.38 

Muncie Transit 233198 -                 21d  stock 

                                  1 710420 10.71                     10.71 

Aftermarket Parts 233200 -                 8w 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid P&G Keene Interstate 

Power
Prevost A&A Auto Kirks Coffman MW Bus - 

NO BID
Neopart 
Transit

Muncie 
Transit

Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Gillig Battery 
Service

Pace RFQ# 421661

                                  1 710421 10.71                     10.71 

Aftermarket Parts 233200 -                 8w 

                                  2 710422 3.77                         8.21            3.77 

Aftermarket Parts 233200 -                 MOQ  7w 

                                  1 710423 7.37                         7.37 

Aftermarket Parts 233200 -                 5w 

                                  1 710424 10.77                     10.77 

Aftermarket Parts 233200 -                 5w 

                                   - 71038 -                


	421661

