
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance
Interstate 

Power
Kirks  Gillig Triangle 

Radiator
Coffman MW Bus - 

NO BID
CBM Rex 

Welding
Neopart 
Transit

Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk Muncie 
Transit

Aftermarket 
Parts

Suburban 
Truck 

                                   - 60735 -                

-                

                                  2 60790 561.48                561.48        575.97 

Muncie Transit 233198 -                 95d  8w 

                                   - 60792 -                

-                

                                  6 610019 83.00                      83.00        151.72           88.24           91.45        109.97           84.81 

Kirks 233209  stock  stock  stock  30d  7w  stock 

                                10 610026 103.13                103.13        135.00        395.57        325.91        152.56        191.21        115.00        174.79        320.94        423.10 

Vehicle Maintenance 233208 -                 stock stock  2w  stock  stock  4w  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  4w 

                                  9 610028 16.75                      48.75           32.00           84.15           43.80           16.75           59.21           28.80           54.09           94.14 

Coffman 233210 -                 14d 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock 

                                  5 610031 24.00                      24.00           30.62           38.61           30.83           39.39 

Kirks 233209 -                 stock  stock  3w  stock  stock 

                                  4 610033 599.00                599.00        739.49     1,238.73     1,004.25 

Kirks 233209 -                 stock  stock  4w  5w 

                                   - 610036 -                

-                

                                  2 610054 1,695.00          3,259.00     1,695.00 

Rex Welding 233211 15d  10d 

                                  3 610058 50.77                   100.22           50.77        315.33 

Gillig 233204  4w 
 unapproved 

part  5w 

                                   - 610087 -                

Pace RFQ# 421660



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance
Interstate 

Power
Kirks  Gillig Triangle 

Radiator
Coffman MW Bus - 

NO BID
CBM Rex 

Welding
Neopart 
Transit

Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk Muncie 
Transit

Aftermarket 
Parts

Suburban 
Truck 

Pace RFQ# 421660

                                  4 610139 78.41                      78.41           88.83           84.73           92.71 

Coffman 233210  stock  4w  80d  7w 


	421660

