Pace RFQ# 421659
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
Sku Winning bid |[Rome Truck| Vehicle Neopart Prevost Muncie Mohawk | Aftermarket | Suburban Gillig
-NOBID |Maintenance |  Transit Transit Parts Truck
NO # of Bids
41131 49.75 98.64 113.50 49.75 106.48 107.94
Mohawk 233199 - stock 56d stock stock stock
40109 0.30 1.65 2.51 2.20 0.30 1.07 1.96 2.25
Mohawk 233199 - stock stock stock stock 13w stock stock
40958 28.62 46.77 28.62 42.16 72.34 34.60
unapproved
Gillig 233204 - 4w part 10w stock stock
40798 109.86 109.86 143.80 126.00 138.86 120.26 125.00
Neopart 233196 3w 75d 21d 4w 7w 6w
41213 170.11 236.33 244.35 176.55 170.11
Gillig 233204 - 75d 30d 13w 4w
40165 3.20 11.25 9.88 3.20 11.97 7.75
Mohawk 233199 - stock stock stock stock stock
41217 92.36 142.63 112.00 92.36 98.18 145.53




Pace RFQ# 421659
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
Sku Winning bid |[Rome Truck| Vehicle Neopart Prevost Muncie Mohawk | Aftermarket | Suburban Gillig
-NOBID |Maintenance |  Transit Transit Parts Truck
NO # of Bids
Mohawk 233199 - 75d 21d stock stock stock
4 10405 123.70 178.75 123.70 147.17 128.16
Mohawk 233199 - 30d stock stock 4w
5 40632 0.16 0.47 0.48 0.50 0.16 0.44
Mohawk 233199 - stock 75d MOQ stock stock
6 40922 17.55 39.96 27.60 17.55 33.33 68.27 31.12
Availability - Muncie
Transit 233199 stock stock 5w stock stock 2w
5 41205 0.96 0.96 1.09 1.10 3.76 1.05
Neopart 233196 stock 75d 21d stock stock
5 10365 73.78 143.89 73.78 85.60 74.72 83.68
Muncie Transit 233198 75d stock stock 3w stock
4 20535 46.10 79.52 46.10 54.72 52.29
Mohawk 233199 42d stock 9w 4w




Pace RFQ# 421659
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
Sku Winning bid |[Rome Truck| Vehicle Neopart Prevost Muncie Mohawk | Aftermarket | Suburban Gillig
-NOBID |Maintenance |  Transit Transit Parts Truck
NO # of Bids
41132 49.75 98.64 114.57 49.75 109.60 107.94
Mohawk 233199 - stock 56d stock stock stock
41240 85.25 98.85 85.25 103.20 99.89 89.29
Muncie Transit 233198 3w stock 4w 6w stock
41272 36.08 36.08 41.50 39.26 40.32 39.48
Neopart Transit 233196 stock 30d 3w 5w stock
41273 36.08 36.08 44.54 41.50 39.26 40.32 39.48
Neopart Transit 233196 - stock 75d 30d 3w stock stock
10416 484.10 528.52 484.10
Aftermarket Parts 233200 - 28d 7w
20721 272.14 272.14 327.95 358.85
Prevost 233197 - 90d 47d 10w




Pace RFQ# 421659
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
Sku Winning bid |[Rome Truck| Vehicle Neopart Prevost Muncie Mohawk | Aftermarket | Suburban Gillig
-NO BID |Maintenance| Transit Transit Parts Truck
NO # of Bids
41288 63.32 108.90 63.32 107.53 82.16
unapproved
Gillig 233204 - 6w part stock stock
41332 315.05 549.32 528.52 471.39 315.05 395.00
unapproved
Gillig 233204 - 10w 28d 4w part 8w
110003 =
410000 109.34 164.26 109.55 109.34 116.03 135.36
Mohawk 233199 - 75d 21d stock stock stock
410003 176.77 176.77 235.00 185.49 179.42 200.05 205.00
Neopart Transit 233196 - 4w 75d 21d 4w 6w 4w
410006 119.56 233.17 226.66 119.56 229.45 200.00
unapproved
Gillig 233204 - l6w 21d part lew 4w
410009 120.34 164.26 127.79 120.34 131.45 135.36




Pace RFQ# 421659
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
Sku Winning bid |[Rome Truck| Vehicle Neopart Prevost Muncie Mohawk | Aftermarket | Suburban Gillig
-NOBID |Maintenance |  Transit Transit Parts Truck
NO # of Bids
Mohawk 233199 - 75d 21d stock stock stock
410010 127.90 185.80 151.20 127.90 151.10 349.15 128.87
unapproved
Gillig 233204 - stock stock part stock stock stock
210002 -
110014 104.79 105.39 147.92 104.79
Gillig 233204 - stock stock stock
310008 94.60 153.16 94.60 114.03
Muncie Transit 233198 - stock 21d 13w
310017 291 341 3.19 291 3.00
Aftermarket Parts 233200 - MOQ stock stock stock
210013 =




Pace RFQ# 421659
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
Sku Winning bid |[Rome Truck| Vehicle Neopart Prevost Muncie Mohawk | Aftermarket | Suburban Gillig
-NOBID |Maintenance |  Transit Transit Parts Truck
NO # of Bids
- 110027 -
- 410074 -
7 410080 310.50 355.89 418.55 359.89 310.50 366.72 425.38 350.15
unapproved
Gillig 233204 - 3w 75d 21d part 5w stock 6w
4 410081 5.23 5.23 5.97 5.77 5.71
Neopart Transit 233196 - stock 21d stock stock
4 110042 35.16 35.16 46.60 43.63 39.69
bid 16,
Aftermarket Parts 233200 - need 20 30d 4w 5w
6 410131 21.60 45.95 44.99 21.60 42.16 69.00 39.80
unapproved
Gillig 233204 - 6w stock part stock stock stock




Pace RFQ# 421659

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

Sku Winning bid |[Rome Truck| Vehicle Neopart Prevost Muncie Mohawk | Aftermarket | Suburban Gillig
-NOBID |Maintenance |  Transit Transit Parts Truck

NO # of Bids

1 210037 25.24 25.24
Aftermarket Parts 233200 - 8w

1 210038 23.44 23.44
Aftermarket Parts 233200 - 10w

1 210039 56.90 56.90
Aftermarket Parts 233200 - 6w




	421659

