
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
MW Bus - 

NO BID
CBM Prevost - 

NO BID
Gillig Crossline Neopart Vehicle 

Maintenance
Kirks A&A Auto Suburban 

Truck 
Coffman Aftermarket 

Parts
Muncie Mohawk

                                   4 110085 16.55                   103.50        122.33        110.60           16.55 
Availability - 
Aftermarket Parts 233161 -                 90d  stock  21d 

 unapproved 
part 

                                   3 110100 2.00                          2.00             2.29             3.50 

Gillig 233155 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                   7 100223 51.00                   131.10           51.00           68.70        103.20        127.99           99.85           75.47 

Crossline 233164 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  6w  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                   2 120509 21.05                      21.05           29.57 

Coffman 233166  stock  4w 

                                   7 1210003 20.92                      20.92           33.55           21.12           22.75           30.88           22.35           22.55 

Vehicle Maintenance 233157 -                
 unapproved 

part stock  stock  stock  stock  30d  2w 

                                   2 1210016 785.02                 802.08        785.02 

Aftermarket Parts 233161 -                 MOQ  18w 

                                   5 1010014 3.05                          3.05             9.78           12.58             3.40             8.25 

Kirks 233163 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                   6 1010015 969.00              1,294.56        969.00     1,520.20     1,931.60     1,409.78     1,040.00 

Kirks 233163 -                 10d  stock  stock  stock  21d  stock 

                                   2 1010016 2,485.45          2,485.45     3,123.24 

Coffman 233166 -                 stock  7w 

                                   7 1210033 26.76                      29.32           26.99           29.32           26.99           32.90           42.89           26.76 

Mohawk 233160  3w  stock  2w  14d  stock  30d  stock 

                                   3 1010024 66.07                      66.07           77.09           70.15 

Pace RFQ# 421630



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
MW Bus - 

NO BID
CBM Prevost - 

NO BID
Gillig Crossline Neopart Vehicle 

Maintenance
Kirks A&A Auto Suburban 

Truck 
Coffman Aftermarket 

Parts
Muncie Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 421630

Coffman 233166  stock  7w  stock 

                                   7 1010032 55.00                   131.72           55.00           80.12        117.92        147.87        115.70           57.60 

Crossline 233164 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                   4 1010034 32.21                      45.76           58.90           53.90           32.21 

Coffman 233166  stock  14w  21d 
 unapproved 

part 

                                   3 1010035 98.22                      98.22        126.70        114.65 

Coffman 233166 -                 stock  7w  30d 

                                   3 1010036 98.22                      98.22        126.70        114.65 

Coffman 233166  stock  7w  30d 

                                   - 1110002 -                

                                   5 1210070 50.56                      63.99           54.39           50.56           60.61           60.02 

Coffman 233166 -                 4w  stock  stock  stock  3w 

                                   4 1210071 172.50                 207.11        264.50        202.80        172.50 

Muncie 233159 -                 stock  9w  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                   4 1010052 98.63                   144.60           98.63        126.70        114.56 

Coffman 233166 -                 4w  stock  9w  30d 

                                   5 1010053 5.45                          6.50             8.36           10.81             9.99             5.45 

Kirks 233163 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                   3 1010055 98.22                      98.22        126.70        114.56 

Coffman 233166 -                 stock  14w  30d 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
MW Bus - 

NO BID
CBM Prevost - 

NO BID
Gillig Crossline Neopart Vehicle 

Maintenance
Kirks A&A Auto Suburban 

Truck 
Coffman Aftermarket 

Parts
Muncie Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 421630

                                   2 1010060 2,429.35          2,429.35     3,588.01 

Coffman 233166 -                 stock  9w 

                                   6 1010061 939.00              1,067.20        939.00     1,269.49     1,586.86     1,505.99     1,052.00 

Kirks 233163 -                 10d  stock  stock  9w  21d  4w 

                                   3 1010062 28.54                      28.54           36.82           31.95 

Coffman 233166 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                   5 1210119 922.00                 922.00        948.69     1,463.77     1,738.11     1,570.89 

Crossline 233164 -                 stock  stock  stock  4w  21d 

                                   1 1210133 56.61                      56.61 

Aftermarket Parts 233161 -                 18w 

                                   - 1210078 -                

-                

                                   - 1210130 -                

-                

                                   - 1010092 -                

-                


	421630

