Pace RFQ# 421629

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
[N N O N
Sku Winning bid | Rex Sales | MW Bus - CBM Kirks Prevost - Gillig Crossline | Neopart Vehicle | Area Diesel | Aftermarket |  Muncie Mohawk | Coffman
NO BID NO BID Maintenance - Parts
NO # of Bids NO BID
4 81497 1,969.69 1,969.69 3,034.57 2,600.00 2,128.67
Area Diesel 233165 - stock 5w 60d 90d
6 81516 10.00 10.00 11.28 12.55 11.77 12.86 10.61
Rex Sales 233162 - stock stock 9w 30d 6w 7d
3 81519 65.00 65.00 117.83 91.76
Kirks 233163 - stock 9w 4w
- 810000 -
3 810026 969.70 1,238.93 1,158.66 969.70
bid 1, need
Coffman 233166 - 9w 4 stock
3 810027 558.45 649.52 714.27 558.45
Coffman 233166 - stock 9w stock
5 810030 1.39 2.60 3.29 2.85 1.39 2.51
Mohawk 233160 - stock 9w stock 5w stock
4 810031 1.95 10.71 9.75 1.95 8.42
unapproved
Coffman 233166 - 4w 30d part stock
2 810032 1,092.21 1,329.88 1,092.21
Coffman 233166 - 30d stock
3 810064 4,379.65 4,379.65 4,453.97 4,579.65
Area Diesel 233165 2w 7w 90d




Pace RFQ# 421629

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
[N N O N
Sku Winning bid | Rex Sales | MW Bus - CBM Kirks Prevost - Gillig Crossline | Neopart Vehicle | Area Diesel | Aftermarket |  Muncie Mohawk | Coffman
NO BID NO BID Maintenance - Parts
NO # of Bids NO BID
5 810073 117.57 136.78 149.58 118.05 139.38 117.57
Coffman 233166 6w 7w stock 5w stock
3 810078 430.60 565.03 510.00 430.60
Coffman 233166 5w 21d stock
5 810079 428.85 428.85 510.86 565.03 439.00 430.60
Crossline 233164 stock stock 7w stock stock
2 810110 1,421.47 1,437.14 1,421.47
Coffman 233166 - stock 90d
3 810125 42.00 129.56 42.00 110.38
unapproved
Coffman 233166 7w part 90d
3 810128 700.11 729.40 761.04 700.11
Coffman 233166 stock stock stock
4 810130 428.85 428.85 565.03 510.00 430.60
Crossline 233164 - stock 5w 30d 90d
6 810154 6.47 18.75 10.35 11.52 11.00 6.47 8.89
unapproved
Coffman 233166 - stock stock 8w 30d part stock
3 810178 177.04 256.94 197.00 177.04
Coffman 233166 - 5w stock stock
3 810203 2,951.52 2,969.69 3,779.83 2,951.52
Coffman 233166 - stock 5w stock




Pace RFQ# 421629

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
[N N O N
Sku Winning bid | Rex Sales | MW Bus - CBM Kirks Prevost - Gillig Crossline | Neopart Vehicle | Area Diesel | Aftermarket |  Muncie Mohawk | Coffman
NO BID NO BID Maintenance - Parts

NO # of Bids NO BID

4 810204 1,584.74 2,500.00 1,596.69 1,611.64 1,584.74
Coffman 233166 - stock stock 5w stock

4 810209 22.24 29.12 26.11 24.10 22.24
Coffman 233166 - stock 5w 30d stock

2 810227 1,110.05 1,848.22 1,110.05
Coffman 233166 - 5w 90d

5 810230 3.65 3.85 4.27 3.92 5.64 3.65
Coffman 233166 - stock 5w 30d 30d stock

3 810303 487.17 979.75 487.17 624.83
Muncie 233159 - 12w 21d 90d

- 810313 -

1 810319 1.21 1.21
Aftermarket Parts 233161 - 5w

5 810345 202.33 257.61 232.88 259.11 240.54 202.33
Coffman 233166 - 3w stock stock stock stock

4 810348 3.59 3.73 4.62 4.37 3.59
Coffman 233166 - stock 7w 30d stock

4 810364 2.69 2.79 3.45 3.24 2.69
Coffman 233166 - stock 7w 30d stock




Pace RFQ# 421629

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
[N N O N
Sku Winning bid | Rex Sales | MW Bus - CBM Kirks Prevost - Gillig Crossline | Neopart Vehicle | Area Diesel | Aftermarket |  Muncie Mohawk | Coffman
NO BID NO BID Maintenance - Parts

NO # of Bids NO BID

4 810369 13.66 14.65 16.21 14.75 13.66
Coffman 233166 - stock 9w 30d stock

1 810385 241 2.41
Coffman 233166 - stock

4 810386 3.04 3.50 3.90 3.66 3.04
Coffman 233166 - stock 7w 30d stock

3 810387 10.05 11.11 11.70 10.05
Coffman 233166 - stock 30d stock

3 810388 40.83 48.35 48.50 40.83
Coffman 233166 - 5w 30d 7d

- 810374 -
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