
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid IO Controls Eldorado Interstate 

Power
P&G Gillig Kirks Neopart Prevost Vehicle 

Maintenance
Battery 
Service

Muncie Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Crossline - 
NO BID

                                    4 71089 0.05                           0.37             0.10             0.06             0.05 

Aftermarket Parts 233161 -                  5d  stock  stock  stock 

                                    4 71733 78.99                    105.00         109.34           78.99           82.66 

Aftermarket Parts 233161 -                  10w  stock 
 bid 14, 
need 20  9w 

                                    6 70797 4.37                         23.76             8.30             8.88             8.36             5.36             4.37 

Mohawk 233160 -                  4w  60d  stock  stock  stock  150d 

                                    4 72121 31.51                    105.44           55.00           31.51           70.72 

Prevost 233156  6w 6w  60d  5w 

                                    5 71441 6.25                         30.97             7.08             6.25             7.08             7.76 

Muncie 233159 -                  1w  stock  stock  stock  19w 

                                    1 71641 6.15                           6.15 

Muncie 233159 -                  120d 

                                    4 72135 58.62                    111.65           64.71           61.75           58.62 

Aftermarket Parts 233161 -                  6w  8w  60d  stock 

                                    1 71941 3.45                           3.45 

Aftermarket Parts 233161 -                  stock 

                                    1 72120 111.65                  111.65 

Eldorado 233153 -                  2w 

                                    4 72109 713.55              1,290.02         713.55     1,172.72     1,576.69 

Eldorado 233153  12w  8w 12w  10w 

Pace RFQ# 421628



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid IO Controls Eldorado Interstate 

Power
P&G Gillig Kirks Neopart Prevost Vehicle 

Maintenance
Battery 
Service

Muncie Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Crossline - 
NO BID

Pace RFQ# 421628

                                    3 72156 22.45                      23.10           22.45           22.61 

Muncie 233159  8w  60d  3w 

                                    1 72163 496.45                  496.45 

Eldorado 233153  4w 

                                    2 72171 21.66                      21.66           37.59 

Eldorado 233153  2w  3w 

                                    1 72182 4.28                           4.28 

Eldorado 233153 -                  stock 

                                    3 72184 5.39                         14.44             6.20             5.39 

Aftermarket Parts 233161  stock  stock  stock 

                                    5 72194 74.47                    148.90           75.95           95.39           84.94           74.47 

Aftermarket Parts 233161  6w  8w  75d  30d  stock 

                                    4 72216 144.00                  335.09         144.00         227.31         162.78 

Gillig 233155 -                  stock  stock  105d  stock 

                                    4 72238 1,267.53           2,066.87     1,267.53     1,800.00     2,526.17 

Eldorado 233153 -                  12w  4w  8w  14w 

                                    3 72270 5.45                           5.93             5.45             5.66 

Muncie 233159 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                    2 72301 277.50                  277.50         336.11 

Battery Service 233158 -                  4w  5w 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid IO Controls Eldorado Interstate 

Power
P&G Gillig Kirks Neopart Prevost Vehicle 

Maintenance
Battery 
Service

Muncie Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Crossline - 
NO BID

Pace RFQ# 421628

                                    2 72304 0.68                           0.89             0.68 

Aftermarket Parts 233161 -                  2w  5w 

                                    3 72303 1.43                           1.48             1.79             1.43 

Aftermarket Parts 233161 -                  2w 
 bid 6, need 

10  5w 

                                    1 710020 53.45                      53.45 

Aftermarket Parts 233161 -                  6w 

                                    5 710026 450.00                  488.46         450.00         693.70         466.23         544.38 

Gillig 233155 -                  stock  stock  60d  stock  5w 

                                    4 710052 2,386.80           3,325.72     2,386.80     2,700.00     2,717.72 

P&G 233154 -                  4w  stock  3w  60d 

                                    3 710115 27.75                      56.14           27.75           57.65 

Vehicle Maintenance 233157 -                  1w  stock  5w 

                                    3 710116 27.75                      56.14           27.75           30.12 

Vehicle Maintenance 233157 -                  1w  stock  9w 

                                    1 710247 312.95                  312.95 

Eldorado 233153 -                  10w 

                                     - 710262 -                 

-                 

                                    1 710418 30.67                      30.67 

Aftermarket Parts 233161 -                  8w 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid IO Controls Eldorado Interstate 

Power
P&G Gillig Kirks Neopart Prevost Vehicle 

Maintenance
Battery 
Service

Muncie Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Crossline - 
NO BID

Pace RFQ# 421628

                                     - 71038 -                 

-                 

                                    1 710414 570.14                  570.14 

Aftermarket Parts 233161 -                  8w 


	421628

