
Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Action Truck 

Parts

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

Crossline 

Supply

Coffman 

Truck Sales 

Inc.

ElDorado 

National 

Inc.

General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig LLC Hydraulic 

Electric 

Compone

nt Supply 

Inc.

Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive 

Inc.

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus Corp.

Mohawk 

Manufactu

ring and 

Supply Co.

Muncie 

Transit 

Supply

Neopart 

Transit LLC

The 

Aftermark

et Parts 

Company 

LLC

Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

5 290415 534.10                   570.00          600.00          534.10        607.88        651.43 

Neopart Transit LLC 

233150  4 Weeks  21 Days  2-3 Weeks  Stock  60 Days 

7 40615 38.00                     95.03            90.44          38.00          258.46            82.86          97.56          84.85 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing and 

Supply Co. 233148 -                 2 Weeks  Stock  Stock  30 Days  Stock 

 Est. 2 

Weeks  Stock 

5 290536 82.45                       84.81            91.60            82.45          93.84        109.85 

Neopart Transit LLC 

233150 -                 Stock  21 Days  2-3 Weeks  Stock  Stock 

1 20701 205.91                 205.91 

ElDorado National 

Inc. 233145  Stock 

7 10170 0.88                           2.34            0.88              2.30              1.89            1.99            2.10            2.08 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing and 

Supply Co. 233148 -                Stock  Stock 

 13 Stock 

Balance 21 

Days  Stock  Stock  60 Days  Stock 

7 40036 46.62                     78.78            46.62          49.49            99.95          131.54          56.05        132.80 

Gillig LLC 233146  2 Weeks  Stock  Mar 11th  Stock  3-4 Weeks  Stock  Stock 

5 290537 162.61                   196.69          190.55          162.61        217.63        229.51 

Neopart Transit LLC 

233150                    -    Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

4 250595 3.41                     8.49          3.41              3.90            3.84 

Midwest Bus Corp. 

233147 -                 Stock  10 Days  7-10 Days  6 Weeks 

2 41182 9.99               DQ              9.99          13.83 

The Aftermarket 

Parts Company LLC 

233151 -                

 Not an 

approved 

OEM part 

number.  90 Days  Stock 

4 290289 11.37                       26.56            11.54          11.37          12.20 

The Aftermarket 

Parts Company LLC 

233151  21 Days  2-3 Weeks  Stock  60 Days 

7 60494 10.98            10.98                 12.38          11.33            11.83          12.17          12.38                21.12 

Coffman Truck Sales 

Inc. 233144  7 Days 

 4 Stock 

Balance 

10-14 

Days  Mar 7th 

 12 PC Min. 

30 Days  3 Weeks  Stock  Stock 

4 40842 5.04                         5.04              6.35            7.87            9.29 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing and 

Supply Co. 233148  Stock  Stock  Stock  60 Days 

RFQ 421622 and 421625 Due: 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Action Truck 

Parts

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

Crossline 

Supply

Coffman 

Truck Sales 

Inc.

ElDorado 

National 

Inc.

General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig LLC Hydraulic 

Electric 

Compone

nt Supply 

Inc.

Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive 

Inc.

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus Corp.

Mohawk 

Manufactu

ring and 

Supply Co.

Muncie 

Transit 

Supply

Neopart 

Transit LLC

The 

Aftermark

et Parts 

Company 

LLC

Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 421622 and 421625 Due: 

7 40090 0.59                           0.74            1.02              0.65              0.59            0.65            0.67            0.94 

Neopart Transit LLC 

233150  Stock  Stock  21 Days  Stock  Stock  60 Days  Stock 

1 151960 6.77                         6.77 

ElDorado National 

Inc. 233145 -                 Stock 

3 60748 46.03                     68.21            49.05          46.03 

The Aftermarket 

Parts Company LLC 

233151  Stock  60 Days  Stock 

4 151975 1,029.10          1,783.39       1,029.10    1,067.70    1,265.37 

Muncie Transit Supply 

233149  Stock  35 Days  Stock  60 Days 

3 30421 114.80                 186.31          114.80          114.88 

Gillig LLC 233146  4 Weeks  Stock  Stock 

1 60772 21.66                     21.66 

ElDorado National 

Inc. 233145 -                 Stock 

5 290673 1,022.87          1,533.21       1,022.87       1,150.00    1,093.19    1,299.14 

Gillig LLC 233146

WEST HAS 0 ON 

HAND -                 4 Weeks  4-6 Weeks  21 Days 

 1 Stock 

Balance 6 

Weeks  90 Days 

1 10417 484.03                 484.03 

ElDorado National 

Inc. 233145 -                 Stock 

5 250718 592.53                   592.53    644.61      608.00          597.76        693.29 

Gillig LLC 233146  1-2 Weeks  Stock  10 Days  7-10 Days  Stock 

4 250731 11.58                       13.79      15.99        12.11            11.58 

Neopart Transit LLC 

233150 -                 1-2 Weeks  Stock  10 Days  7-10 Days 

1 60792 198.54                 198.54 

ElDorado National 

Inc. 233145 -                 Stock 

3 290700 169.04                 285.43          169.04        178.25 

Muncie Transit Supply 

233149   Stock  30 Days  24 Weeks 

6 410001 882.88             1,100.00    1,427.03          913.40          882.88        957.16    1,002.26 

Neopart Transit LLC 

233150

SOUTH - NO CORES, 

WEST - 4 CORES, 

SOUTHWEST 6 

CORES -                

 225.00 

(1325.00) 

Core 

Charge 

Stock  Mar 14th 

 330.00 

(1243.40) 

Core Charge 

7 Stock 

Balance 21 

Days 

 300.00 

(1182.88) 

Core Charge 

Stock 

 300.00 

(1257.16) 

Core 

Charge 

Stock 

 340.00 

(1342.26) 

Core 

Charge 

Stock 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Action Truck 

Parts

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

Crossline 

Supply

Coffman 

Truck Sales 

Inc.

ElDorado 

National 

Inc.

General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig LLC Hydraulic 

Electric 

Compone

nt Supply 

Inc.

Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive 

Inc.

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus Corp.

Mohawk 

Manufactu

ring and 

Supply Co.

Muncie 

Transit 

Supply

Neopart 

Transit LLC

The 

Aftermark

et Parts 

Company 

LLC

Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 421622 and 421625 Due: 

6 410002 903.32             1,100.00    1,427.03          913.40          903.32        957.16    1,002.26 

Neopart Transit LLC 

233150

WEST - 4 CORES, 

SOUTHWEST - 6 

CORES -                

 225.00 

Core 

Charge 

Stock  Mar 14th 

 330.00 Core 

Charge 30 

Days 

 300.00 

Core Charge 

Stock 

 300.00 

Core 

Charge 8 

Stock 

Balance 5 

Weeks 

 340.00 

Core 

Charge 

Stock 

5 410005 96.86                   380.34          99.27          101.74            96.86        106.32 

Neopart Transit LLC 

233150 -                 4 Weeks  Feb 26th  30 Days  3-4 Weeks  6 Weeks 

4 410006 148.52                   205.00  DQ          148.52          223.17        229.45 

Muncie Transit Supply 

233149 -                 4 Weeks 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM part 

number  Stock  8-10 Weeks 

 Est 16 

Weeks 

4 310008 109.12                 161.31          109.12          155.09        114.03 

Gillig LLC 233146 -                 4 Weeks  8 Weeks  Stock 

 Up to 13 

Weeks 

4 610025 30.49            30.49       34.50                      40.83          44.17 

Crossline Supply 

233143 -                Stock  Stock 

 8 Stock 

Balance 30 

Days  7 Weeks 

5 610026 103.13                    135.00  DQ          168.39          165.84        131.51             103.13 

Vehicle Maintenance 

Program 233152 -                 Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM part 

number  Stock  3-4 Weeks  19 Weeks  Stock 

2 2910007 47.74                     74.41          47.74 

The Aftermarket 

Parts Company LLC 

233151 -                 4 Weeks 

 Est 3 

Weeks 

4 610031 30.78            30.78                    38.61            30.83          39.62 

Coffman Truck Sales 

Inc. 233144 -                 Stock 

 2 Stock 

Balance 

March 

28th  Stock  Stock 

5 610033 603.49          603.49     743.38                   604.00    1,138.73    1,016.80 

Crossline Supply 

233143

NORTHWEST - 5 

CORES, HERITAGE - 

1 CORE, North - NO 

CORES -                

 No Core 

Charge 

Stock 

 200.00 Core 

Charge Stock 

 No Core 

Charge Stock  Mar 14th 

 250.00 

Core 

Charge 5 

Weeks 

5 2510025 75.82                       75.82      92.21        77.15            76.16          87.51 

Gillig LLC 233146 -                 1-2 Weeks  Stock  10 Days  7-10 Days  5 Weeks 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Action Truck 

Parts

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

Crossline 

Supply

Coffman 

Truck Sales 

Inc.

ElDorado 

National 

Inc.

General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig LLC Hydraulic 

Electric 

Compone

nt Supply 

Inc.

Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive 

Inc.

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus Corp.

Mohawk 

Manufactu

ring and 

Supply Co.

Muncie 

Transit 

Supply

Neopart 

Transit LLC

The 

Aftermark

et Parts 

Company 

LLC

Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 421622 and 421625 Due: 

1 2910013 6.99                         6.99 

ElDorado National 

Inc. 233145 -                 2 Weeks 

2 210013 122.35                 122.35          348.48 

ElDorado National 

Inc. 233145 -                 2 Weeks  60 Days 

2 2910015 13.30                     13.30          14.45 

ElDorado National 

Inc. 233145  Stock  Stock 

3 610050 24.40             DQ            24.40          32.43                29.23 

Muncie Transit Supply 

233149 -                

 Not an 

approved 

OEM part 

number.  Stock 

 1 Stock 

Balance 13 

Weeks  Stock 

1 410070 68.02                     68.02 

ElDorado National 

Inc. 233145 -                 2 Weeks 

2 610061 5.35                       20.52            5.35 

The Aftermarket 

Parts Company LLC 

233151 -                 2 Weeks  Stock 

5 2510042 12.55                       13.63      22.63        12.55            13.01          14.29 

Midwest Bus Corp. 

233147 -                 1-2 Weeks  Stock  10 Days  7-10 Days  5 Weeks 

5 2510043 12.55                       13.63      22.63        12.55            13.01          14.29 

Midwest Bus Corp. 

233147 -                 1-2 Weeks  Stock  10 Days  7-10 Days  5 Weeks 

3 2510068 35.48                       37.99      45.15        35.48 

Midwest Bus Corp. 

233147 -                 1-2 Weeks  Stock  10 Days 

3 2510069 0.14                     0.99          0.14              0.50 

Midwest Bus Corp. 

233147 -                 Stock  10 Days  7-10 Days 

3 2510072 35.48                       37.99      45.15        35.48 

Midwest Bus Corp. 

233147 -                 1-2 Weeks  Stock  10 Days 

5 410080 321.15                   321.15  DQ          360.54          355.89        368.87        418.55 

Gillig LLC 233146 -                

 10 Stock 

Balance 8 

Weeks 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM part 

number  21 Days  Stock 

 1 Stock 

Balance 5 

Weeks  60 Days 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Action Truck 

Parts

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

Crossline 

Supply

Coffman 

Truck Sales 

Inc.

ElDorado 

National 

Inc.

General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig LLC Hydraulic 

Electric 

Compone

nt Supply 

Inc.

Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive 

Inc.

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus Corp.

Mohawk 

Manufactu

ring and 

Supply Co.

Muncie 

Transit 

Supply

Neopart 

Transit LLC

The 

Aftermark

et Parts 

Company 

LLC

Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 421622 and 421625 Due: 

3 610084 79.76            79.76                      92.92        102.68 

Coffman Truck Sales 

Inc. 233144 -                Stock  30 Days  7 Weeks 

6 110044 5.06                           6.82            6.80              6.00              5.06            5.38            6.74 

Neopart Transit LLC 

233150 -                 Stock  Mar 14th  21 Days  2-3 Weeks 

 Est 8 

Weeks  Stock 

1 610091 40.75                     40.75 

ElDorado National 

Inc. 233145 -                 4 Weeks 

4 410095 82.16                     91.24            82.16            91.87          91.11 

Gillig LLC 233146 -                 4 Weeks  Stock  4-6 Weeks  Stock 

5 2510147 24.00                       25.83      35.85        24.00            26.20          27.06 

Midwest Bus Corp. 

233147 -                 1-2 Weeks  Stock  10 Days  7-10 Days  5 Weeks 

3 110058 270.70                   371.95          270.70        282.55 

The Aftermarket 

Parts Company LLC 

233151 -                 12 Weeks  150 Days 

 Est 9 

Weeks 

5 2510164 4.84                           5.20        9.64          4.84              6.44            6.56 

Midwest Bus Corp. 

233147  1-2 Weeks  Stock  10 Days  7-10 Days  5 Weeks 

1 2510175 88.50                     88.50 

The Aftermarket 

Parts Company LLC 

233151 -                 5 Weeks 

3 610161 130.35          138.18                  143.43        130.35 

Coffman Truck Sales 

Inc. 233144 -                 Stock  30 Days  6 Weeks 

1 1510303 487.18                 487.18 

The Aftermarket 

Parts Company LLC 

233151 -                 18 Weeks 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Action Truck 

Parts

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

Crossline 

Supply

Coffman 

Truck Sales 

Inc.

ElDorado 

National 

Inc.

General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig LLC Hydraulic 

Electric 

Compone

nt Supply 

Inc.

Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive 

Inc.

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus Corp.

Mohawk 

Manufactu

ring and 

Supply Co.

Muncie 

Transit 

Supply

Neopart 

Transit LLC

The 

Aftermark

et Parts 

Company 

LLC

Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 421622 and 421625 Due: 

1 610036 6,000.00          6,000.00 

ElDorado National 

Inc. 233145 -                

 6 Stock 

Balance 12 

Weeks 

1 610087 9,851.00          9,851.00 

ElDorado National 

Inc. 233145 -                 Stock 

1 610168 954.37                 954.37 

The Aftermarket 

Parts Company LLC 

233151 -                 15 Weeks 


