



Pace

RFQ# 421362

WHITE=NO BID

		TOTAL																	
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
	Sku	Winning bid	A&A Auto	CBM	Interstate Power	Suburban Truck	Rome Truck - NO BID	Prevost	Neopart	Area Diesel	Crossline Supply	Gillig	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Hydraulic Electric	Muncie	Mohawk	Coffman	Eldorado
NO # of Bids																			
4	81422	1.50												2.36		2.40	1.50	2.05	
Coffman	232672													7w		30d	unapproved part	stock	
6	81444	59.40						109.23	73.44			71.25		76.50		75.57	59.40		
Mohawk	232671	-					stock	6w				stock		8w		60d	stock		
3	81455	4.55												5.62		5.40		4.55	
Coffman	232672													5w		21d		stock	
3	81465	102.65											123.00	165.51		102.65			
Availability - Kirks	232667												stock	5w		30d			
3	120539	46.53												57.23		55.66		46.53	
Coffman	232672	-												5w		30d		stock	
3	120540	49.95												58.38		59.77		49.95	
Coffman	232672	-												5w		30d		stock	
4	120541	47.68												55.42		59.00	64.70	47.68	
Coffman	232672	-												5w		30d	2w	stock	
3	120542	46.54												60.04		56.33		46.54	
Coffman	232672	-												11w		30d		stock	
4	120548	1.08												2.99		2.73	1.08	2.31	
Coffman	232672	-												13w		21d	unapproved part	stock	
7	81502	15.18	21.69		24.26			44.54						23.49		30.45	15.18	23.23	
Mohawk	232671	-	4w		6w			60d						5w		30d	stock	stock	
1	100247	2.77																2.77	
Coffman	232672	-																stock	
4	81516	9.25												10.68		10.25	11.96	9.25	
Coffman	232672	-												7w		21d	2w	stock	

Pace

RFQ# 421362

WHITE=NO BID

		TOTAL																	
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
	Sku	Winning bid	A&A Auto	CBM	Interstate Power	Suburban Truck	Rome Truck - NO BID	Prevost	Neopart	Area Diesel	Crossline Supply	Gillig	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Hydraulic Electric	Muncie	Mohawk	Coffman	Eldorado
NO # of Bids																			
6	81517	269.69							525.00	269.69	405.00		354.00	559.19					499.04
Low bid does not accept non-Cummins cores - award to Kirks	232667	-							3w	stock	stock		stock	6w					7d
	81519	56.00											56.00	107.94			77.00		
Kirks	232667	-											3w	4w			unapproved part		
1	120553	322.53																	322.53
Eldorado	232673	-																	6w
6	810010	301.00							582.15	345.69			301.00	799.45		702.52			469.43
Kirks	232667	-							stock	stock			2w	5w		30d			stock
3	810014	9.17												10.75		11.33			9.17
Coffman	232672	-												5w		30d			stock
5	1010002	3.60	8.29										6.75	3.60	3.64				10.68
Aftermarket Parts	232668	-	10d										stock	stock	14d				1w
5	1010011	793.00							1,154.40				793.00	1,455.81			1,150.00	1,157.27	
Kirks	232667	-							10d				stock	6w			stock	90d	
6	1010012	1,200.00							1,472.31				1,205.00	2,705.97	1,200.00		1,210.00	1,985.24	
Hydraulic Electric	232669	-							10d				stock	5w	stock		2w	stock	
4	810025	595.97							650.00	595.97				1,280.99					783.91
Area Diesel	232665	-							4w	stock				5w					stock
5	810027	490.00							501.75					654.58	490.00	619.90			517.96
Availability - Neopart	232664	-							stock					9w	14d	30d			stock
5	810028	48.50										63.00		77.68		109.50	48.50		232.67
Eldorado	232673	-										stock		10w		stock	stock		6w
5	1010015	895.00							1,227.60				895.00	1,980.64			1,185.00	993.77	

Pace

RFQ# 421362

WHITE=NO BID

		TOTAL																	
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
	Sku	Winning bid	A&A Auto	CBM	Interstate Power	Suburban Truck	Rome Truck - NO BID	Prevost	Neopart	Area Diesel	Crossline Supply	Gillig	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Hydraulic Electric	Muncie	Mohawk	Coffman	Eldorado
NO # of Bids																			
Kirks	232667	-							stock				stock	stock			stock	stock	
2	1010016	2,299.50												3,043.15				2,299.50	
Coffman	232672	-												7w				90d	
3	810049	109.58												130.70		124.90		109.58	
Coffman	232672	-												5w		stock		stock	
2	810061	3,207.32												4,175.28				3,207.32	
Coffman	232672	-												9w				stock	
3	810064	3,100.69								3,100.69				4,116.74				3,965.60	
Area Diesel	232665	-								stock				7w				stock	
8	1210033	24.49	24.49		27.90	27.90		48.54					89.00	28.50			25.10	24.99	
A&A Auto	232661	-	stock		3w	stock		60d					60d	stock			2w	stock	
2	1210034	26.02												28.33		26.02			
Muncie	232670	-												9w		30d			
3	810071	641.69								641.69				1,015.40				675.31	
Area Diesel	232665	-								stock				9w				stock	
3	810078	409.54												598.44		483.60		409.54	
Coffman	232672	-												5w		30d		stock	
2	810079	409.54												581.73				409.54	
Coffman	232672	-												7w				stock	
2	1210047	2.40												59.26					2.40
Eldorado	232673	-												8w					2w
2	1210048	0.68												0.68					2.40
Aftermarket Parts	232668	-												stock					2w
8	1010032	57.60							80.20		73.00	174.75		136.15	75.00	115.70	57.60	112.62	

Pace

RFQ# 421362

WHITE=NO BID

		TOTAL																	
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
	Sku	Winning bid	A&A Auto	CBM	Interstate Power	Suburban Truck	Rome Truck - NO BID	Prevost	Neopart	Area Diesel	Crossline Supply	Gillig	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Hydraulic Electric	Muncie	Mohawk	Coffman	Eldorado
NO # of Bids																			
Crossline Supply	232666	-							stock		stock	4w		6w	14d	stock	unapproved part	stock	
5	810098	250.47		325.96										313.54		299.60	298.20	250.47	
Coffman	232672	-		stock										stock		30d	stock	stock	
3	810110	516.90												516.90			585.00	1,323.54	
Availability - Coffman	232672	-												5w			6w	stock	
4	1210056	5.79												6.99		6.80	7.45	5.79	
Coffman	232672	-												7w		30d	4w	stock	
1	1110002	69.80																	69.80
Eldorado	232673	-																	4w
4	810154	6.37												10.46		14.50	6.37	8.40	
Coffman	232672	-												8w		30d	unapproved part	stock	
3	810178	165.70												212.63		193.15		165.70	
Coffman	232672	-												5w		stock		stock	
5	810208	0.16												1.54	1.25	1.60	0.16	1.45	
Hydraulic Electric	232669	-												5w	stock	30d	unapproved part	stock	
3	810209	20.05												22.73		21.75		20.05	
Coffman	232672	-												5w		30d		stock	
3	810222	182.45												202.62		198.90		182.45	
Coffman	232672	-												5w		30d		stock	
2	1010060	2,264.98												3,184.41				2,264.98	
Coffman	232672	-												7w				90d	
7	1210119	925.00							948.69		1,025.00			1,521.58	925.00	1,445.65	1,525.77	1,334.66	
Hydraulic Electric	232669	-						stock			stock			stock	stock	30d	2w	stock	
2	810279	290.26												372.15				290.26	

Pace

RFQ# 421362

WHITE=NO BID

	TOTAL																		
	0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
	Sku	Winning bid	A&A Auto	CBM	Interstate Power	Suburban Truck	Rome Truck - NO BID	Prevost	Neopart	Area Diesel	Crossline Supply	Gillig	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Hydraulic Electric	Muncie	Mohawk	Coffman	Eldorado
NO # of Bids																			
Coffman	232672	-												7w				stock	
-	1210130	-																	
		-																	
1	1210131	1,306.55												1,306.55					
Aftermarket Parts	232668	-												22w					
2	1010082	890.47												1,075.98				890.47	
Coffman	232672	-												9w				90d	
3	810357	21.50												25.67		23.60		21.50	
Coffman	232672	-												11w		30d		stock	