

Pace

RFQ# 421361

WHITE=NO BID

Green=Disqualified

		TOTAL															
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	I/O Controls	Interstate Power	P&G	Kirks	Prevost	Battery Service	Neopart	Coffman	A&A Auto	Gillig	Crossline Supply	Aftermarket Parts	Muncie	Mohawk	Eldorado
5	72139	315.00		388.58						331.99		370.00	315.00	380.60			
	Crossline Supply	232666		stock						stock		stock	stock	5w			
1	72125	99.78															99.78
	Eldorado	232673															6w
3	71875	4.60												4.82		4.60	22.97
	Mohawk	232671												stock		stock	stock
2	71287	0.21												0.40		0.21	
	Mohawk	232671												8w		12w	
5	70220	7.65										15.25		17.22	12.85	7.65	46.01
	Mohawk	232671										stock		stock	stock	stock	stock
3	72057	4.77										7.50		4.77		12.10	
	Aftermarket Parts	232668										stock		stock		stock	
6	72143	10.42					14.27		10.42			11.25		10.50	10.95		30.65
	Availability - Aftermarket Parts	232668					60d		7w			4w		1w	75d		6w
1	71540	78.60															78.60
	Eldorado	232673															6w
1	71539	46.01															46.01
	Eldorado	232673															6w
1	71789	0.49												0.49			
	Aftermarket Parts	232668												stock			
3	71801	5.40												22.49	17.83	5.40	

Pace

RFQ# 421361

WHITE=NO BID

Green=Disqualified

		TOTAL															
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	I/O Controls	Interstate Power	P&G	Kirks	Prevost	Battery Service	Neopart	Coffman	A&A Auto	Gillig	Crossline Supply	Aftermarket Parts	Muncie	Mohawk	Eldorado
Mohawk	232671													17w	stock	stock	
2	71785	0.16					0.63							0.16			
Aftermarket Parts	232668						stock							5w			
3	74736	0.16												0.96	0.19	0.16	
Mohawk	232671													5w	21d	stock	
1	72077	69.05															69.05
Eldorado	232673	-															6w
4	71179	0.43		3.33										0.43	0.43	0.60	
Aftermarket Parts	232668			10d										stock	stock	stock	
5	72094	17.28					17.28							18.98	22.00	25.12	38.33
Prevost	232677						stock							5w	30d	4w	4w
3	71800	5.30												20.02	13.56	5.30	
Mohawk	232671	-												17w	stock	stock	
2	72122	2.26												2.26			13.15
Eldorado	232673	-												MOQ			2w
1	72144	38.33															38.33
Eldorado	232673	-															4w
1	72163	614.41															614.41
Eldorado	232673	-															6w
3	72170	26.81												36.96	31.40		26.81
Eldorado	232673	-												MOQ	45d		4w

Pace

RFQ# 421361

WHITE=NO BID

Green=Disqualified

		TOTAL															
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	I/O Controls	Interstate Power	P&G	Kirks	Prevost	Battery Service	Neopart	Coffman	A&A Auto	Gillig	Crossline Supply	Aftermarket Parts	Muncie	Mohawk	Eldorado
4	72172	26.81					44.42							35.43	31.15		26.81
Eldorado	232673	-					60d							12w	45d		4w
3	72184	5.39												5.39	5.85		16.82
Aftermarket Parts	232668	-												stock	30d		stock
1	72203	46.01															46.01
Eldorado	232673	-															8w
4	72216	144.00					227.31					144.00		144.03			417.70
Gillig	232678	-					105d					2w		3w			stock
1	72249	2.34															2.34
Eldorado	232673	-															2w
3	72292	2.25					2.39							2.25	2.28		
Aftermarket Parts	232668	-					75d							8w	30d		
3	72301	283.00						283.00			366.00			297.81			
Aftermarket Parts - least lead time	232668	-						6m			8w			5w			
3	72301	283.00						283.00			366.00			297.81			
Aftermarket Parts - least lead time	232668	-						6m			8w			5w			
1	710008	238.27															238.27
Eldorado	232673	-															4w
5	710026	450.00					601.20					450.00		510.53		512.23	732.37
Gillig	232678	-					60d					stock		5w		stock	4w
1	710032	156.81												156.81			



Pace

RFQ# 421361

WHITE=NO BID

	<b>TOTAL</b>																
	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	I/O Controls	Interstate Power	P&G	Kirks	Prevost	Battery Service	Neopart	Coffman	A&A Auto	Gillig	Crossline Supply	Aftermarket Parts	Muncie	Mohawk	Eldorado
1	710342	1,351.00															1,351.00
Eldorado	232673	-															18w
1	710343	3,893.94															3,893.94
Eldorado	232673	-															18w
1	710366	856.50															856.50
Eldorado	232673	-															18w
1	710397	534.24															534.24
Eldorado	232673	-															10w
3	710406	919.72		949.28										1,545.53		919.72	
Mohawk	232671	-		no lead										25w		5w	