

Pace

RFQ 421359 Due: 10/05/2021

		TOTAL						
White = No Bid								
Green = Disqualified								
Number of Bids, Winning Bidder & PO Number	SKU	Winning Bid	Neopart Transit	The Standard Companies	Konik and Company	Wipeco Inc.	Lawson Products, Inc.	Zogics LLC
2	9510006	17.75	No Bid	No Bid	37.09	17.75	No Bid	
	Wipeco Inc. 232631				Stock	2-4 Days		Non-Responsive
4	9510008	10.80		10.80	13.00	12.00	16.91	
	The Standard Companies 232632	-		2-3 Days	Box of 50	2-4 Days	Limited Stock Available	
3	9510009	10.80		10.80	12.00	12.00	No Bid	
	The Standard Companies 232632	-		2-3 Days	Box of 50 Stock	2-4 Days		
3	9510010	10.80		10.80	12.00	12.00	No Bid	
	The Standard Companies 232632			2-3 Days	Stock	2-4 Days		