

		TOTAL																						
White = No Bid																								
Green = Disqualified																								
	SKU	Winning Bid	Action Truck Parts	Area Diesel Service	Autex Automotive Devices	CBM US Inc.	Coffman Truck Sales Inc.	ElDorado National Inc.	General Truck Parts	Gillig LLC	Hydraulic Electric Component Supply Inc.	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive Inc.	Lift -U Parts	Midwest Bus Corp.	Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co.	Muncie Transit Supply	Neopart Transit LLC	The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance Program
6		41236	144.18					433.67								153.92	151.25	144.18	152.68	205.86				
	Neopart Transit LLC 232658							4 Weeks								3 Stock Balance Oct 28th	21 Days	3-4 Weeks	5 Weeks	60 Days				
7		41237	91.44					310.33		93.64						96.89	96.28	91.44	94.82	123.96				
	Neopart Transit LLC 232658							4 Weeks		2 Stock Balance 6 Weeks						Oct 28th	30 Days	3-4 Weeks	6 Weeks	60 Days				
5		41131	49.75													49.75	101.96	89.67	91.71			99.05		
	Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co. 232656														3 Stock Balance 45 Days	60 Days	Stock	Stock				Stock		
3		30163	12.50								12.50		14.51				13.90							
	Hydraulic Electric Component Supply Inc. 232654										2 Weeks		Stock				Stock							
3		250586	144.36							144.36								146.66	154.16					
	Gillig LLC 232653									2 Weeks								7-10 Days	4 Weeks					
6		30014	3.00													3.10	3.00	3.92	4.04	7.40		6.35		
	Muncie Tranist Supply 232657															Stock	Stock	Stock	Stock	60 Days		Stock		
5		290028	16.59							29.99							25.72	19.19	16.59	27.02				
	The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232659															Oct 28th	Stock		Stock	Stock				
2		30356	163.89														163.89		200.70					
	The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232659																10 Pc Min - 105 Days		3 Weeks					
6		290537	156.99							156.99	186.00						184.33	161.12	167.83	229.51				
	Gillig LLC 232653									Stock	Stock						Stock	2-3 Weeks	Stock	60 Days				
2		290643	13.10					26.81									13.10							
	Muncie Tranist Supply 232657							Stock									30 Days							
4		290658	102.51							102.51							124.35		124.57	151.66				
	Gillig LLC 232653									Stock							21 Days		7 Weeks	Stock				
3		250600	70.15							70.50								70.15	81.38					
	Neopart Transit LLC 232658									2 Weeks								7-10 Days	5 Weeks					
3		290647	90.33					191.95									97.97		90.33					
	The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232659							Stock									30 Days		Stock					

Number of Bids,
Winning Bidder & PO
Number

		TOTAL																								
White = No Bid																										
Green = Disqualified																										
SKU		Winning Bid	Action Truck Parts	Area Diesel Service	Autex Automotive Devices	CBM US Inc.	Coffman Truck Sales Inc.	Eldorado National Inc.	General Truck Parts	Gillig LLC	Hydraulic Electric Component Supply Inc.	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive Inc.	Lift -U Parts	Midwest Bus Corp.	Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co.	Muncie Transit Supply	Neopart Transit LLC	The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance Program		
Number of Bids, Winning Bidder & PO Number																										
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232659	1	290654	22.69																							
			-																	5 Weeks						
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232659	7	40165	3.00							9.55						3.20	3.61	9.88	3.00	13.70			14.99			
										Stock						Stock	Stock	Stock	16 Only Stock Balance 5 Weeks	Stock			Stock			
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232659	6	30361	7.30							7.75						7.41	7.63	7.99	7.30	11.08						
										Stock						Stock	Stock	Must be ordered in multiples of 8 Stock	Stock	60 Days						
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co. 232656	7	40922	17.55					107.46		28.00						17.55	27.66	28.57	30.42				59.97			
										Stock						Nov 1st	75 Days	Stock	Stock				Stock			
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232659	7	10365	68.80							75.99			176.55			75.07	73.73		68.80	120.75				141.24		
										Stock			Stock			Stock	Stock		6 Weeks	60 Days				Stock		
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232659	7	10366	67.28							75.99			176.55			75.07	68.75		67.28	143.89				141.24		
										Stock			Stock			Stock	Stock		Stock	60 Days				Stock		
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co. 232656	4	20535	42.20							52.25						42.20	78.98		45.53							
										3 Stock Balance 4 Weeks						Stock	5 Stock Balance 37 Days		2-3 Weeks							
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co. 232656	5	41132	49.75													49.75	101.97	89.67	91.71				99.05			
																Nov 21st	60 Days	Stock	7 Stock Balance 9 Weeks				Stock			
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232659	4	60748	46.68					84.41									46.68		53.92	64.67						
								Stock									60 Days		Stock	90 Days						
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232659	4	151964	27.54					53.69		33.00							33.17		27.54							
								2 Weeks		2 Weeks							37 Days		Stock							
Eldorado National Inc. 232652	1	30411	256.03					256.03																		
								Stock																		

		TOTAL																					
White = No Bid																							
Green = Disqualified																							
SKU	Winning Bid	Action Truck Parts	Area Diesel Service	Autex Automotive Devices	CBM US Inc.	Coffman Truck Sales Inc.	ElDorado National Inc.	General Truck Parts	Gillig LLC	Hydraulic Electric Component Supply Inc.	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive Inc.	Lift -U Parts	Midwest Bus Corp.	Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co.	Muncie Transit Supply	Neopart Transit LLC	The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance Program
6	410034	217.69							225.00						245.44	226.10	217.69	228.88	303.91				
Neopart Transit LLC 232658		-							1 Stock Balance 2 Weeks							Oct 28th	30 Days	3-4 Weeks	Stock	Stock			
5	410035	392.69													411.25	392.69	393.77	427.32	555.79				
Muncie Tranist Supply 232657		-													Oct 29th	1 Stock Balance 21 Days	3-4 Weeks	6 Weeks	60 Days				
5	410036	392.69													411.25	392.69	392.87	427.32	555.79				
Muncie Tranist Supply 232657		-													Oct 29th	21 Days	3-4 Weeks	6 Weeks	60 Days				
2	610050	24.40													DQ	24.40		33.48					
Muncie Tranist Supply 232657		-													Not an approved OEM part number	Stock		Stock					
2	410046	49.55										49.55					52.49						
Kirk's Automotive Inc. 232655	LOW STOCK	-										8.00 Core Charge Stock					30 Days						
0	410048	-																					
3	610055	39.57				39.57									DQ	46.20		46.15					
Coffman Truck Sales Inc. 232651		-				Stock									Not an approved OEM part number	Stock		Up to 7 Weeks					
1	1510107	26.81					26.81																
ElDorado National Inc. 232652		-					2 Weeks																
1	110026	54.90					54.90																
ElDorado National Inc. 232652		-					1-2 Weeks																
1	410074	310.38					310.38																
ElDorado National Inc. 232652		-					6-8 Weeks																
1	410075	368.55					368.55																
ElDorado National Inc. 232652		-					6-8 Weeks																
1	2910024	22.69																22.69					
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232659		-																5 Weeks					
6	2910027	97.51							97.51	114.00						112.00	97.93	114.46	146.51				
Gillig LLC 232653		-							Stock	Stock						Stock	Stock	Stock	60 Days				

Pace RFQ 421355 Due: 10/05/2021

		TOTAL																						
White = No Bid																								
Green = Disqualified																								
SKU		Winning Bid	Action Truck Parts	Area Diesel Service	Autex Automotive Devices	CBM US Inc.	Coffman Truck Sales Inc.	Eldorado National Inc.	General Truck Parts	Gillig LLC	Hydraulic Electric Component Supply Inc.	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive Inc.	Lift -U Parts	Midwest Bus Corp.	Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co.	Muncie Transit Supply	Neopart Transit LLC	The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance Program
Number of Bids, Winning Bidder & PO Number																								
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232659	1	310050	4,616.43																	4,616.43				
			-																		Stock			
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232659	5	410117	0.52							1.00						0.60	0.63	0.55		0.52				
			-							Stock						Stock	50 Pc Min Must purchase in multiples of 50 - 40 Days	Must be ordered in multiples of 50 Stock		Stock				
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232659	1	2910065	343.18																		343.18			
			-																		Stock			
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232659	1	110064	1,252.08																		1,252.08			
			-																		4 Weeks			