

Pace

RFQ# 421334

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																		
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	Interstate Power	CBM	Gillig	A&A Auto	Prevost	Neopart	Crossline Supply	Mohawk	Area Diesel	Hydraulic Electric	Aftermarket Parts	Kirks	Muncie	TP101	Vehicle Maintenance	Coffman	Eldorado
NO # of Bids																				
5	130684	5.34		6.24							5.63			6.49		5.88			5.34	
	Coffman	232617	-	20d							30d			8w		21d			stock	
7	120487	9.43		9.72			9.79				9.65			10.04	12.00	10.85			9.43	
	Coffman	232617	-	14d			15d				4w			stock	30d	stock			stock	
6	130473	0.09		1.55				0.37			0.20		8.00	0.10		0.09				
	Muncie	232615	-	10d				stock			stock		stock	7w		30d				
5	130581	42.62		42.62							48.50			49.20		50.05				45.52
	Interstate Power	232604		stock							6w			6w		30d			stock	
5	130613	2.74		15.50							2.74			17.43		14.50				13.24
	Mohawk	232607	-	stock							stock			7w		30d			stock	
5	120416	7.80									7.85	7.80		10.17		9.35				7.89
	Area Diesel	232609	-								unapproved part	stock		5w		30d			stock	
6	130611	238.46		279.11			311.46				265.72			280.22		263.02			238.46	
	Coffman	232617	-	4w			4w				unapproved part			stock		stock			stock	
9	120488	15.85		18.17	16.25		17.29				17.70			19.63	20.25	17.05		15.85		17.43
	Vehicle Maintenance	232616	-	4w	70d		15d				5w			11w	30d	30d		6w	30d	
7	130612	48.00		88.92			102.23				48.00		73.00	95.02		82.95				75.98
	Hydraulic Electric	232612	-	stock			4w				unapproved part		stock	4w		30d			stock	
10	110136	68.49		87.76			68.49	149.25			77.75			103.12	74.76	79.90		73.11	80.88	100.00
	2nd low bid- quicker delivery - Vehicle Maintenance	232616		100d			100d	60d			5w			7w	60d	30d		6w	30d	6w
5	130477	0.08		0.42				0.53			0.08			0.08		0.09				
	Mohawk	232607		stock				stock			stock			stock		stock				
2	130474	0.11		0.11												2.05				
	Interstate Power	232604		stock												21d				
9	100223	52.47			126.30				68.70	82.50	52.47	96.63	68.00	129.85		99.85				97.74
	Availability - Neopart	232605			stock				stock	stock	unapproved part	stock	10d	6w		stock			stock	

Pace

RFQ# 421334

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																		
Green=Disqualified		0			0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	Interstate Power	CBM	Gillig	A&A Auto	Prevost	Neopart	Crossline Supply	Mohawk	Area Diesel	Hydraulic Electric	Aftermarket Parts	Kirks	Muncie	TP101	Vehicle Maintenance	Coffman	Eldorado
NO # of Bids																				
6	100226	1,150.14							1,254.40		1,150.14	2,103.26		2,428.83	1,227.00					2,114.96
Availability - Kirks	232614	-							10d		4w	stock		9w	stock					no lead given
6	100227	910.00							996.80		915.00	1,048.29		1,335.17	910.00					1,410.42
Kirks	232614								10d		4w	stock		12w	stock					no lead given
3	120529	1,588.43												1,957.79		1,588.43				3,379.58
Muncie	232615													11w		120d				8w
5	120548	1.10									1.10	2.28		3.03		2.75				2.31
Area Diesel	232609	-									unapproved part	stock		13w		21d				stock
8	1210002	19.79		27.79			47.69				25.74			24.58	32.00	29.65		19.79		25.78
Availability - Coffman	232617	-		5w			20d				5w			4w	30d	20d		6w		stock
6	1210003	19.90		19.90					21.92		21.54			30.99		22.50				21.87
Coffman	232617	-		unapproved part					stock		5w			9w		30d				7d
1	1010005	374.51																		374.51
Eldorado	232618	-																		stock
1	1010007	399.90																		399.90
Eldorado	232618	-																		12w
1	1010008	439.85																		439.85
Eldorado	232618	-																		12w
4	1010003	8.33									8.33	28.23		35.75						30.46
Area Diesel	232609	-									unapproved part	stock		5w						stock
6	1010011	793.00							1,154.40		1,170.00	1,143.01	800.00	1,464.53	793.00					
Kirks	232614	-							10d		4w	stock	stock	6w	stock					
7	1010012	1,205.00							1,472.31		1,214.00	1,769.69	1,250.00	2,721.80	1,205.00	1,402.10				
Kirks	232614	-							10d		4w	stock	stock	5w	stock	30d				
6	1010014	3.25									3.25	7.90		9.18	3.65	9.45				7.91
Kirks	232614	-									unapproved part	stock		stock	stock	30d				stock

Pace

RFQ# 421334

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																				
	0				0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified																					
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	Interstate Power	CBM	Gillig	A&A Auto	Prevost	Neopart	Crossline Supply	Mohawk	Area Diesel	Hydraulic Electric	Aftermarket Parts	Kirks	Muncie	TP101	Vehicle Maintenance	Coffman	Eldorado	
5	1010015	843.45							1,238.76		1,200.25	843.45		1,520.51	925.00						
	Area Diesel	232609	-						10d		4w	30d		13w	stock						
4	1010016	2,210.00								2,210.00		2,210.83		3,080.72						2,334.32	
	Area Diesel	232609	-							bid 1, need 2		30d		7w						90d	
3	1210022	86.17												86.17			98.90				176.59
	Availability - Eldorado	232618	-											13w			10d				stock
3	1210023	101.80												271.76			101.80				176.59
	Eldorado	232618	-											13w			MOQ				stock
6	1010024	55.50								55.50	67.52	55.69		72.26		68.20					57.04
	Crossline Supply	232606	-							stock	4w	stock		7w		30d					stock
3	1210035	2.20												2.20		4.54					9.14
	Aftermarket Parts	232613	-											stock		stock					4w
6	1010028	6.20								6.20		10.86		12.63	8.23	13.60					10.98
	Kirks	232614	-							unapproved part		stock		stock	stock	30d					stock
3	1210047	0.68												0.68			4.75				1.98
	Aftermarket Parts	232613	-											stock			8w				4w
3	1210048	0.68												0.68			4.65				1.83
	Aftermarket Parts	232613	-											5w			8w				4w
1	1210050	4.88																			4.88
	Eldorado	232618	-																		2w
4	1010033	3,178.15										3,269.69		3,913.69		3,894.79					3,178.15
	Coffman	232617	-									stock		9w		30d					90 days
6	1010034	32.21								32.21	42.83	42.00	49.82		51.25						43.42
	Hydraulic Electric	232612	-							unapproved part		stock	stock	13w		21d					stock
4	1010036	89.45										89.45		117.36		111.50					93.21
	Area Diesel	232609	-									stock		7w		30d					stock

Pace

RFQ# 421334

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																				
	0				0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0		
Green=Disqualified																					
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	Interstate Power	CBM	Gillig	A&A Auto	Prevost	Neopart	Crossline Supply	Mohawk	Area Diesel	Hydraulic Electric	Aftermarket Parts	Kirks	Muncie	TP101	Vehicle Maintenance	Coffman	Eldorado	
8	1010038	25.23							27.51		26.46	47.38	29.00	56.33	25.23	57.33				29.81	
	Kirks	232614	-						stock		unapproved part	stock	10d	stock	stock	30d				stock	
6	1210070	45.89							55.14		51.58		49.00	62.96				57.43	45.89		
	Availability - Neopart	232605	-						stock		4w		30d	6w					3w	90d	
1	1210103	152.29																			152.29
	Eldorado	232618	-																		4w
3	1210106	144.80												207.76		144.80					155.40
	Muncie	232615	-											4w		21d					4w
2	1210107	1.40													1.40						5.00
	Aftermarket Parts	232613	-											4w							4w
2	1210108	106.56												223.78							106.56
	Eldorado	232618	-											11w							4w
4	1010067	183.86										183.86		241.19		226.50				191.95	
	Area Diesel	232609	-									stock		8w		30d				stock	
	-	1210130	-																		
			-																		
3	1010085	2,684.69										2,684.69		3,560.11							2,866.92
	Area Diesel	232609	-									stock		9w							90d
5	1210144	674.51								725.00		674.51	700.00	880.05							682.96
	Area Diesel	232609	-							stock		stock	stock	7w							90d
4	1210145	74.28												96.92		93.05					75.29
	Area Diesel	232609	-									stock		7w		30d					stock