

Pace

RFQ# 421332

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																			
	0				0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	A&A Auto	Interstate Power	Gillig	Muncie	Neopart	Kirks	Area Diesel	Prevost	Crossline Supply	Hydraulic Electric	Aftermarket Parts	TP101	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk	Coffman	Suburban Truck	Eldorado
6	80883	1.51				16.50	16.05				25.24		1.51	17.96			1.51			
	Hydraulic Electric	232612	-			stock	21d				60d		stock	stock			stock			
9	81262	5.05		5.69	6.33		5.08		7.45					5.60		5.05	5.85	5.83	6.33	
	Vehicle Maintenance	232616	-	stock	9w		30d		30d					3w		6w	4w	14d	8w	
9	81262	5.05		5.69	6.33		5.08		7.45					5.60		5.05	5.85	5.83	6.33	
	Vehicle Maintenance	232616	-	stock	9w		30d		30d					3w		6w	4w	14d	8w	
1	81055	152.04																		152.04
	Eldorado	232618																		stock
5	81089	1.48					4.95			4.16				5.36			1.48	4.19		
	Area Diesel	232609	-				20d			stock				5w		unapproved part	stock			
6	81313	42.00		86.00			48.08			87.27				84.66			42.00	87.81		
	Muncie	232615	-	3w			stock			stock				stock			unapproved part	stock		
6	81343	7.76					28.15		7.76	23.70				29.13			8.29	13.50		
	Kirks	232614	-				30d		stock	stock				4w			unapproved part	stock		
1	81366	99.78																		99.78
	Eldorado	232618	-																	2w
4	81378	18.49		35.87			23.75										18.49			107.46
	Mohawk	232607	-	2w			30d										stock			2w
1	81417	30.65																		30.65
	Eldorado	232618																		2w
1	81423	61.37																		61.37
	Eldorado	232618																		2w
5	81422	1.50					2.43			2.14				2.38			1.50	1.73		
	Coffman	232617					30d			stock				7w		unapproved part	stock			
3	81430	291.03								291.03				351.82				295.92		

Pace

RFQ# 421332

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																		
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	A&A Auto	Interstate Power	Gillig	Muncie	Neopart	Kirks	Area Diesel	Prevost	Crossline Supply	Hydraulic Electric	Aftermarket Parts	TP101	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk	Coffman	Suburban Truck	Eldorado
	Area Diesel	232609								stock				5w				stock		
5	81438	6.45					19.25			16.54				20.99			6.45	16.27		
	Coffman	232617	-				20d			stock				3w			unapproved part	stock		
5	81441	43.50					43.50			44.07				51.24			52.40	44.11		
	Muncie	232615					stock			stock				stock			unapproved part	stock		
6	81444	59.40				71.50	75.57	72.08			109.23			76.50			59.40			
	Mohawk	232607				stock	60d	4w			stock			8w			stock			
3	81465	102.65					102.65		107.75					166.52						
	Muncie	232615					30d		stock					5w						
11	81502	20.45		22.79	24.26		20.45		28.00	26.98	44.54			23.63		31.11	32.67	23.23	24.26	
	Muncie	232615		15d	9w		30d		30d	stock	60d			5w		6w	stock	stock	6w	
5	81516	8.67					10.35			8.67				10.74			11.94	8.75		
	Area Diesel	232609					21d			stock				7w			4w	stock		
4	81519	55.75							55.75					108.57			89.76	78.59		
	Kirks	232614							30d					4w			8w	14d		
11	81520	7.07		9.99	11.03		9.00	10.41	34.00		39.09			10.31		7.07	10.46	10.40	14.24	
	Vehicle Maintenance	232616		15d	14d		30d	stock	30d		60d			4w		6w	5w	14d	stock	
11	81521	15.11		17.69	19.35		16.05	19.54	24.00	22.71				18.89		15.11	18.64	18.99	19.35	
	Vehicle Maintenance	232616		15d	14d		30d	3w	30d	stock				stock		4w	5w	14d	stock	
5	81533	12.69					15.75							25.37		13.61	12.69	43.66		
	Mohawk	232607					42d							3w		stock	stock	stock		
4	81534	24.29		24.29			38.70							38.11						76.74
	A&A Auto	232619		2w			120d							3w						2w
2	810018	29.45					29.45							91.43						
	Muncie	232615					21d							5w						

Pace

RFQ# 421332

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																			
	0				0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	A&A Auto	Interstate Power	Gillig	Muncie	Neopart	Kirks	Area Diesel	Prevost	Crossline Supply	Hydraulic Electric	Aftermarket Parts	TP101	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk	Coffman	Suburban Truck	Eldorado
4	810023	47.02					56.25			47.02				58.18				47.02		
	Area Diesel	232609	-				30d			stock				5w				stock		
2	810026	989.50					1,134.30											989.50		
	Coffman	232617	-				bid 2, need 4											stock		
	810027	496.26					620.75	506.80		496.26				658.43				520.75		
	Area Diesel	232609	-				30d	stock		stock				9w				stock		
5	810030	1.39					2.90			2.95				2.81			1.39	2.43		
	Coffman	232617	-				30d			stock				stock			unapproved part	stock		
5	810031	1.78					9.75			8.38				9.48			1.78	8.16		
	Coffman	232617	-				30d			stock				4w			unapproved part	stock		
4	810045	380.00						380.00		544.63				681.12				547.99		
	Neopart	232605	-					stock		stock				7w				stock		
5	810046	350.00					408.66	350.00						546.81			595.00	396.00		
	Neopart	232605	-				stock	stock						7w			6w	stock		
3	810050	95.54												95.54	116.95					144.08
	Aftermarket Parts	232613	-											8w	3w					4w
3	810061	2,995.69								2,995.69				4,200.58				3,241.80		
	Area Diesel	232609	-							stock				9w				14d		
3	810063	149.26							193.00	149.26				307.91						
	Area Diesel	232609	-						stock	stock				7w						
5	810065	9.66					55.10			45.13				54.73			9.66	47.08		
	Area Diesel	232609	-				30d			stock				stock			unapproved part	stock		
5	810066	20.78							98.00			115.00	92.00	20.78		91.16				
	Aftermarket Parts	232613	-						stock			stock	stock	5w		stock				
3	810071	641.26								641.26				1,021.40				669.62		

Pace

RFQ# 421332

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																			
	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	A&A Auto	Interstate Power	Gillig	Muncie	Neopart	Kirks	Area Diesel	Prevost	Crossline Supply	Hydraulic Electric	Aftermarket Parts	TP101	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk	Coffman	Suburban Truck	Eldorado
	Area Diesel	232609	-							stock				9w				stock		
4	810073	106.87					113.03			106.87				133.83				110.75		
	Area Diesel	232609	-				stock			stock				7w				stock		
4	810078	389.25					483.60			389.25				601.90				409.11		
	Area Diesel	232609	-				14d			stock				5w				stock		
3	810079	389.41								389.41				585.00				409.11		
	Coffman	232617	-							bid 1, need 2				7w				90d		
4	810080	43.50					52.03			45.53				55.44				43.50		
	Coffman	232617	-				30d			stock				7w				stock		
5	810093	18.40					35.79		19.14				18.48	37.81		18.40				
	Vehicle Maintenance	232616	-				14d		stock				stock	7w		stock				
5	810098	239.26					299.60			239.26				315.40			324.20	250.47		
	Area Diesel	232609	-				30d			stock				stock			4w	stock		
3	810101	209.25								209.25				251.30				218.57		
	Area Diesel	232609	-							stock				6w				stock		
5	810125	42.00					114.00			91.60				119.31			42.00	104.33		
	Coffman	232617	-				30d			bid 2, need 4				7w		unapproved part		stock		
1	810129	507.80																		507.80
	Eldorado	232618	-																	10w
4	810130	384.26					474.67			384.26				552.82				398.92		
	Area Diesel	232609	-				30d			stock				5w				stock		
3	810131	16.92					20.50			16.92								17.20		
	Area Diesel	232609	-				30d			stock								stock		
5	810141	24.26					50.22			59.89				72.24			24.26	62.05		
	Muncie	232615	-				stock			stock				3w		unapproved part		stock		

Pace

RFQ# 421332

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																			
	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	A&A Auto	Interstate Power	Gillig	Muncie	Neopart	Kirks	Area Diesel	Prevost	Crossline Supply	Hydraulic Electric	Aftermarket Parts	TP101	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk	Coffman	Suburban Truck	Eldorado
4	810143	10.38					10.65			10.74				11.15				10.38		
	Coffman	232617	-				30d			stock				3w				stock		
5	810154	6.47					14.50			8.29				10.52			6.47	8.36		
	Area Diesel	232609	-				30d			stock				8w			unapproved part	stock		
2	810164	1,500.00											1,500.00					1,680.16		
	Availability - Coffman	232617	-										10d					stock		
2	810167	52.48												52.48						78.00
	Aftermarket Parts	232613	-											stock						6w
2	810169	23.17												23.17						31.08
	Aftermarket Parts	232613	-											stock						4w
6	810173	13.42					25.90			21.35			20.00	24.83			13.42	23.73		
	Hydraulic Electric	232612	-				21d			stock			stock	5w			unapproved part	stock		
4	810179	46.73					50.01			46.73				59.86				47.26		
	Area Diesel	232609	-				stock			stock				4w				stock		
5	810184	58.00					73.45			62.07			58.00	72.18				68.08		
	Hydraulic Electric	232612	-				30d			stock			stock	4w				stock		
4	810207	134.18					153.32			134.18				163.34				139.92		
	Area Diesel	232609	-				30d			stock				stock				stock		
2	810220	416.41												587.19				416.41		
	Coffman	232617	-											5w				90d		
4	810243	5.16					6.50			5.16				6.73				5.22		
	Area Diesel	232609	-				30d			stock				5w				stock		
4	810271	34.20							36.00				34.20	91.41			91.98			
	Hydraulic Electric	232612	-					stock					stock	8w			6w			
2	810301	582.33												598.97				582.33		

Pace

RFQ# 421332

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																			
	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
	Skus	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	A&A Auto	Interstate Power	Gillig	Muncie	Neopart	Kirks	Area Diesel	Prevost	Crossline Supply	Hydraulic Electric	Aftermarket Parts	TP101	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk	Coffman	Suburban Truck	Eldorado
NO # of Bids																				
Coffman	232617	-												9w				90d		