

		TOTAL																						
White = No Bid																								
Green = Disqualified																								

SKU	Winning Bid	Action Truck Parts	Area Diesel Service	Autex Automotive Devices	CBM US Inc.	Coffman Truck Sales Inc.	Eldorado National Inc.	General Truck Parts	Gillig LLC	Hydraulic Electric Component Supply Inc.	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive Inc.	Lift -U Parts	Midwest Bus Corp.	Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co.	Muncie Transit Supply	Neopart Transit LLC	The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance Program
-----	-------------	--------------------	---------------------	--------------------------	-------------	--------------------------	------------------------	---------------------	------------	--	--------------------------	------------------------	---------------	-------------------	-------------------------------------	-----------------------	---------------------	-----------------------------------	---------	------------------	----------------------	-------------------	-----------------------------

Number of Bids, Winning Bidder & PO Number	SKU	Winning Bid	Action Truck Parts	Area Diesel Service	Autex Automotive Devices	CBM US Inc.	Coffman Truck Sales Inc.	Eldorado National Inc.	General Truck Parts	Gillig LLC	Hydraulic Electric Component Supply Inc.	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive Inc.	Lift -U Parts	Midwest Bus Corp.	Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co.	Muncie Transit Supply	Neopart Transit LLC	The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance Program
6	Neopart Transit LLC 232599	41236	144.18					493.49								153.27	151.75	144.18	153.53	205.86				
								4 Weeks								3 Stock Balance Oct 21st	21 Days	3-4 Weeks	5 Weeks	60 Days				
7	Neopart Transit LLC 232599	41237	91.44					311.43		93.64						98.41	98.00	91.44	94.82	123.96				
								4 Weeks	Stock							Oct 21st	30 Days	3-4 Weeks	6 Weeks	60 Days				
4	Gillig LLC 232594	250586	144.36							144.36			161.26					145.98	154.16					
									2 Weeks				Stock					7-10 Days	4 Weeks					
6	Muncie Transit Supply 232598	30014	3.00													3.10	3.00	3.92	4.07	7.40		6.29		
																60 Stock Balance Oct 21st	Stock	Stock	54 Stock Balance 5 Weeks	60 Days		Stock		
4	Muncie Transit Supply 232598	290646	96.45					144.25									96.45		118.75		139.95			
								Stock									30 Days		8 Weeks		7-10 Days			
6	The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232600	41238	90.44							93.64							98.29	98.00	91.44	90.44	123.97			
									Stock							Oct 21st	21 Days	3-4 Weeks	Stock	60 Days				
6	Neopart Transit LLC 232599	40958	31.97							36.33							DQ	37.57	31.97	43.18	53.28		62.96	
									Stock								Not an approved OEM part number	Stock	Stock	8 Weeks	Stock		Stock	
7	Neopart Transit LLC 232599	40798	93.95					130.00		125.00							127.86	123.95	93.95	102.14	143.80			
								6-8 Weeks	7 Stock Balance 2-4 Weeks							Oct 13th	21 Days	2-3 Weeks	7 Weeks	60 Days				
5	The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232600	290028	16.55							30.77							24.86	19.19		16.55	27.02			
									Stock							Oct 13th	45 Days		Stock	Stock				
2	Eldorado National Inc. 232593	290471	9.80					30.65												9.80				
								2 Weeks												15 Weeks				
5	Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co. 232597	40036	46.30					99.78									46.30	99.95		53.33	132.80			
								Stock								3 Stock Balance 20 Weeks	Stock		Stock	Stock				
7	The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232600	40953	11.29							13.67							33.63	14.39	22.23	11.29	18.10		30.96	
									Stock							Nov 24th	91 Days	Stock	3 Weeks	Stock		Stock		

		TOTAL																					
White = No Bid																							
Green = Disqualified																							
SKU	Winning Bid	Action Truck Parts	Area Diesel Service	Autex Automotive Devices	CBM US Inc.	Coffman Truck Sales Inc.	ElDorado National Inc.	General Truck Parts	Gillig LLC	Hydraulic Electric Component Supply Inc.	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive Inc.	Lift -U Parts	Midwest Bus Corp.	Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co.	Muncie Transit Supply	Neopart Transit LLC	The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance Program
4	290643	11.17					26.81									13.10					15.50		11.17
Vehicle Maintenance Program 232601							Stock									30 Days					Stock		Stock
3	250600	70.15							70.50				88.79				70.15						
Neopart Transit LLC 232599		-						2 Weeks				Stock				7-10 Days							
4	290644	43.47					84.41									56.05					46.50		43.47
Vehicle Maintenance Program 232601							Stock									21 Days					Stock		Stock
8	41035	0.99					24.52		6.99						0.99	4.55	6.51	1.18	9.11		7.33		
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co. 232597							2 Weeks	Stock							Stock	16 Stock Balance 35 Days	Must be ordered in multiples of 4 Stock	6 Weeks	Stock		Stock		Stock
6	41217	84.99					152.95								85.36	94.92		84.99	142.63		139.93		
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232600							4 Weeks								Stock	1 Stock Balance 21 Days		Stock	60 Days		Stock		
9	41227	13.75	35.00						24.99						13.75	49.75	43.27	29.07	36.73		32.52		23.17
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co. 232597		-	Stock					Stock							Stock	5 Stock Balance 30 Days	Stock	5 Weeks	12 Stock Balance 60 Days		Stock		Stock
7	10199	12.00	25.00												12.00	37.55	32.68	25.75	45.85		24.78		
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co. 232597		-													Stock	21 Days	2-3 Weeks	Stock	60 Days		Stock		
8	60494	8.18				10.29				11.34	12.50				10.29	10.86		17.94			11.34		8.18
Vehicle Maintenance Program 232601		-				63 Stock Balance 7 Days				10-14 Days	30 Days				Oct 27th	12 Pc Min 30 Days					Stock		Stock
8	40922	17.55	67.00				107.46		28.25						17.55	27.66	28.57	30.59			59.41		
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co. 232597			Stock				Stock	Stock							Oct 13th	60 Days	Stock	Stock			Stock		
5	10001	0.37													0.37	1.28	1.02	1.05	1.52				
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co. 232597		-													Stock	Must purchase in multiples of 50 - 21 Days	Must be ordered in multiples of 50 Stock	Stock	Stock				



Pace RFQ 421329 Due: 09/23/2021

	TOTAL																						
White = No Bid																							
Green = Disqualified																							

SKU	Winning Bid	Action Truck Parts	Area Diesel Service	Autex Automotive Devices	CBM US Inc.	Coffman Truck Sales Inc.	Eldorado National Inc.	General Truck Parts	Gillig LLC	Hydraulic Electric Component Supply Inc.	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive Inc.	Lift -U Parts	Midwest Bus Corp.	Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co.	Muncie Transit Supply	Neopart Transit LLC	The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance Program
-----	-------------	--------------------	---------------------	--------------------------	-------------	--------------------------	------------------------	---------------------	------------	--	--------------------------	------------------------	---------------	-------------------	-------------------------------------	-----------------------	---------------------	-----------------------------------	---------	------------------	----------------------	-------------------	-----------------------------

Number of Bids, Winning Bidder & PO Number	SKU	Winning Bid	Price	Lead Time	Lead Time	Lead Time	Lead Time	Lead Time	Lead Time	Lead Time	Lead Time	Lead Time	Lead Time	Lead Time	Lead Time	Lead Time	Lead Time	Lead Time	Lead Time	Lead Time	Lead Time	Lead Time	Lead Time
8		41271	28.18				78.99		32.22						54.04	28.18	33.34	33.96	44.42		48.18		
	Muncie Transit Supply 232598		-				2 Weeks		Stock						Oct 13th	Stock	Stock	2 Stock Balance 5 Weeks	60 Days		Stock		
7		41272	32.80				78.99								38.26	38.10	32.80	33.55	45.88		35.90		
	Neopart Transit LLC 232599		-				2 Weeks								Oct 28th	30 Days	Stock	5 Weeks	75 Days		Stock		
5		290673	950.00				1,100.00		950.00							1,065.86		961.88	1,299.14				
	Gillig LLC 232594		-				4 Weeks		4 Weeks							21 Days		1 Stock Balance 6 Weeks	90 Days				
4		290681	107.22						107.22							118.10		112.39	151.67				
	Gillig LLC 232594		-						Stock							21 Days		5 Weeks	60 Days				
5		290683	64.00						64.10	64.00						68.12	65.00	74.58					
	Hydraulic Electric Component Supply Inc. 232595								Stock	14 Days						Stock	2-3 Weeks	1 Stock Balance 6 Weeks					
1		60792	245.72				245.72																
	Eldorado National Inc. 232593		-				Stock																
2		41294	1,394.50				1,873.28											1,394.50					
	The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232600		-				6 Weeks																
1		30472	138.97																138.97				
	The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232600		-															Stock					
4		250784	203.19						203.19							220.00		227.22	303.02				
	Gillig LLC 232594		-						Stock							30 Days		Stock	60 Days				
7		41332	324.52				400.00		325.00						378.16	366.60	331.93	324.52	367.10				
	The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232600		-				6-8 Weeks		2-4 Weeks						Oct 20th	30 Days	8-10 Weeks	18 Stock Balance 15 Weeks	Stock				
3		290695	61.88				130.50									61.88		73.33					
	Muncie Transit Supply 232598		-				Stock									Stock		25 Weeks					
4		2510000	325.14						555.00							642.75	325.14	622.43					
	Neopart Transit LLC 232599		-						Stock							45 Days	3-4 Weeks	Stock					

Pace RFQ 421329 Due: 09/23/2021

		TOTAL																						
White = No Bid																								
Green = Disqualified																								
SKU		Winning Bid	Action Truck Parts	Area Diesel Service	Autex Automotive Devices	CBM US Inc.	Coffman Truck Sales Inc.	Eldorado National Inc.	General Truck Parts	Gillig LLC	Hydraulic Electric Component Supply Inc.	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive Inc.	Lift -U Parts	Midwest Bus Corp.	Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co.	Muncie Transit Supply	Neopart Transit LLC	The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance Program
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232600	7	410000	96.41					152.95		120.00						98.34	108.12		96.41	164.26		130.14		
			-					6 Weeks		6 Weeks						Stock	13 Stock Balance 21 Days		Stock	60 Days		Stock		
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232600	5	410002	794.05					1,100.00								1,427.03	830.06	800.40	794.05					
			-					Stock								Oct 20th	315.79 Core Charge Stock	300.00 Core Charge 2-3 Weeks	300.00 Core Charge Stock					
Neopart Transit LLC 232599	6	410003	164.60					460.79								173.42	169.35	164.60	171.46	235.00				
			-					Stock								3 Stock Balance Oct 27th	21 Days	3-4 Weeks	6 Weeks	60 Days				
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232600	5	410006	148.63					170.00		151.50						DQ	215.52	151.77	148.63					
			-					6-8 Weeks		2-4 Weeks						Not an approved OEM part number	21 Days	1-2 Weeks	Stock					
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co. 232597	7	410009	105.28					154.95		120.00						105.28	108.10		107.97	164.26		130.14		
			-					6 Weeks		6 Weeks						Stock	21 Days		Stock	60 Days		Stock		
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co. 232597	6	610001	33.15				33.91									DQ	39.12		39.78			DQ		33.67
			-				Stock									Not an approved OEM part number			Stock			Not an approved OEM part number		Stock
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232600	3	1510008	12.72					18.24		12.75									12.72					
			-					Stock		4-5 Weeks									Stock					
Eldorado National Inc. 232593	1	210002	460.79					460.79																
			-					Stock																
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232600	1	1510031	1.53																1.53					
			-																Stock					



