



Pace

RFQ# 421328

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																		
	0		0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	I/O Controls	P&G	Area Diesel	Rome Truck	Interstate Power	Kirks	Neopart	CBM	Gillig	Battery Service	Hydraulic Electric	Mohawk	Prevost	Muncie	Vehicle Maintenance	Coffman	Aftermarket Parts
		-																	
4	72135	56.91							59.38						79.80	61.10			56.91
Aftermarket Parts	232613								stock						60d	45d			10w
2	71785	0.16													0.63				0.16
Aftermarket Parts	232613														stock				10w
3	74736	0.16												0.16		0.19			0.99
Mohawk	232607	-												stock		21d			5w
-	72077	-																	
		-																	
4	71179	0.43					3.33							0.60		0.43			0.43
Muncie	232615	-					10d							stock		stock			stock
2	71389	12.15									27.10			12.15					
Gillig	232623	-									stock			unapproved part					
6	72094	14.91						89.00						23.16	17.28	22.00	14.91		19.08
Vehicle Maintenance	232616	-						stock						4w	60d	30d	stock		5w
4	71442	6.27									10.25			7.32		6.27			10.96
Muncie	232615	-									4w			4w		30d			25w
2	70730	0.15												0.15					0.89
Mohawk	232607	-												stock					stock
4	72109	1,075.00	1,121.75								1,075.00					1,246.50			1,319.33
Gillig	232623	-	12w								8w					90d			10w
1	72122	2.35																	2.35
		-																	MOQ
3	72148	89.04									114.05			89.04					128.18
Mohawk	232607	-									stock			stock					stock
3	72155	63.56													81.25	63.75			63.56
Aftermarket Parts	232613	-													60d	45d			8w

Pace

RFQ# 421328

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																		
	0		0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	I/O Controls	P&G	Area Diesel	Rome Truck	Interstate Power	Kirks	Neopart	CBM	Gillig	Battery Service	Hydraulic Electric	Mohawk	Prevost	Muncie	Vehicle Maintenance	Coffman	Aftermarket Parts
5	72156	21.46							21.59		24.05				29.30	22.22			21.46
Aftermarket Parts	232613	-							7w		10w				60d	60d			6w
-	72163	-																	
		-																	
5	72167	37.36							38.02		43.25				51.10	39.25			37.36
Aftermarket Parts	232613	-							stock		10w				60d	60d			stock
2	72170	31.40														31.40			38.00
Muncie	232615	-														70d			MOQ
2	72172	31.15														31.15			35.66
Muncie	232615	-														70d			12w
2	72181	588.87	588.87																708.70
I/O Controls	232620	-	12w																14w
4	72194	70.98							70.98						95.39	73.03			71.10
Neopart	232605	-							7w						75d	60d			4w
-	72203	-																	
		-																	
2	72216	144.03									144.14								144.03
Aftermarket Parts	232613	-									2w								5w
2	72264	588.87	588.87																708.70
I/O Controls	232620	-	12w																13w
4	72266	30.35							30.54						40.86	31.31			30.35
Aftermarket Parts	232613	-							7w						stock	60d			13w
3	72292	1.65													2.39	1.65			2.30
Muncie	232615	-													75d	stock			8w
2	72301	275.00										275.00							298.62
Battery Service	232624	-										9w							5w
3	72382	292.50													385.80	292.50			292.65

Pace

RFQ# 421328

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																	
		0		0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
NO # of Bids	SKU	Winning bid	I/O Controls	P&G	Area Diesel	Rome Truck	Interstate Power	Kirks	Neopart	CBM	Gillig	Battery Service	Hydraulic Electric	Mohawk	Prevost	Muncie	Vehicle Maintenance	Coffman	Aftermarket Parts
Muncie	232615	-													90d	90d			15w
5	72388	36.75									38.00			36.75	84.86	65.70			52.37
Mohawk	232607	-									stock			2w	stock	60d			9w
4	710007	17.17												27.05	26.65	17.17			21.97
Muncie	232615	-												4w	stock	stock			5w
-	710008	-																	
		-																	
1	710032	156.81																	156.81
Aftermarket Parts	232613	-																	stock
3	710052	2,236.02		2,236.02				2,614.00								2,585.65			
P&G	232621	-		stock				stock								60d			
6	710057	47.00			49.80								47.00	59.60		55.88		47.58	58.18
Availability - Coffman	232617	-			stock								14d	5w		30d		stock	stock
5	710058	16.19			19.26									59.60		18.90		16.19	54.80
Coffman	232617	-			stock									5w		30d		stock	stock
2	710095	56.65														56.65			62.08
Muncie	232615	-														30d			6w
5	710099	39.40						111.00						56.30	39.40	87.07			137.26
Prevost	232625	-						stock						stock	60d	stock			11w
6	710119	2,777.04		2,777.04				3,195.00			3,200.00				4,224.33	3,085.60			3,459.20
P&G	232621	-		stock				stock			stock				60d	60d			9w
-	710130	-																	
		-																	
-	710156	-																	
		-																	
4	710161	32.49												39.83	62.31	32.49			47.73
Muncie	232615	-												5w	60d	30d			9w



Pace

RFQ# 421328

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																		
	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	I/O Controls	P&G	Area Diesel	Rome Truck	Interstate Power	Kirks	Neopart	CBM	Gillig	Battery Service	Hydraulic Electric	Mohawk	Prevost	Muncie	Vehicle Maintenance	Coffman	Aftermarket Parts
		-																	
1	710367	46.08																	46.08
Aftermarket Parts	232613	-																	19w
1	710392	37.17																	37.17
Aftermarket Parts	232613	-																	4w
1	710394	34.14																	34.14
Aftermarket Parts	232613	-																	5w
1	710395	32.41																	32.41
Aftermarket Parts	232613	-																	5w
1	710396	31.27																	31.27
Aftermarket Parts	232613	-																	5w
1	710403	643.80																	643.80
Aftermarket Parts	232613	-																	9w
2	710404	140.00											140.00						160.07
Hydraulic Electric	232612	-											14d						5w