Bid Solicitation Date: RFQ No. Specification No.: Specification No.: Bid Opening Date:
() Bid Tabulation 09/08/21 420907 10/11/2021

Bidder Name(s) Do Right Services Co Shareef & Sons Snow & Ice Management Snow Systems Tovar Snov[LPéofessionals

Line| Oty Snow Rem.oval & Pavement Salting at Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

Various Pace Locations Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost

1 | 1 |North Shore Division No bid No Bid 24,180.00 [ $  24,180.00 25,580.00 25,580.00 | $ 34,733.00 | $ 34,733.00
2 | 1 |South Division No bid $ 6167500 |$  61,675.00 26,505.00 [ $  26,505.00 42,460.00 42,460.00 [ $ 80,987.00 | $ 80,987.00
3 | 1 [WestDivision $ 124,600.00 | $  124,600.00 No Bid 25,880.00 [ $  25,880.00 34,880.00 34,880.00 [ $ 50,285.00 | $ 50,285.00
4 | 1 |Northwest Division No bid No Bid 15,580.00 | $ 15,580.00 23,750.00 23,750.00 | $ 34,392.00 | $ 34,392.00

$ $ $ -

$ $ $ -

$ $ $ -

$ $ $ -

$ $ $ -

$ $ $ -

$ $ $ -

$ $ $ -

$ $ $ -

$ $ $ -

$ $ $ -
Total Bid Amount $  124,600.00 $  61,675.00 $  92,145.00 126,670.00 $ 200,397.00

Comments:




