

Pace

RFQ# 421252

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																		
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	A&A Auto	Interstate Power	CBM	Neopart	Vehicle Maintenance	Prevost	Rex Sales	Aftermarket Parts	Suburban Truck	Area Diesel	MW Bus - NO BID	Kirks	Action Truck	Mohawk	Muncie	Gillig	Coffman	Eldorado
-	1210138	-																		OBSOLETE
	XXXXXXXX	-																		
3	130756	640.69		640.69						765.54						855.16				
Aftermarket Parts	232473	-		no lead given						3w						3w				
10	81262	4.81	5.69	20.23			4.81			9.58	6.33			6.65	12.00	5.85	5.12		5.83	
Vehicle Maintenance	232475	-	stock	20d			stock			3w	stock			stock	stock	3w	30d		7d	
1	110135	34.58																		34.58
Eldorado	232492																			stock
10	120488	13.85	21.00	18.17			15.85	31.56		23.12				20.25	33.00	13.85	16.49		17.43	
Mohawk	232470	-	stock	20d			stock	60d		stock				stock	stock	stock	30d		7d	
4	110100	2.00								2.23						2.78	2.58	2.00		
Gillig	232468	-								stock						stock	stock	stock		
10	110136	73.11	74.69	87.76			73.11	149.25			87.76			73.75		78.75	79.90		80.88	99.00
Vehicle Maintenance	232475	-	stock	20d			stock	60d			5w			stock		6w	30d		stock	BID LATE
6	81298	49.10			49.10			74.23		83.00						55.06	70.10		57.55	
CBM	232477	-			stock			60d		stock						unapproved part	stock		90d	
8	81313	37.50	86.00		37.50			97.02		104.74		87.27				90.00	48.08		88.27	
CBM	232477	-	stock		stock			60d		stock		stock				unapproved part	stock		stock	
5	81441	43.50								51.24		44.06				52.40	43.50		44.67	
Muncie	232469									stock		stock				4w	stock		stock	
6	81444	59.40				74.80		109.23		76.50						59.40	75.57	72.00		
Mohawk	232470					6w		stock		stock						stock	60d	stock		
3	81497	1,859.34								3,186.58		1,859.34							1,991.73	
Area Diesel	232472									5w		stock							stock	
12	81521	15.98	21.79	19.35		18.22	17.11			18.99	19.35	22.85		19.00	27.00	18.64	15.98		18.99	

Pace

RFQ# 421252

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																		
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	A&A Auto	Interstate Power	CBM	Neopart	Vehicle Maintenance	Prevost	Rex Sales	Aftermarket Parts	Suburban Truck	Area Diesel	MW Bus - NO BID	Kirks	Action Truck	Mohawk	Muncie	Gillig	Coffman	Eldorado
Muncie	232469		stock	20d		stock	stock			stock	stock	stock		stock	stock	4w	stock		7w	
6	81533	11.69					13.61			25.51		41.12				11.69	12.65		43.65	
Availability-Vehicle Maintenance	232475	-					stock			3w		stock				4w	30d		stock	
1	81536	597.57																		597.57
Eldorado	232492																			4w
11	1210003	19.82		19.90	33.29	22.55	19.82			31.17	19.90	26.31			28.00	20.29	26.79		21.87	
Vehicle Maintenance	232475			20d	stock	stock	stock			stock	unapproved part	stock			stock	4w	30d		stock	
1	1010005	292.80																		292.80
Eldorado	232492	-																		stock
4	810023	47.03								58.51		47.03					56.26		47.68	
Area Diesel	232472	-								5w		stock					30d		stock	
7	1010011	793.92				1,144.00			1,295.00	1,473.35		793.92		960.00		1,170.00			1,156.12	
Area Diesel	232472	-				10d			stock	6w		stock		stock		2w			90d	
8	1010012	1,214.00				1,459.05			1,495.00	2,737.81		1,769.69		1,220.00		1,214.00	2,227.72		1,845.34	
Mohawk	232470	-				10d			stock	5w		stock		stock		stock	30d		stock	
5	810027	496.99				550.65				662.93		496.99					625.52		520.75	
Area Diesel	232472	-				stock				9w		stock					30d		stock	
7	1010014	3.00						3.00	9.18			7.91		3.65		4.10	9.45		7.82	
Rex Sales	232474	-						stock	stock			stock		stock		unapproved part	30d		stock	
5	810030	1.41							2.81			2.38				1.41	2.98		2.45	
Area Diesel	232472	-								stock		stock				unapproved part	30d		stock	
7	1010015	843.45				1,227.60			1,295.00	1,529.30		843.45		947.00		975.00			1,240.11	
Area Diesel	232472	-				10d			stock	13w		stock		stock		10d			90d	
4	1010016	2,210.83								3,119.23		2,210.83					2,760.55		2,349.23	
Area Diesel	232472	-								7w		30d					30d		90d	

Pace

RFQ# 421252

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																		
		0			0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	A&A Auto	Interstate Power	CBM	Neopart	Vehicle Maintenance	Prevost	Rex Sales	Aftermarket Parts	Suburban Truck	Area Diesel	MW Bus - NO BID	Kirks	Action Truck	Mohawk	Muncie	Gillig	Coffman	Eldorado
4	810071	641.69								1,027.48		641.69					798.77		675.31	
Area Diesel	232472	-								9w		stock					30d		stock	
5	810078	389.41								605.40		389.41				570.00	485.22		406.93	
Area Diesel	232472	-								5w		stock			4w	30d			90d	
3	810079	389.41								588.30		389.41							406.93	
Area Diesel	232472	-								7w		stock							90d	
6	1010028	6.36							8.00	12.70		10.86				6.36	12.85		10.95	
Rex Sales	232474	-							stock	stock		stock				unapproved part	30d		stock	
5	810093	18.40					18.40			38.03		34.69		19.12					36.55	
Vehicle Maintenance	232475	-					stock			7w		stock		stock					30d	
7	1210070	45.90				55.14		59.20		64.42		57.35				51.58	60.00		45.90	
Availability-Neopart	232476	-				stock		60d		3w		stock			4w	stock			90d	
1	1210078	979.00																		979.00
Eldorado	232492	-																		120d
1	810166	51.89																		51.89
Eldorado	232492	-																		6w
5	1110003	94.24								127.27		94.24				127.50	120.99		95.57	
Area Diesel	232472	-								stock		stock			4w	30d			stock	
4	810176	383.49								586.15		383.49					464.00		388.72	
Area Diesel	232472	-								stock		stock					stock		stock	
4	1210087	64.49								77.54		64.49					78.99		65.60	
Area Diesel	232472	-								stock		stock					30d		stock	
5	810192	1,321.11								1,554.39		1,321.11				1,665.00	1,392.00		1,467.60	
Area Diesel	232472	-								6w		stock			4w	3 only, need 5			90d	
4	810203	2,469.69								3,674.18		2,469.69					3,194.11		2,645.49	

Pace

RFQ# 421252

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																		
		0			0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	A&A Auto	Interstate Power	CBM	Neopart	Vehicle Maintenance	Prevost	Rex Sales	Aftermarket Parts	Suburban Truck	Area Diesel	MW Bus - NO BID	Kirks	Action Truck	Mohawk	Muncie	Gillig	Coffman	Eldorado
	Area Diesel	232472	-							5w		stock					30d		stock	
4	810204	256.81								493.40		838.96					1,670.11		256.81	
	Coffman	232467	-							stock		stock					30d		stock	
2	1210097	17.49								35.57									17.49	
	Availability-Aftermarket Parts	232473	-							stock									90d	
5	810216	4.05					4.05			5.42		4.35					5.20		4.40	
	Vehicle Maintenance	232475	-				stock			5w		stock					21d		stock	
3	1010060	2,153.69								3,202.93		2,153.69							2,269.80	
	Area Diesel	232472	-							7w		30d							90d	
7	1010061	876.98				1,012.00			1,025.00	1,357.86		876.98		908.00		890.00			1,065.50	
	Area Diesel	232472	-			stock			stock	9w		stock		stock		4w			stock	
6	810271	34.25					34.75			91.95		811.95		34.25		85.98	84.33			
	Kirks	232471	-				no lead given			8w		stock		stock		4w	30d			
1	810299	333.68																		333.68
	Eldorado	232492	-																	6w
3	1210133	38.49								67.03							48.13	38.49		
	Gillig	232468	-							6w							35d	stock		
4	810361	33.64								42.36		33.64					40.22		34.04	
	Area Diesel	232472	-							9w		stock					30d		stock	