

Pace

RFQ# 421249

WHITE=NO BID

TOTAL

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

Green=Disqualified

Sku

Winning bid

Battery Service

A&amp;A Auto - NO BID

P&amp;G Keene

IOC

Neopart

Kirks

Muncie

Aftermarket Parts

Prevost

Mohawk

Gillig

Coffman

Eldorado

NO # of Bids

1

72125

74.98

74.98

Eldorado

232492

-

stock

5

72121

31.51

98.07

Prevost

232478

-

bid late

6

72143

10.50

23.03

Aftermarket Parts

232473

-

bid late

2

71357

11.75

16.11

Eldorado

232492

-

stock

1

71539

34.58

34.58

Eldorado

232492

-

6w

3

71964

1.94

4.75

Aftermarket Parts

232473

-

stock

4

71389

12.15

98.07

Gillig

232468

-

bid late

4

72055

126.94

126.94

Muncie

232469

-

bid late

1

72120

103.85

103.85

Eldorado

232492

-

stock

3

72170

20.15

20.15

31.40

38.48

Pace

RFQ# 421249

WHITE=NO BID

TOTAL

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

Green=Disqualified

Sku

Winning bid

Battery  
ServiceA&A Auto -  
NO BID

P&amp;G Keene

IOC

Neopart

Kirks

Muncie

Aftermarket  
Parts

Prevost

Mohawk

Gillig

Coffman

Eldorado

NO # of Bids

Muncie

232469

70d

8w

bid late

3

72171

20.15

31.15

37.89

20.15

Muncie

232469

45d

10w

bid late

3

72172

20.15

31.15

44.42

20.15

Muncie

232469

75d

60d

bid late

1

72182

3.98

3.98

Eldorado

232492

stock

1

72203

34.58

34.58

Eldorado

232492

-

6w

4

72216

144.14

149.18

227.31

144.14

311.65

Gillig

232468

10w

stock

stock

bid late

4

72238

1,486.59

1,797.28

1,997.00

2,296.52

1,486.59

IOC

232482

12w

90d

14w

bid late

1

72301

279.06

279.06

Battery Service

232484

-

7w

3

72381

310.10

310.10

354.49

450.19

Muncie

232469

-

90d

15w

bid late

7

72388

36.75

63.15

65.70

52.37

84.86

36.75

38.00

66.07

Mohawk

232470

-

7w

45d

9w

stock

3w

stock

bid late



Pace

RFQ# 421249

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL														
	0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified															
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Battery Service	A&A Auto - NO BID	P&G Keene	IOC	Neopart	Kirks	Muncie	Aftermarket Parts	Prevost	Mohawk	Gillig	Coffman	Eldorado
Eldorado	232492	-													6w
1	710247	249.00													249.00
Eldorado	232492	-													20w
3	710260	408.87				408.87			454.31	472.83					
IOC	232482	-				12w			60d	14w					
1	710278	578.47													578.47
Eldorado	232492	-													6w
3	710300	43.12							47.95	43.12				45.50	
Aftermarket Parts	232473	-							30d	6w				stock	
1	710335	597.48													597.48
Eldorado	232492	-													6w
1	710391	24.49								24.49					
Aftermarket Parts	232473	-								4w					