

Pace RFQ 421247 Due: 08/25/2021

	TOTAL																								
White = No Bid																									
Green = Disqualified																									

SKU	Winning Bid	A & A Auto Parts Stores Inc.	Action Truck Parts	Area Diesel Service	Autex Devices Corporation	CBM US Inc.	Coffman Truck Sales Inc.	EIDorado National Inc.	General Truck Parts	Gillig LLC	Hydraulic Electric Component Supply Inc.	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive Inc.	Lift -U Parts	Midwest Bus Corp.	Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co.	Muncie Transit Supply	Neopart Transit LLC	The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance Program
-----	-------------	------------------------------	--------------------	---------------------	---------------------------	-------------	--------------------------	------------------------	---------------------	------------	--	--------------------------	------------------------	---------------	-------------------	-------------------------------------	-----------------------	---------------------	-----------------------------------	---------	------------------	----------------------	-------------------	-----------------------------

Number of Bids, Winning Bidder & PO Number

7	41236	144.18				168.62		463.58								148.63	151.75	144.18	155.25	205.86	No Bid			
Neopart Transit 232511						45 Days		4 Weeks								3 Stock Balance 15 Days	21 Days	3-4 Weeks	5 Weeks	60 Days				
8	41237	91.44				105.16		381.33		95.00						97.75	99.15	91.44	155.25	123.96				
Neopart Transit 232511						45 Days		4 weeks		1 Stock Balance 4 Weeks						Sep 21st	30 Days	3-4 Weeks	5 Weeks	60 Days				
7	40108	2.90								3.75			3.85			3.22	2.90		3.02	4.00			3.06	
Muncie Transit Supply 232510										Stock			Stock			Sep 28th	Stock		Stock	Stock		Stock		
6	41131	48.52														48.52	96.55	89.67	91.71	101.58		97.21		
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co. 232509																Stock	60 Days	Stock	Stock	60 Days		Stock		
4	250653	370.35								446.63							395.75		370.35	681.25				
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232512										Stock							Stock		Stock	60 Days				
3	20701	357.83						357.83									363.75		422.28					
EIDorado National Inc. 232520								Stock									60 Days		11 Weeks					
6	40504	1.12														1.12	1.33	1.93	1.38	1.76		1.55		
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co. 232509																Stock	Stock	Stock	Stock	Stock		Stock		
7	41238	91.44				105.17				95.00						97.75	99.15	91.44	94.82	123.97				
Neopart Transit 232511						45 Days				Stock						Sep 28th	21 Days	3-4 Weeks	Stock	60 Days				
6	41033	2.01								2.85						2.47	2.35	2.01	2.10			2.18		
Neopart Transit 232511										Stock						20 Stock	Must purchase in multiples of 10 - 21 Days	Stock	Stock			Stock		
10	40953	13.67				13.95				13.67		44.00				30.08	38.45	22.23	24.14	18.10		30.08		13.97
Gillig LLC 232504						8 Stock Balance 60 Days				Stock		Stock				Aug 28th	21 Days	Stock	Stock	60 Days		Stock		Stock
7	41215	129.76						170.00		145.28						195.65	129.76	134.97	141.03	183.28				
Muncie Transit Supply 232510								6-8 Weeks		Stock						Sep 14th	Stock	2-3 Weeks	5 Weeks	60 Days				

Pace RFQ 421247 Due: 08/25/2021

	TOTAL																							
White = No Bid																								
Green = Disqualified																								

SKU	Winning Bid	A & A Auto Parts Stores Inc.	Action Truck Parts	Area Diesel Service	Autex Devices Corporation	CBM US Inc.	Coffman Truck Sales Inc.	ElDorado National Inc.	General Truck Parts	Gillig LLC	Hydraulic Electric Component Supply Inc.	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive Inc.	Lift -U Parts	Midwest Bus Corp.	Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co.	Muncie Transit Supply	Neopart Transit LLC	The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance Program
-----	-------------	------------------------------	--------------------	---------------------	---------------------------	-------------	--------------------------	------------------------	---------------------	------------	--	--------------------------	------------------------	---------------	-------------------	-------------------------------------	-----------------------	---------------------	-----------------------------------	---------	------------------	----------------------	-------------------	-----------------------------

Number of Bids, Winning Bidder & PO Number

10	41227	13.75		38.00						24.99			41.78			13.75	23.40	43.27	46.61	36.73		31.92		23.71
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co. 232509				Stock						Stock			Stock			Stock	Stock	Stock	Stock	60 Days		Stock		Stock
10	10199	12.70	29.79	25.00						33.25						12.70	21.20	32.09	25.90	45.85		24.33		20.21
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co. 232509			Stock	Stock						11 Stock Balance 2-4 Weeks						Stock	21 Days	Stock	18 Stock Balance 5 Weeks	60 Days		Stock		Stock
5	40632	0.16														0.16	0.30	0.90	0.35	0.48				
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co. 232509																Stock	Stock	Stock	Stock	Stock				
9	60494	6.52	10.29				10.29					11.34	12.48			10.74	11.25		18.16			11.34		6.52
Vehicle Maintenance Program 232513	QTY. 48		Stock				Stock				10-14 Days		19 Stock			Sep 21st	12 Pc Min. 30 Days		4 Weeks			Stock		Stock
6	10001	0.37														0.37	1.36	1.02	1.05	1.52		1.22		
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co. 232509																Stock	Must purchase in multiples of 50 - 21 Days	Stock	Stock	Stock		Stock		
7	10365	68.80								75.99			177.00			69.07	73.75		68.80	120.75		141.24		
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232512										Stock			Stock			Stock	Stock		3 Weeks	60 Days		Stock		
6	10366	67.28								75.99						69.07	68.95		67.28	143.89		141.24		
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232512										Stock						Stock	Stock		3 Weeks	60 Days		Stock		
4	20535	35.40								46.81						35.40	73.90		51.37					
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co. 232509										Stock						Stock	Stock		Stock					
5	41019	0.99														0.99	1.98	2.33	2.31	2.74				
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co. 232509	QTY. 10															Stock	Stock	Must be ordered in multiples of 20 Stock	Stock	Stock				
4	60748	45.62						63.44									45.62		53.92	64.67				
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232512								Stock									60 Days		Stock	90 Days				

Pace RFQ 421247 Due: 08/25/2021

	TOTAL																									
White = No Bid																										
Green = Disqualified																										

SKU	Winning Bid	A & A Auto Parts Stores Inc.	Action Truck Parts	Area Diesel Service	Autex Devices Corporation	CBM US Inc.	Coffman Truck Sales Inc.	EIDorado National Inc.	General Truck Parts	Gillig LLC	Hydraulic Electric Component Supply Inc.	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive Inc.	Lift -U Parts	Midwest Bus Corp.	Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co.	Muncie Transit Supply	Neopart Transit LLC	The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance Program
-----	-------------	------------------------------	--------------------	---------------------	---------------------------	-------------	--------------------------	------------------------	---------------------	------------	--	--------------------------	------------------------	---------------	-------------------	-------------------------------------	-----------------------	---------------------	-----------------------------------	---------	------------------	----------------------	-------------------	-----------------------------

Number of Bids, Winning Bidder & PO Number

3	151976	948.32						1,619.95									994.72		948.32						
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232512		-						Stock									30 Days		6 Weeks						
7	20707	93.10						172.75		95.00							111.40	93.10	95.22	131.62		106.24			
Neopart Transit 232511		-						Stock		2-4 Weeks							30 Days	Stock	6 Weeks	60 Days		Stock			
7	20708	93.10						172.75		95.00							111.40	93.10	95.22	131.62		106.24			
Neopart Transit 232511		-						Stock		2-4 Weeks							30 Days	Stock	6 Weeks	60 Days		Stock			
1	20709	784.99						784.99																	
EIDorado National Inc. 232520		-						Stock																	
3	10411	109.20						161.57									109.20		110.57						
Muncie Transit Supply 232510		-						Stock									Stock		Stock						
1	60770	63.44						63.44																	
EIDorado National Inc. 232520		-						Stock																	
1	60772	20.15						20.15																	
EIDorado National Inc. 232520		-						2 Weeks																	
4	290679	52.00								54.76	52.00								56.70	80.13					
Hydraulic Electric Component Supply Inc. 232506		-								Stock	Stock								Stock	60 Days					
1	41282	31.40						31.40																	
EIDorado National Inc. 232520		-						2 Weeks																	
5	20727	233.10						373.78		233.10							233.15		240.20	238.99					
Gillig LLC 232504		-						8 Weeks		6-8 Weeks							49 Days		10 Weeks	75 Days					
2	41294	1,394.50						1,464.57											1,394.50						
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232512		-						2 Stock Balance 8 Weeks											3 Weeks						
6	290690	495.00						930.83		495.00							582.85	500.43	531.10	726.31					
Gillig LLC 232504		-						4 Weeks		1 Stock Balance 2-4 Weeks							21 Days	Stock	Stock	60 Days					
8	30161	23.23								23.50							36.68	48.80	25.00	23.33	37.42		37.65	23.23	
Vehicle Maintenance Program 232513		-								Stock						Stock	45 Days	Stock	19 Weeks	60 Days		Stock		Stock	
7	41332	325.00						375.00		325.00						412.16	430.86	371.00	326.31	367.10					
Gillig LLC 232504		-						8 Weeks Min.		2-4 Weeks						Sep 21st	30 Days	2-3 Weeks	Stock	Stock					

Pace RFQ 421247 Due: 08/25/2021

		TOTAL																							
White = No Bid																									
Green = Disqualified																									
	Winning Bid	A & A Auto Parts Stores Inc.	Action Truck Parts	Area Diesel Service	Autex Devices Corporation	CBM US Inc.	Coffman Truck Sales Inc.	EIDorado National Inc.	General Truck Parts	Gillig LLC	Hydraulic Electric Component Supply Inc.	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive Inc.	Lift -U Parts	Midwest Bus Corp.	Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co.	Muncie Transit Supply	Neopart Transit LLC	The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance Program	
SKU																									
Number of Bids, Winning Bidder & PO Number																									
3	290695	61.75						98.07									61.99		61.75						
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232512		-						Stock									Stock		Stock						
6	290696	9.00			9.00			40.35									DQ	26.75	11.25	10.06	15.33				
Autex Devices Corporation 232502		-			1 Day			Stock									Not an approved OEM	Stock	3-4 Weeks	Stock	Stock				
6	410000	96.41						144.25									98.00	96.50		96.41	164.26		131.36		
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232512								2-4 Weeks									Stock	Stock		Stock	60 Days		Stock		
5	410001	783.94						1,133.00									1,427.03	783.94	807.81		794.05				
Muncie Transit Supply 232510		WEST HAS 4 CORES						225.00 Core Charge Stock									Sep 21st	582.00 Core Charge Stock	300.00 Core Charge Stock		Stock				
5	410002	794.05						1,133.00									1,427.03	830.06	804.10	794.05					
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232512		WEST HAS 4 CORES						225.00 Core Charge Stock									Sep 21st	Stock	Stock		300.00 Core Charge Stock				
6	410003	164.60						349.29									171.42	169.35	164.60	171.46	235.00				
Neopart Transit 232511		-						4 Weeks									Stock	21 Days	3-4 Weeks	6 Weeks	60 Days				
5	410006	148.63						185.00		151.50							DQ		149.01	148.63			296.33		
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232512		-						Stock		2-4 Weeks							Not an approved OEM		Stock	Stock		Stock			
6	410010	126.00						195.00		126.50					132.55		DQ	126.00	154.82	144.67					
Muncie Transit Supply 232510		-						10 Stock Balance 8-10 Weeks		Stock					14 Days		Not an approved OEM	Stock	2-3 Weeks	28 Stock Balance 4 Weeks					
4	2510006	97.20								97.20								111.00		101.00	136.62				
Gillig LLC 232504		-								2-4 Weeks								35 Days		Stock	105 Days				
3	1510008	12.75						14.26			12.75										12.92				
Hydraulic Electric Component Supply Inc. 232506		-						Stock			5 Weeks									Stock					
1	110006	337.89						337.89																	
EIDorado National Inc. 232520		-						3 Stock Balance 10 Weeks																	
3	610009	2.49						7.45										4.30		2.49					
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232512		-						4 Weeks										30 Days		Stock					

	TOTAL																								
White = No Bid																									
Green = Disqualified																									

SKU	Winning Bid	A & A Auto Parts Stores Inc.	Action Truck Parts	Area Diesel Service	Autex Devices Corporation	CBM US Inc.	Coffman Truck Sales Inc.	EIDorado National Inc.	General Truck Parts	Gillig LLC	Hydraulic Electric Component Supply Inc.	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive Inc.	Lift -U Parts	Midwest Bus Corp.	Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Co.	Muncie Transit Supply	Neopart Transit LLC	The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance Program
-----	-------------	------------------------------	--------------------	---------------------	---------------------------	-------------	--------------------------	------------------------	---------------------	------------	--	--------------------------	------------------------	---------------	-------------------	-------------------------------------	-----------------------	---------------------	-----------------------------------	---------	------------------	----------------------	-------------------	-----------------------------

Number of Bids, Winning Bidder & PO Number

8	410080	274.75						330.00		275.00					292.00		274.75	301.61	288.77	418.55		357.12		
Muncie Transit Supply 232510		-						Stock		Stock					14 Days		Stock	Stock	11 Stock Balance 5 Weeks	60 Days		Stock		
3	2510088	75.00								205.00	75.00								222.11					
Hydraulic Electric Component Supply Inc. 232506		-								4-6 Weeks	14 Days								9 Stock Balance 5 Weeks					
5	610088	36.40		105.02		36.40	106.79										38.33		58.92					
CBM US Inc. 232503		-		Stock		Stock	Stock										Stock		Stock					
1	610089	11,299.00						11,299.00																
EIDorado National Inc. 232520		-						30 Days																
1	1510178	7.99						7.99																
EIDorado National Inc. 232520		-						2-4 Weeks																
4	610092	370.48						907.52							385.00		383.34		370.48					
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232512		-						3 Stock Balance 8-10 Weeks							21 Days		90 Days		6 Weeks					
1	310049	1.95						1.95																
EIDorado National Inc. 232520		-						2 Weeks																
1	410102	89.41														DQ			89.41					
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232512		-														Not an approved OEM			Stock					
5	610139	67.43		67.43			74.79									83.83	79.80		84.37					
Area Diesel Service 232501		-		Stock			Stock									2 Stock Balance Sep 14th	4 Stock Balance 30 Days		7 Weeks					
1	2910055	533.43																	533.43					
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232512		-																	5 Weeks					
1	2910056	1,108.98																	1,108.98					
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232512		-																	5 Weeks					
1	410127	134.84																	134.84					
The Aftermarket Parts Company LLC 232512		-																	3 Weeks					
3	2910070	14.00								15.50	14.00								24.25					
Hydraulic Electric Component Supply Inc. 232506		-								Stock	Stock								Stock					