

Pace

RFQ# 421229

| WHITE=NO BID | TOTAL | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
|---------------------|---------|-------------|---------------------|------------------|--------|----------------|---------|----------|-----------------|---------------------|-------------|----------|----------|------------------|--------------------|-------------------|--------|-----------------|--------|----------|
| | 0 | | | | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 |
| Green=Disqualified | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| NO # of Bids | Sku | Winning bid | Vehicle Maintenance | Interstate Power | CBM | Suburban Truck | Prevost | Neopart | MW Bus - NO BID | Rome Truck - NO BID | Area Diesel | Eldorado | Kirks | Diesel Emissions | Hydraulic Electric | Aftermarket Parts | Gillig | Mohawk | Muncie | Coffman |
| 1 | 110138 | 6.29 | | | | | | | | | | 6.29 | | | | | | | | |
| Eldorado | 232436 | - | | | | | | | | | stock | | | | | | | | | |
| 10 | 120488 | 15.00 | 15.00 | 18.17 | 17.74 | 18.17 | 31.56 | | | | | | 20.23 | | | 19.89 | | 18.10 | 16.98 | 17.43 |
| Vehicle Maintenance | 232417 | - | stock | 20d | stock | 5w | 60d | | | | | | stock | | | 11w | | stock | 30d | 10d |
| 6 | 130612 | 52.25 | | 86.33 | | | | | | | | | | | 61.00 | 96.17 | | 52.25 | 82.90 | 75.98 |
| Hydraulic Electric | 232426 | - | | stock | | | | | | | | | | | 14d | 4w | | unapproved part | 30d | stock |
| 5 | 110085 | 16.55 | | | | | | | | | 85.58 | | | | | 101.17 | | 16.55 | 102.35 | 95.12 |
| Area Diesel | 232437 | | | | | | | | | | stock | | | | | stock | | unapproved part | 21d | stock |
| 3 | 110100 | 2.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | 2.23 | 2.00 | 2.78 | | |
| Gillig | 232425 | - | | | | | | | | | | | | | | stock | stock | stock | | |
| 9 | 110136 | 76.00 | | 87.76 | | 87.76 | 149.25 | | | | | 100.00 | 76.00 | | | 103.12 | | 76.75 | 79.90 | 80.88 |
| Kirks | 232454 | - | | 20d | | 2w | 60d | | | | | stock | stock | | | 7w | | 4w | 30d | 14d |
| 1 | 130682 | 66.98 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | 66.98 | | | | |
| Aftermarket Parts | 232420 | - | | | | | | | | | | | | | | 5w | | | | |
| 7 | 100223 | 58.35 | | | 132.16 | | | | | | 96.62 | | | | | 109.27 | | 58.35 | 99.85 | 97.34 |
| Neopart | 232453 | - | | | stock | | | | | | stock | | | | | 6w | | unapproved part | stock | stock |
| 7 | 100226 | 1,150.14 | | | | | | 1,232.00 | | | 2,103.27 | | 1,277.00 | 1,278.00 | | 2,442.79 | | 1,150.14 | | 2,009.21 |
| Mohawk | 232430 | - | | | | | | 10d | | | stock | | stock | stock | | 9w | | 2w | | 90d |
| 6 | 100227 | 924.00 | | | | | | 996.80 | | | | | 924.00 | 1,048.00 | | 1,351.26 | | 930.00 | | 1,054.98 |
| Kirks | 232454 | | | | | | | 10d | | | | | stock | stock | | 12w | | 2w | | 90d |
| 1 | 140076 | 646.65 | | | | | | | | | | 646.65 | | | | | | | | |
| Eldorado | 232436 | | | | | | | | | | | 4w | | | | | | | | |
| 1 | 100247 | 2.78 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | 2.78 |
| Coffman | 232424 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | stock |
| 8 | 1210003 | 19.82 | 19.82 | 19.90 | 33.95 | | | 22.55 | | | | | | | | 31.17 | | 24.54 | 26.79 | 21.87 |
| Vehicle Maintenance | 232417 | | stock | 20D | stock | | | stock | | | | | | | | 9w | | 3w | 30d | stock |
| 6 | 1010001 | 8.39 | | 11.42 | | 8.39 | 11.08 | | | | | | | | | 13.66 | 8.50 | | 10.50 | |
| Suburban Truck | 232452 | - | | stock | | stock | 60d | | | | | | | | | 9w | stock | | 30d | |

Pace

RFQ# 421229

| WHITE=NO BID | TOTAL | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
|--------------------|-------------------|-------------|---------------------|------------------|-----|----------------|---------|----------|-----------------|---------------------|-------------|----------|--------|------------------|--------------------|-------------------|--------|----------|--------|----------|
| | 0 | | | | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 |
| Green=Disqualified | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| NO # of Bids | Sku | Winning bid | Vehicle Maintenance | Interstate Power | CBM | Suburban Truck | Prevost | Neopart | MW Bus - NO BID | Rome Truck - NO BID | Area Diesel | Eldorado | Kirks | Diesel Emissions | Hydraulic Electric | Aftermarket Parts | Gillig | Mohawk | Muncie | Coffman |
| 5 | 1010049 | 1,441.80 | | | | | | 1,441.80 | | | | | | 1,496.00 | | 1,904.57 | | 1,560.00 | | 1,553.58 |
| | Neopart | 232453 | - | | | | | stock | | | | | | stock | | 9w | | 3w | | 90d |
| 1 | 1010050 | 4,896.96 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | 4,896.96 | | | | |
| | Aftermarket Parts | 232420 | - | | | | | | | | | | | | | 6w | | | | |
| 2 | 1010060 | 2,293.89 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | 3,202.93 | | | | 2,293.89 |
| | Coffman | 232424 | - | | | | | | | | | | | | | 7w | | | | stock |
| 6 | 1010061 | 907.00 | | | | | | 993.60 | | | | | 907.00 | 1,128.00 | | 1,366.09 | | 935.00 | | 1,065.50 |
| | Kirks | 232454 | - | | | | | stock | | | | | stock | stock | | 9w | | 2w | | stock |
| 5 | 1210113 | 511.60 | | | | | | | | | 644.99 | | | 511.60 | | 836.43 | | | 763.05 | 653.77 |
| | Diesel Emissions | 232455 | - | | | | | | | | stock | | | stock | | 4w | | | 30d | stock |
| 1 | 1210130 | 599.35 | | | | | | | | | | 599.35 | | | | | | | | |
| | Eldorado | 232436 | - | | | | | | | | | stock | | | | | | | | |
| 6 | 1110008 | 28.53 | 29.62 | 28.53 | | 28.53 | 52.39 | | | | | | | | | 47.40 | | 56.98 | | |
| | Suburban Truck | 232452 | - | 2w | 20d | | 2w | 60d | | | | | | | | 4w | | 7w | | |
| 1 | 1210142 | 93.00 | | | | | | | | | | 93.00 | | | | | | | | |
| | Eldorado | 232436 | - | | | | | | | | 4w | | | | | | | | | |
| 2 | 1210141 | 12.01 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | 14.80 | 12.01 |
| | Coffman | 232424 | - | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | stock | stock |